
 

  

THE MODERN PENTATHLON ASSOCIATION OF GREAT BRITAIN LTD. 
Patron – HRH Prince Philip Duke of Edinburgh KG KT 
Registered Office – Wessex House, University of Bath, Claverton Down, Bath BA2 7AY England 

Tel: +44 (0)1225 386808 Fax: +44 (0)1225 386995 Email: admin@pentathlongb.org Web: www.pentathlongb.org 

A company limited by guarantee, registered in England & Wales, No.4931041, VAT Registration Number: 891 0063 37 

 

 
 
 
 
 

Members of Pentathlon GB – Travel Insurance 
Recommendations 

Pentathlon GB would like to remind members that the 
Pentathlon GB Travel Insurance covers only those 
members who are travelling abroad to compete, or train, 
as part of a team officially sanctioned by Pentathlon GB.  
This would normally be led by a member of the Pentathlon 
GB Performance Team or the Pentathlon GB Biathle 
Director. 

Pentathlon GB members who are travelling abroad to 
compete or train with their club, or alone, should ensure 
that they purchase specialist sports travel insurance.  
Members should not rely on ordinary travel insurance as a 
claim may well be turned down on the grounds that you 
did not disclose the fact that you were competing or 
training.  This applies to all the elements of Modern 
Pentathlon, not just those involving potentially dangerous 
activities: for example, insurers will turn down your claim 
for an accident which occurs during a training session or 
competition which only covers the running element of the 
sport if you do not purchase specialist sports travel 
insurance. 
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