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Re: DoubleClick Inc. and Gooale. Inc. Merger 

Dear Chairperson Majoras: 

As the chief consumer advocate for New York State, the New York State Consumer 
Protection Board ("CPB") joins with privacy advocates in voicing our concern regarding the 
privacy implications of the DoubleClick Inc. ("DoubleClick") and Gwgle, Inc. ("Google") 
merger. 

The combination of DoubleClick's Internet surfing history generated through consumers' 
pattern of clicking on specific advertisements, coupled with Google's database of 
consumers' past searches, will result in the creation of 'super-profiles," which will make up 
the world's sinale largest rewositorv of both personallv and non-uersonallv identifiable 
information. If the combined information is used in theconsumers' best interests, online 
advertising would be more useful, as consumers would be "hvper-targeted" for 
advertisements in which they have demonstrated interest. ~dvettisek Au ld  spend less 
and achieve more. However, in the worst case scenario, this repository of super-profiles 
could, for example, be made available to secondary users including marketers without 
consumers' knowledge or consent, as well as made public as evidence in litigation or 
through data breaches. 

In the best interest of consumers. we call for a halt to the merrier until the Federal Trade 
Commission ("FTCVhas fully investigated Google's planned use of the data post-merger. 
Further, we urge the FTC to require Google to make full and public disclosure of its current 
data collection practices and contemplated data collection practices post-merger. Google 
must establish a publicly disclosed, clear and consuicuous data collection policy. This data 
collection policy should provide for, among other things, strict data security; consumer 
access to personally identifiable information and ability to delete or edit inaccurate 

5 Empire State Plaza. Suite 2101, Albany, New Y O ~ K  12223 -1556 
Tel: (800) NYS1220 M (518) 474-3514 Fax: (518) 474-2474. hitp i<www.nyscomumer.got 




