
  

    
 

 
 
 
 

 
 
Mr Doug Paulley 
 
By e-mail:  
xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxxxxxxx.xxx 
 
 
Dear Mr Paulley 
 
Re: FOI Request F0010732 - Internal Review 
 
I am writing with regard to your request for information which you originally made to the 
Department for Transport on 24 September 2013. The Department replied on 25 October 
2013 and, following that reply, you clarified your request as follows: 
 

Which statutory organisation, if any, is tasked with enforcing the 
PSVAR regualtions? 
 
Which statutory organisations have taken legal action under the 
PSVAR regualtions, in particular in relation to the requirements on 
drivers to take specific actions to ensure accessibility for 
wheelchair users and other disabled people? 

 
The Department responded to the above follow-up request on 22 November 2013. The 
same day, you contacted the Department to say that it had misunderstood your request. 
You confirmed that your request related not to the Public Service Vehicle Accessibility 
Regulations 2000, but to the Public Service Vehicles (Conduct of Drivers, Inspectors, 
Conductors and Passengers) (Amendment) Regulations 2002. You asked that the 
Department respond to your actual request. 
 
The Code of Practice issued under Section 45 of the FOI Act advises that any written reply 
from the applicant expressing dissatisfaction with an authority's response to a request for 
information should be treated as a complaint. I have therefore treated your communication 
of 22 November as though it were a complaint, and have carried out an independent 
Internal Review of the Department’s handling of your request. My findings are set out 
below. I am also providing a substantive response to your request. 
 
Case background 
 
You originally wrote to the Department on 24 September 2013 to make the following 
request for information: 
 

I understand that the Public Service Vehicles (Conduct of 
Drivers, Inspectors, Conductors and Passengers) (Amendment) 
Regulations 2002 place obligations on bus drivers under criminal 
law. It is my understanding that failure to comply without good 
reason is a criminal offence. 

P Parr 
Senior FOI Officer 
Information Rights & Records Unit 
Department for Transport 
Room D/01, Ashdown House 
Sedlescombe Road North 
St Leonards on Sea 
East Sussex,  TN37 7GA 
 
e-mail: FOI-Advice-Team-DFT 
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18 December 2013 



 
 
1) Please can you tell me who enforces these regulations, and 

how? 
2) If a driver refuses to operate the access ramp for a disabled 

passenger, fails to ensure a wheelchair user is adequately 
restrained on the bus, or falls to provide the necessary 
assistance as mandated by these regulations, what right of 
redress does the passenger have? 

3) As it is an obligation under criminal law, is it a police matter? 
4) Please can you point me to the document, or section of a 

document, that states the mechanism for enforcement? 
 
The Department responded to this request on 25 October. As regards your questions 1), 
2) and 3), the Department referred to ICO guidance which states that, “a public authority 
does not have to answer questions if this would mean creating new information or giving 
an opinion or judgment that is not already recorded”. The Department confirmed that it 
held no recorded information relevant to these questions, although it did provide some 
advice outside of the FOI Act. 
 
As regards your question 4) - which the Department did respond to under the FOI Act - the 
Department confirmed that it held no recorded information relevant to “a document, or 
section of a document, that states the mechanism for enforcing the Public Service 
Vehicles (Conduct of Drivers, Inspectors, Conductors and Passengers) (Amendment) 
Regulations 2002”. It explained that no formal guidelines on the enforcement 
arrangements for this Regulation have been produced. 
 
Following receipt of the Department’s response, on 26 October you wrote to the 
Department again, as follows: 
 

Can I perhaps refine or clarify my request for information. 
The request is as follows. 
 
Which statutory organisation, if any, is tasked with 
enforcing the PSVAR regualtions? 
 
Which statutory organisations have taken legal action 
under the PSVAR regualtions, in particular in relation to 
the requirements on drivers to take specific actions to 
ensure accessibility for wheelchair users and other 
disabled people? 

 
The Department issued its response to this second (or clarified) request on 3 December. 
In doing so, the Department interpreted your references to “the PSVAR regulations” as 
being to the Public Service Vehicle Accessibility Regulations (PSVAR) 2000. 
 
Having received that response letter, you contacted the Department to state that it had 
misunderstood your request; and that you had been referring to the Public Service 
Vehicles (Conduct of Drivers, Inspectors, Conductors and Passengers) (Amendment) 
Regulations 2002. You reiterated your request: 
 

Which statutory organisation, if any, is tasked with enforcing the 
Public Service Vehicles (Conduct of Drivers, Inspectors, 
Conductors and Passengers) (Amendment) Regulations 2002? 
 



 
Which statutory organisations have taken legal action under the 
Public Service Vehicles (Conduct of Drivers, Inspectors, 
Conductors and Passengers) (Amendment) Regulations 2002, in 
particular in relation to the requirements on drivers to take 
specific actions to ensure accessibility for wheelchair users and 
other disabled people? 

 
The Department’s handling of your request of 26 October 
 
Having viewed your request of 26 October in the context of your previous correspondence 
with the Department (as set out on the WhatDoTheyKnow.com web-site here) it is 
reasonably clear to me that your request did relate to the Public Service Vehicles (Conduct 
of Drivers, Inspectors, Conductors and Passengers) (Amendment) 
Regulations 2002. I apologize for the misunderstanding, on the Department’s part, that you 
were referring to a different set of Regulations. 
 
While the Department clearly misunderstood your request, I am satisfied that the error was 
a genuine one. It has been explained to me that The Public Service Vehicle Accessibility 
Regulations (PSVAR) have been known as ‘PSVAR’ by all bus stakeholders since the year 
2000. They relate to the construction of buses, rather than the conduct of drivers. As far as 
the official who handled your requests was aware, the Conduct Regulations have never 
been referred to as ‘PSVAR’. In addition, the official handling your request had thought 
that he had already addressed your questions regarding the Public Service Vehicles 
(Conduct of Drivers, Inspectors, Conductors and Passengers) (Amendment) Regulations 
2002 in the Department’s initial response letter of 25 October; and had therefore assumed, 
incorrectly, that your follow-up request related to different Regulations. 
 
Substantive Response 
 
Having established that your information request of 26 October referred to the Public 
Service Vehicles (Conduct of Drivers, Inspectors, Conductors and Passengers) 
(Amendment) Regulations 2002, I have liaised with the relevant policy team and am able 
to provide the following substantive response. 
 
Which statutory organisation, if any, is tasked with enforcing the Public Service Vehicles 
(Conduct of Drivers, Inspectors, Conductors and Passengers) (Amendment) Regulations 
2002? 
 
No body is tasked with enforcing these Regulations, although they may be enforced by 
any relevant prosecuting authority that has an interest. In principle, that may include the 
Crown Prosecution Service which may do so on the application of the police (or in certain 
circumstances may take-over a private prosecution). Other authorities with a transport 
interest may also prosecute, such as Transport for London (in London), the Traffic 
Commissioners (the enforcement bodies for the bus and coach industry) or the Vehicle 
and Operator Standards Agency (VOSA) for non-compliance with vehicle regulations. This 
may not be an exhaustive list. However, your question asked “which statutory 
organisation, if any, is tasked with enforcing the Regulations” (my emphasis). The answer 
is ‘none’, because no enforcement body was ever designated.  
 
Which statutory organisations have taken legal action under the Public Service Vehicles 
(Conduct of Drivers, Inspectors, Conductors and Passengers) (Amendment) Regulations 
2002, in particular in relation to the requirements on drivers to take specific actions to 
ensure accessibility for wheelchair users and other disabled people? 
 

https://www.whatdotheyknow.com/request/enforcement_of_the_public_servic


 
The Department does not hold recorded information relevant to this part of your request.  
 
A check of paper and electronic files has been carried out and no relevant recorded 
information has been found. It has been explained to me, first of all, that no statutory 
organisation or person is obliged to inform the Department of any legal action it may have 
taken under the Regulations. There is no legal duty for a local authority, TfL, any other 
organisation, or a member of the public, to notify the Department if enforcement action is 
taken under this regulation.  
 
Nevertheless, I understand that if legal action had been taken against a driver/operator 
under the Regulations, it is quite likely that the Department would be aware of any such 
action. This is because of the Department’s close links to both the bus industry and 
passenger representatives. Since the Department is not aware that any legal action has 
been taken under the Regulations, although we cannot be certain, the probability is that 
there has been no such action. (It is worth noting that two recent court cases concerning 
how wheelchair users were treated on buses were brought using the Equality Act 2010, 
rather than the Conduct Regulations.) 
 
 
Once again, I apologize for the fact that the Department initially misinterpreted your 
request.  
 
If you are not content with the outcome of this Internal Review, you have the right to apply 
directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. The Information Commissioner 
can be contacted at: 
  
 Information Commissioner’s Office  
 Wycliffe House  
 Water Lane 
 Wilmslow 
 Cheshire 
 SK9 5AF 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
 
 
P Parr  
 


	Re: FOI Request F0010732 - Internal Review


<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /CMYK
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065876863900275284e8e9ad88d2891cf76845370524d53705237300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef69069752865bc9ad854c18cea76845370524d5370523786557406300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV (Za stvaranje Adobe PDF dokumenata najpogodnijih za visokokvalitetni ispis prije tiskanja koristite ove postavke.  Stvoreni PDF dokumenti mogu se otvoriti Acrobat i Adobe Reader 5.0 i kasnijim verzijama.)
    /HUN <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <FEFF9ad854c18cea306a30d730ea30d730ec30b951fa529b7528002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020658766f8306e4f5c6210306b4f7f75283057307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a30674f5c62103055308c305f0020005000440046002030d530a130a430eb306f3001004100630072006f0062006100740020304a30883073002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee5964d3067958b304f30533068304c3067304d307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a306b306f30d530a930f330c8306e57cb30818fbc307f304c5fc59808306730593002>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020ace0d488c9c80020c2dcd5d80020c778c1c4c5d00020ac00c7a50020c801d569d55c002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die zijn geoptimaliseerd voor prepress-afdrukken van hoge kwaliteit. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents best suited for high-quality prepress printing.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


