016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 10/17/03 INVOICE # 114078

		· ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	ORGANIZE AND FILE DOCS PRODUCED	. TD	0.30	34.50
09/23/03	BY LIBERTY MUTUAL	MB	. 3.00	930.00
09/24/03	REVIEW OF MULTIPLE INTECAP MEMOS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH			
	INTECAP; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS; EDIT INTECAP REPORT; FOLLOW			
	UP RE: LANDU & ANASTOS SPREAD			
	SHEET ISSUES; REVIEW OF FIXED			• .
	COST ISSUES AND INTERNAL COST OF CAPITAL ISSUES; TELEPHONE			
	CONFERENCES WITH ZINNER;			
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COURT			
	REPORTER; FOLLOW UP RE:			
		DMM	0.20	33.00
09/24/03	COMPILE DOCUMENTS AND INFORMATION	. Dravi		
1 1-0	FOR COUNSEL AND EXPERT. WORKING WITH EXPERT ON	YDS	0.60	270.00
09/24/03	OUTSTANDING ITEMS.			ED E0
09/24/03	COMPILE DOCUMENTS FROM DOC	TD.	. 0.50	57.50
09/24/03	PRODUCTION FOR COUNSEL	MB	1.50	465.00
09/25/03	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	MB .	1.50	
	WITH INTECAP & OFFICE CONFERENCE	•		
	WITH YDS; REVIEW OF MEMO FROM INTECAP; REVIEW OF FUND REPORTS;			
	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ZINNER;	•		
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ZINNER.	*	0.70	135.00
09/25/03		YDS	0.30	135.00
05/25/00	LETTER TO S.ZIMER.	, MTD	- 1.50	465.00
09/26/03	FOLLOW UP WITH COURT REPORTER;	MB		
,	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS;		*	
	CONFERENCE CALL AND REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM INTECAP;			
	FOLLOW UP RE:			
	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO INTECAP.	•	-	155.00
09/29/03	The state of the s	MB	0.50	133.00
05/25/0-	REPORTER.		. 0,30	34.50
09/29/03	3 COMPILE EMAIL STIPULATION TO BE	TD		
	ADDED INTO DURANTE DEPOSITION			
1- 2 1-	TRANSCRIPT 3 INTECAP FOLLOW UP AND FOLLOW UP	MB	0.90	279.00
09/30/0	RE:			

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 10/17/03 INVOICE # 114078

יים די	ROFESSIONAL	SERVICES	S RENDERED	AS OF	SEPTEMBER	30,	2003	
OK P	KOL EDD TOTAL				•			VALUE
I	OISBURSEMENT	rs:						
		nc.		٠				VALUE
3	DISBURSEMEN'	19:						65.67
							•	
	ALS			,				213.64
TR	AVEL							189.47
TE	LEPHONE/FAC	SIMILE						559.40
PH	OTOCOPYING				• .			25.86
MA								568.94
OV	ERTIME							62.50
സ	TIRT SERVICE	S						79.95
SE	RVICE OF PR	OCESS FE	ŒS				•	121.66
SE	EARCH FEES							57.75
Cit	OPAGE COSTS		crem deyb	CU				32.64
CC	MPUTERIZED	COURT DO	OCKET SEAK	LE.				
		•					•	

TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD....\$ 1,977.48

***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

750 Lexington Avenue New York, N.Y. 10022

(212) 735-8600

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 11/17/03 INVOICE # 114878

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TOT DECERS!	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF OCTOBER	2 31, 2003		
FOR PROFIDE		ATTORNEY.	HOURS	VALUE
	TO CHOIL DID NITE	TD	.0.50	57.50
10/01/03	DRAFT NOTICE TO SIGN - DURANTE	TD	1.00	115.00
10/02/03	DRAFT LETTER TO WEISSMAN - DOC REQUEST AND NOTICE TO SIGN AND			
	PRTTTRN .	T T3	0.20	22.00
10/03/03	REVIEWED CASE PENDING IN NEW YORK	LB		
•	SUPREME.	LB	0.20	22.00
. 10/03/03	DOCKETING AND CALENDAR DATES.	MB	0.30	93.00
10/03/03	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH			
	INTECAP. TELEPHONE FOLLOW UP WITH INTECAP.	MB	0.30	93.00
10/09/03	RECEIPT OF EMAIL FROM INTECAP	MB	0.90	279.00
10/10/03	WITH DRAFT AND SPECTRUM			
	DOCUMENTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	•		•
	WITH INTECAP; OFFICE CONFERENCE		•	
•	WITH YDS.			
10/13/03	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM	MB	0.60	186.00
T0\T3\03	INTECAP; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES		•	•
•	WITH INTECAP.			217.00
10/14/03	REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT	MB	0.70	217.00
10/14/02	REPORT.		7 70	341.00
10/15/03	REVIEW OF REPORT AND YDS EDITS;	MB	1,10	247.00
10/20/	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH INTECAP.		0.80	248.00
10/16/03	REVIEW OF REPORT AND COMMENTS.	MB	0.10	11:00
10/22/03	DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT.	LB MB	0.30	- 93.00
10/24/03	FOLLOW UP RE:	· MB	3.10	961.00
10/27/03	PREPARED FOR CONFERENCE;	QIV.	J	
•	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH ZIMMER			-
	RE: LIEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	• • •		
	WITH LIZ GANNON, M. MUCCI; REVIEW			
	OF REPORT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	•		
	WITH P. ANASTAS AND V. STELLIO;			
	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS. 3 APPEARED FOR AND TRAVELLED TO	MB	4.90	1,519.00
10/28/0	COURT CONFERENCE IN WESTCHESTER,			
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH			
	INTECAP; REVIEW OF SUPPLEMENT TO		•	
les.	REPORTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES			
	REPORTS, TEHRITICAL			•

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 11/17/03 INVOICE # 114878

1,128.12

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF OCTO	ATTORNEY	HOURS	· VALUE
WITH P. ANASTOS, L. GANNON S.			•
ZINNER, D. WEISSMAN, V. STELLIO,			
OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH DM, YDS; FOLLOW UP RE:			
0/29/03 REVIEW OF ENTIRE AMENDED REPORT;	MB	2.60	806.00
OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH DM;			
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S.			
ZINNER; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ZINNER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WIT	Н .		
STELLIO: DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO			
M MELSON AND STELLIO; TELEPHONE	•		
CONFERENCE WITH P. ANASTOS; REVIEW OF ANASTOS' DOCUMENTATION	•	•	
OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS RE:	,	,	
		1.20	138.00
10/29/03 REVIEW DOC PRODUCTION FOR	TD .	1.20	
0/30/03 CALENDAR DATES.	LB	0.10	11.00
LO/30/03 CALENDAR DATES. LO/30/03 REVIEWED FINAL INTECAP REPORT;	MB	1.80	558.00
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH N.			
NELSON & V. STELLIO; OFFICE			
CONFERENCE WITH YDS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ZINNER AND			
WEISSMAN; FOLLOW UP RE:		•	
SATTSFACTION OF LIEN AND	T D		
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH ZINN RE: SAME.	File		
KE: SAME.	• •		
;			
TOTAL FEES SERVICES		\$	5,770.50
	•		•
			VALUE
DISBURSEMENTS:		•	195.20
TRAVEL			306.30
TELEPHONE/FACSIMILE			4.20
PHOTOCOPYING			21.41
MAIL MESSENGER	•	٠	52.50 516.35
OVERTIME			32.16
COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH		•	

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS.....\$

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 11/17/03 INVOICE # 114878

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF OCTOBER 31, 2003

VALUE

TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD....\$

6,898.62

***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

750 Lexington Avenue New York, N.Y. 10022 (212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 12/12/03 INVOICE # 115691

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13-3205994

OR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF NOVE	MBER 30, 2003		•
,	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
11/04/03 FOLLOW UP RE:	МВ	0.50	155.00
11/05/03 FOLLOW UP AND RESEARCH RE:	MB .	0.60	186.00
OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH IDS.	T T	0.10	11.00
11/05/03 CONFIRMED CONFERENCE DATE.	LB	0.20	22.00
11/07/03 REVIEWED CASE IN SUP-WEST;	LB	0.20	22.00
SEARCHED FOR LIENS.		1 00	310.00
11/11/03 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES RE:	MB	1.00	310.00
RESEARCH RE: OFFICE	•	•	•
CONFERENCE WITH YDS	•		217 00
11/12/03 LETTER AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	; MB	0.70	217.00
REVIEW OF LIENS; TELEPHONE			
CONFERENCE RE:	•		02.00
11/17/03 FOLLOW UP WITH ZINNER RE: LIENS.	MB	0.30	93.00
TT/17/03 FORDOW 02 WALL			
	•		
TOTAL FEES SERVICES		.\$	994.00
		•	•
CINTENTIO -			. VALUE .
DISBURSEMENTS:		<i>:</i>	
-		•	73.12
TRAVEL			51.21
TELEPHONE/FACSIMILE			5.80
- PHOTOCOPYING		•	7.45
COURT SERVICES	•	•	13.15
COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH			
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	·	\$	150.73
•		•	
TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR	THIS PERIOD	, \$	1,144.73

THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

750 Lexington Avenue

New York, N.Y. 10022

(212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION .
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 01/12/04 INVOICE # 116300

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

NAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF DECEMB	ER 31, 2003		
	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
ULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES ITH COURT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE	. MB	1.50	472.50
ONFERENCE WITH YDS; PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE. PPEARED FOR CONFERENCE IN CESTCHESTER; RESEARCHED JUDGE	MB	3.90	1,228.50
INNER RE: LIENS. ELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ZINNER E: LIENS; OFFICE CONFERENCES	MB	0.40	126.00
VITH YDS. OOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT;	LB	0.20	22.00
MITT TTPLE CALLS RE	MB	1.10	346.50
CONFERENCE WITH YDS. CONFIRMED CONFERENCE DATE. OBTAINED CHECK FOR NOTE OF ISSUE; REVIEWED COURT FILE FOR	LB LB	0.10 0.30	11.00 33.00
ADJOURNED DATE TO FILE NOTE OF ISSUE. DRAFTED NOTE OF ISSUE AND	МВ	3.20	1,008.00
CERTIFICATE OF READINESS AND AFFIDAVIT OF GOOD FAITH; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COURT AND ZINNER; OFFICE CONFERENCE			
OF FILE RE: ; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH TD. COMPILE ORDERS FOR NOTE OF ISSUE REVIEW FILES FOR EXPERT DISCOVERY	TD	2.90	333.50
	ULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES ITH COURT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE ITH ALL ATTORNEYS, OFFICE ONFERENCE WITH YDS; PREPARE FOR ONFERENCE. PPEARED FOR CONFERENCE IN ESTCHESTER; RESEARCHED JUDGE UDOLPH'S RULES; FOLLOW UP WITH INNER RE: LIENS. TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ZINNER EL: LIENS; OFFICE CONFERENCES OCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT; CALENDAR DATES ANALYSIS RE: CONFERENCE WITH YDS. CONFERENCE WITH YDS. CONFERENCE WITH YDS. CONFERENCE WITH YDS. CONFIRMED CONFERENCE DATE. DETAINED CHECK FOR NOTE OF ISSUE; REVIEWED COURT FILE FOR ADJOURNED DATE TO FILE NOTE OF ISSUE. DRAFTED NOTE OF ISSUE AND CERTIFICATE OF READINESS AND AFFIDAVIT OF GOOD FAITH; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COURT AND ZINNER; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS; FOLLOW UP RE: OF FILE RE: FOR EXPERT DISCOVERY REOUESTS CREATE DISCOVERY BINDERS	ULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES ITH COURT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE ITH ALL ATTORNEYS, OFFICE ONFERENCE WITH YDS; PREPARE FOR ONFERENCE. PPEARED FOR CONFERENCE IN ESTCHESTER; RESEARCHED JUDGE UDOLPH'S RULES; FOLLOW UP WITH ITNNER RE: LIENS. ELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ZINNER ELE: LIENS; OFFICE CONFERENCES ITH YDS. OCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT; CALENDAR DATES MALLYSIS RE: CONFERENCE WITH YDS. CONFIRMED CONFERENCE DATE. OBTAINED CHECK FOR NOTE OF ISSUE; REVIEWED COURT FILE FOR ADJOURNED DATE TO FILE NOTE OF ISSUE. DRAFTED NOTE OF ISSUE AND CERTIFICATE OF READINESS AND AFFIDAVIT OF GOOD FAITH; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COURT AND ZINNER; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS; FOLLOW UP RE: WITH YDS; FOLLOW UP RE: COMPERENCE WITH TD. COMPILE ORDERS FOR NOTE OF ISSUE CONFERENCE WITH TD. COMPILE ORDERS FOR NOTE OF ISSUE TD REVIEW FILES FOR EXPERT DISCOVERY REQUESTS CREATE DISCOVERY BINDERS	ULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES ITH COURT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE ITH ALL ATTORNEYS, OFFICE ONFERENCE WITH YDS; PREPARE FOR ONFERENCE. PPEARED FOR CONFERENCE IN ESTCHESTER; RESEARCHED JUDGE UDOLPH'S RULES; FOLLOW UP WITH INNER RE: LIENS. ELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ZINNER ELE: LIENS; OFFICE CONFERENCES ITH YDS. OCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT; ALLENDAR DATES AND OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS. CONFIRMED COMPERENCE DATE. CONFIRMED COMPERENCE DATE. DETAINED CHECK FOR NOTE OF ISSUE; REVIEWED COURT FILE FOR ADJOURNED DATE TO FILE NOTE OF ISSUE. DRAFTED NOTE OF ISSUE AND AFFIDAVIT OF GOOD FAITH; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COURT AND ZINNER; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS; FOLLOW UP RE; AND REVIEW OF FILE RE: AND REVIEW OF FILE RE: AND REVIEW OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS; FOLLOW UP RE; AND REVIEW FILE FOR EXPERT DISCOVERY REQUESTS CREATE DISCOVERY REQUESTS CREATE DISCOVERY BINDERS

	016036 0001	THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V.	COLUMBUS		01/12/04 CE # 116300
 [O]	, R PROFESS	SIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF DECE	MBER 31, 2003		
		·	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
-	12/30/03	BINDER OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS AND STRATEGY SESSION; FOLLOW UP RE:	MB	0.50	157.50
-	12/30/03	COMPILE DISCOVERY LETTERS FOR BINDERS CREATE COMPLAINT AND ANSWERS BINDER	TD	3.40	391.00
		TOTAL FEES SERVICES		\$	4,129.50
	DISBUI	rsements:			VALUE
	PHOTOCOMAIL MESSENGMESERVICE COURT FINANTABASI	ER OF PROCESS FEES ILING & MISC FEES E SEARCH		e	51.47 154.00 77.03 <u>17.50</u> 184.00 95.00 808.17 230.12
	COMPUTE	RIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH			
	•	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	, , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	.\$	1,617.29
	· ·	TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR T	HIS PERIOD	.\$.	5,746.79
		- ***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURR	ENT SERVICES O	NLY ****	

750 Lexington Avenue New York, N.Y. 10022 (212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 02/11/04 INVOICE # 116963

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

OR PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JANUAR	RY 31, 2004		
		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE.
01/12/04	TRIAL ISSUE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE	YDS	. 1.00	475.00
	WITH B DIAMOND; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING			
01/12/04	SAME. REVIEW OF FILE FOR	МВ .	3.10	1,162.50
•	ANALYSIS OF OUTSTANDING DEMANDS; DRAFTED SEPARATE CORRESPONDENCE TO ZINNER			
•	. & WEISSMAN.	•		
01/13/04	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DIAMOND REGARDING JURY TRIAL	YDS	0.10	47.50
01/16/04	ISSUE: MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH ZINNER; TELEPHONE	MB · ·	1.50	. 562 . 50
•	CONFERENCES WITH VINNY, FINALIZED NOTE OF ISSUE, CERTIFICATE OF READINESS AND MJB AFFIRMATION;			
01/16/04	OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS. LETTER FROM R.CALICA; CALL TO R.CALICA; REVIEW NOTE OF ISSUE AND AFFIDAVIT OF READINESS;	YDS	0.20	95.00
01/20/04	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D.TRUMP	YDS	0.50	232.50
OT/20/04	PER D.TRUMP INSTRUCTIONS RE			
01/20/04	DEPOSITIONS. TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH	MB	2.20	825,00
	ZINNER, STELLIO AND SCHEDULED DEPOSITIONS; REVIEW OF DISCOVERY AND PRIVILEGE LOG FROM LIBERTY			
	MUTUAL; FINALIZED NOTE OF ISSUE AND AFFIRMATION AND ARRANGED FOR			
01/20/04	FILING OF SAME. 4 REVIEWED NOTE OF ISSUE; ARRANGED	LB	0.20	23.00

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

FOR PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JANUAR	Y 31, 2004		
		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
01/21/04 .	FOR FILING IN WESTCHESTER SUPREME. PREPARED CALENDAR OF ALL DATES; CALENDAR DATES FROM NOTE OF ISSUE; DOCKETING AND CASE	LB ·	0.30	. 34.50
01/21/04	OF TASK LIST; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS AND DMM; TELEPHONE	МВ	3.90	1,462.50
	CONFERENCE WITH STELLIO; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH ZINNER; ANALYSIS OF RESEARCH			· . ,
01/21/04	ISSUES. TRIAL TASK LIST; PREP FOR UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS AND TRIAL.	DMM .	1.80	. 306.00
01/21/04	•	YDS	. 2.00	950.00
	REVIEW AND REVISE TRIAL TASK LIST.		•	••
01/22/04	SCHEDULING DEPOSITION OF V.STELLIO	YDS .	0.20	95.00
01/22/04	•	DMM	0.90	153.00
01/22/04	•	LB	0.10	11.50
01/23/04	COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR COUNSEL FOR	DMM	2.30	391.00
01/23/01	UPCOMING DEPOSITION; TRIAL PREPARATION.			
	UPDATE FROM M.BACHMAN RE	: YDS	0.20	95.00
07 /22 /04	TRIAL PREPARATION; REVIEW OF	MB ·	3.50	1,312.50
01/25/04	DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS FOR			
	PETRILLO DEPOSITION; DRAFTED	•		
	PETRILLO DEPOSITION OUTLINE;			
•	REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS NEEDED WITH	••	•	
	DMM; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH			
	S. ZINNER; FOLLOW UP RE:		•	
	FINALIZED MARKED PLEADING FOR OFFERING OF PROFITS			
	PLEADING FOR OFFERING OF PROFITS	*	•	
	AND REVIEW OF SAME.		•	
01/23/04	CALENDAR DEPOSITION DATES,	$_{ m LB}$	0.20 .	23.00
01/26/04	REVIEW OF FILE FOR FURTHER	MB	2.30	862.50
•	DOCUMENTS FOR TRIAL PREP; FOLLOW		•	
	UP RE: ROCKWORKS BLASTING; OFFICE		•	
	CONFERENCE WITH YDS AND REVIEW		•	
	AND ANALYSIS OF MULTIPLE PAYMENT			
•	ACQUISITIONS FOR TRIAL.	Profit Street	1	150 F0
01/26/04	COMPILE DOCUMENTS FROM THE PRODUCTION FOR COUNSEL	TD	1.50	172.50
01-/27/04		МВ	3.20	1,200.00

01603<u>6</u> 0001

DISBURSEMENTS:

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 02/11/04 . INVOICE # 116963

VALUE

		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
•	AND REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SAME;	•		
	AND REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF LOST PROFITS CLAIMS			
	AND SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS; FOLLOW			
	UP RE:			
	REVIEW OF ANSWER OF			•
•	COLUMBUS AND COMPLAINT RE:		•	
	TOP IIDCONTNC	DMM	1.20	204.00
L/27/04	COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR UPCOMING			
	DEPOSITION. TRIAL PREPARATION; REVIEW OF	MB	. 3.50	1,312.50
1/28/04	PLEADINGS AND DRAFTED SUPPORTING		,	, .
	WITNESSES AND SUPPORTING			
	DOCUMENTS FOR EACH ALLEGATION IN			
	COMPLAINT; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH			
	DMM AND YDS; FOLLOW UP RE:			
		•		
- 100/04	ATTEND TO TRIAL PREPARATION	YDS	0.30	142.50
1/28/04		í		
		77.3 A.S. A.	0.70	119.00
1/29/04	COMPILE DOCUMENTS PER UPCOMING	DMM	0.70	
	DEPOSITION.	${ m TD}$	0.50	57.50
1/29/04	COMPILE DOCUMENTS FROM PRODUCTION			•
-	FOR COUNSEL REVIEW TRIAL PREPARATION MEMO FOR	YDS	0.30	142.50
1/29/04	M.BACHMAN.	•	-	
1/29/04	FINALIZED OFFERS OF PROOF	МB	. 3.80	1,425.00
11/22/04	DOCUMENTATION: FURTHER REVIEW OF			
	DOCUMENTS FOR TRIAL PREPARATION;			•
•	DRAFTED MEMO; OFFICE CONFERENCE			•
	WITH D. MULVEY.	DMM	0.70	119.00
01/30/04	COMPILE DOCUMENTS AND INFORMATION FOR UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS.			
120104		MB .	3.00	1,125.0
01/30/04	PETRILLO DOCS, TC WITH STELLIO,			
	OC YDS, OC DMM, FURTHER REVIEW OF			•
	DOCUMENTS FOR NOTICE TO ADMIT		0.30	142.5
01/30/04	PEVIEW TRIAL PREPARATION	YDS		
•	MATERIALS; MEETING WITH M. BACHMAN			
	RE THE STATE OF TH			

016036 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 0001 TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS	DATE: 02/11/04 INVOICE # 116963
OR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JANUARY 31, 2004 DISBURSEMENTS:	VALUE
TELEPHONE/FACSIMILE PHOTOCOPYING MAIL OVERTIME COURT FILING & MISC FEES COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH	3.09 262.20 0.97 88.41 (65.00) 52.60
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS\$ TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$. 342.27 15,623.77

THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY

750 Lexington Avenue New York, N.Y. 10022 (212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 03/11/04 INVOICE # 118057

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF FEBRUA		HOURS	VALUE
	ATTORNEY		•
02/02/04 PREPARE FOR UPCOMING DEPOSITION	DMM	0.80	136.00
AND TRIAL.	DMM	0.70	119.00
FOR UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS; TRIAL PREPARATION. 02/08/04 UPDATE ON COLUMBUS' POSITION RE	YDS	1.30	617.50 ·
FOLLOW-UP RECALLS WITH			
S.ZIMMER; PREPARATION FOR		·	•
V.STELLIO AND SCHEDULING.	TD	1.00.	115.00
02/09/04 COMPILE EXPERTS EXHIBITS	DMM	1.70	289.00
02/09/04 COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR REVIEW			
LIST OF DOCUMENTS USED BY EXPERTS; TRIAL PREPARATION.			
	LB	. 0.10	11.50
02/09/04 CONFIRMED DATE FOR SUMMARI JUDGMENT MOTION.			475.00
02/09/04 REVIEW ISSUES RE	YDS	1.00	4/5.00
CREATE			
LISTING OF TRIAL TASK LIST.		4.30	1,354.50
03/09/04 FURTHER TRIAL PREPARATION; REVIEW	MB	4.50	1,001.01
OF ALL CONTRACTS			•
			•
RESEARCH CASELAW RE:		•	
TELEPHONE		•.	
CONFERENCES WITH STAN ZINNER;			•
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH DARRYI	. ·		
WEISSMAN; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH		•	
YDS; FURTHER PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITIONS OF STELLIO AND			•
PETRILLO; REVIEW OF JUDGE			
RUDOLPH'S RULES RE:			
KODOLEH, P. KOLIOS CIE.			
CONFERENCES WITH DAWN MULVEY;		•	
DRAFTED MEMO RE:			

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

PROFESS.	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF FEBRUA			
	•	ATTORNEY	HOURS	· VALUE
2/10/04	COMPILE DOCUMENTS AND INFORMATION FOR UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS; TRIAL	DMM .	. 0.70	11,9.00
2/10/04	PREP. TRIAL PREPARATION; COMPREHENSIVE	МĖ	6.10	1,921.50
)2/10/04	PREPARATION FOR PETRILLO DEPOSITION AND REVIEW OF ALL TRANSCRIPTS RE: CONFERENCE WITH YDS & DMM; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COUNSEL FOR CCC AND LM; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH STELLIO; FOLLOW	- 		·
	RESEARCHED CASE LAW AND TREATISES DRAFTED MEMO RE: REVIEW OF INTECAP AND TRC REPORTS RE: TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND DRAFT			
•	CORRESPONDENCE TO INTECAP; ADDENDUM TO PETRILLO EXHIBITS; REVIEW OF			
1 1-4		YDS	0.20	95.00
02/10/04		MB	9.00	2,835.00
02/11/04	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. MUCCI; REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM INTECAP; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH STELLIO, ZINNER & WEISSMAN; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS AND		·	
	DM; REVIEW OF ALL DAILY REPORTS; ADDENDUM TO OUTLINE; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ZINNER, DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO WEISSMAN; REVIEW OF DISCREPANCIES IN ALL		-	
	TRANSCRIPTS INCLUDING GALLAGHER; REVIEW OF PHOTOS FOR DEPOSITION; REVIEW OF PROJECT SCHEDULING AND RELATED ISSUES FOR PETRILLO			· .
	DEPOSITION; ADDITIONAL TRIAL PREPARATION INCLUDING REVIEW OF EVIDENTIARY DOCUMENTS TO BE USEL	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
-	ADDRESED AND OUTLINED TIMLINE ISSUES FOR UPCOMING DEPOSITIONS			•
02/11/	AND TRIAL O4 COMPILE DOCUMENTS TO BE-USED AS EXHIBITS FOR UPCOMING	MMC .	2.80	476.00

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES	RENDERED AS OF FEBRUAL	RY 29, 2004		
FOR PROFESSIONAL -	· .	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
DEPOSITIONS;	TRIAL PREP. REP -CREATE REDWELDS	TD	2.50	287.50
WITH EXHIBITS 02/11/04 E-MAIL FROM M	S M.MUCCIO OF INTECAP	YDS	0.60	285.00
RE SCHEDULING V	STELLIO DEPOSITION. DEPOSITION AND DEPOSE	YDS	7.50	3,562.50
D.PETRILLO;	DISCUSSION RE	MB	6.50	. 2,047.50
PETRILLO; FO	DEPOSITION OF LLOW UP WITH ZINNER S; REVIEW OF REATH OF OFFERING PLAN			
FROM SPECTRU DEPOSITION I	M: ANALYSIS OF	· ·		. :
RE:	ANALYZED AND OUTLINED DISCOVERY BASED ON			
MOTUT DOGGC:	ADDRESSED CCCC 3101 OBLIGATIONS, FOLLOW UP			204.00
02/12/04 COMPILE DOC	UMENTS TO BE USED AS EXHIBITS FOR	DMM	1.20	204.00
GRAPHIX RE	CKAGE FOR V. STELLIO	• ЙВ	3.BO	1,197.00
WITH ALL RE FOR DEPOSIT	CLEVANT DOCUMENTATION FION AND ANALYSIS OF FED CORRESPONDENCE TO	· · · · ·	:	
V. STELLIO OFFERING PI - REVIEW AND	; FURTHER REVIEW OF LAN TO BUTTRESS CLAIM; ANALYSIS OF TOWNHOUSE			·
SCHEDULING AND ANALYS	AND PRICING, REVIEW TS OF ISSUE RE:			
DRAFTED ME	MO TO V. STELLIO; MO TO DJT; OFFICE WITH YDS AND DMM;	· ·		
ADDENDUM T UPON DEPOS IN FILE FO	TO NOTICE TO ADMIT BASE SITION; REVIEWED PHOTOS OR V STELLIO AND	U		
FOLLOWED	UP RE: FOLLOW UP RE:	-	· -	

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

OR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF		HOURS .	VALUE
	ATTORNEY .	HOURD	
	•		
TP TOWN IN THE	YDS	3.10	1,472.50
02/13/04 PREPARE CLIENT MEMO'S AND TR	FROM .		•
PETRILLO'S DEPOSITION; PREPA MATERIALS FOR V.STELLIO AND	MEMO	•	
RE PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION	ON ON		
INFRASTRUCTURE CONTRACT.			11.50
	. LB	0.10	110.00
	TL	0.20	4.10.00
		2 00	1,228.50
02/17/04 DRAFTED MEMOS TO STELLIO ANI	D DJT; MB	3.90	1,220.00
OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS,	ן זיוויזען		
T.D. DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE	10		
ZINNER; UPDATED TASKS LIST;		•	
TINATITED MEMO RE:			•
- ロー・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・・	RE:		
REVIEW OF PE	TRILLO		
TRANSCRIPT; FINALIZED NOTIC	ES TO		•
ADMIT AND LOCATED DOCUMENTS	FOR .	•	
SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS C	ייים מידים מידים. אלי		
DOCUMENTS FROM SPECTRUM; DE	TOLION		•
CORRESPONDENCE TO INTECAP;	TOLLON	•	
. IID BE. CONTINUED REVIEW			
OFFERING PLAN. O2/17/04 CONFIRMED NOTE OF ISSUE FI	LING LB	.0.10	11.50
<i>52,-1</i>	•	i ·	475.00
DATE. 02/17/04 REVIEW DEMAND LETTER FOR	- YDS	1.00	4/5.00
02/17/04 REVIEW DEMAND LETTER FOR DOCUMENTS FROM PETRILLO'S			
DEPOSITION AND SUPPLEMENT	BASED		
UPON TRANSCRIPT OF DEPOSIT	TION;		
TEDATE MEMO TO CLIENT.			1,615.00
THITTAL CONFERENCE CALL W.	ITH - YDS	3.40	1,011
COINCEL RE PRETRIAL PROCES	JURES;	. ,	-
ADDITIONAL PRETRIAL PREPAI	RATION .		•
BASED UPON PETRILLO DEPOS	ITION;	•	
MEMO TO CLIENT RE			
	· LB	0.10	11.50
02/18/04 REVEIWED CALENDAR.	•	3.40	1,071.00
CONTINUED TRIAL AND DEPOS	TITON		
DREPARATION, TCS ZINNER,	MOTITATE	•	
OCS DMM AND YDS, DRAFILED	AND ·		· ·
REVISED MEMOS TO CLIENT	C		
STELLIO, FOLLOW UP RE:		•	
	EVITEM OF		
FOLLOW UP & RU	DATDM OL		
	EW OF ALL		
「大田 人工」 「大田 人工 「大田 」 「 」 「 」 「 」 「 」 「 」 「 」 「 」 「 」 「 」 	1171 01 1111		*****

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

	ARY 29, 2004 ATTORNEY	HOURS.	VALUE
	HITOKNET		
DOCUMENTATION RE:			760.00
2/19/04 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH	YDS	1.60 '	760.00
2/19/04 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V.STELLIO; CALL TO COURT	•		•
DECCUEDITING OF TRIAL AND	•		
CONFERENCES: ADDRESS V.SIEDDIO			
TOGETTO TO ITATE IN INTECAP .			
AFFIDAVITS; LETTER FROM S.ZINNER			
DE D TRIMP DEPOSITION.	TD ·	0.30	34.50
0.2/19/04 REVIEW DOC PRODUCTION AND FILES			
FOR LETTERS REQUESTED BY PREP.	MB	3.90	1,228.50
DRAFTED NEW MEMOS, REVIEW OF			•
DRAFTED NEW MEMOS, ICT TRANSCRIPTS GALHAGER AND PICKETT TRANSCRIPTS	•		•
TI DDEDADATION FOR PETRILLO AND			
CTRIJIO DEPOSITIONS, LOCATED AND	•		
ACCEMBLED ALL DOCUMENTS FOR			•
NOUTCER TO ADMIT. FIANLIZED	•		
MOTICES TO ADMIT AND ARRANGED FOR			
SERVICE OF SAME, FOLLOW UP RE:			
OCS DMM AND YDS,			
TOTAL TO THE TITE FOLLOW UP			
TCS INTECAP ,			•
TO THE OT AND VINER		. 1.30	221.00
MULIPLE TCS WITH CI. 1200 O2/19/04 COMPTLE DOCUMENTS FOR COUNSEL RE	DMM	1.30	•
	- MB	2.90	. 913.50
02/20/04 DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO INTECAP;			₩
FOLLOW UP RE: DRAFT CORRESPONDENC	E .	•	•
TO ZINNER RE: DISCOVERY; FOLLOW		,	
		•	
· UP RE:	:		
			-
FOLLOW UP &	-		
LOCATED ALL CORRESPONDENCE RE:	all bridge of the		•
	DMM	0.80	136.0
02/20/04 COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR EXPERT		-	
REVIEW.	YDS	3.00	1,425.0
02/20/04 REVIEW MARKED TRANSCRIPT FROM PETRILLO FOR INTECAP REVIEW AND		•	
DEALLIPO ROK TRIPCHE KRATER TOTAL			
POTTER MEMO TO INTECAP RE			
REVISE MEMO TO INTECAP RE			
REVISE MEMO TO INTECAP RE		2 50	1.235.0
REVISE MEMO TO INTECAP RE	. ĀD2	2.60	1,235.0
REVISE MEMO TO INTECAP RE O2/21/04 ADDRESSING ISSUES FROM LIBERTY MUTUAL DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT;	ĀDS	2.60	1,235.
REVISE MEMO TO INTECAP RE		2.60	1,235.

MORRISON COHEN SINGER & WELL COLUMBUS			DATE: 03/11/04 INVOICE # 118057		
016036	TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COI	TOWBOR			
		. 2004			
- n PPOFESSI	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF FEBRUARY	1 29, 2001			
JR FROFILL		ATTORNEY	HOURS	. VALUE	
	•	•		200 00	
02/23/04	TRIAL PREP STATUS MEETING; COMPILE DOCUMENTS AND INFORMATION	DMM	1.70	289.00	
/ /04	FOR COUNSEL. COMPILE ALL DEPOSITION EXHIBITS	TD	3.00	345.00	
02/23/04 02/23/04	CREATE MASTER INDEX CREATE BINDER	YDS	4.30	2,042.50	
	AND SCHEDULING; MEMO TO CLIENT RE SAME; WEEKLY TRIAL PREPARATION MEETING; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON NOTICES TO ADMIT; ADDRESSING ISSUES OF LIBERTY MUTUAL CONFIDENTIALITY UNDERWRITING;	4.			
	ADDRESS INFORMATION FROM EXPERT FOR AFFIDAVITS; ADDRESS FAZIO	٠		•	
	ISSUES WITH M.BACHMAN. DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT;	LВ	0.10	11.50	
02/23/04	CALENDAR DATES	MB	4.60	1,449.00	
02/23/04	REVIEW OF DURANTE DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT; CULLED EXHIBITS; REVIEW OF LOGS; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS AND DMM; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO WEISSMAN AND	•			
	ANALYSIS OF PRIVILEGE CLAIMS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO INTECAP; THE PREPARATION FOR STELLIO	· ·			
	DEPOSITION; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COURT AND REVIEW OF JUDGE'S RULES RE:				
	AND TO DETERMINE WHO WILL ADDRESS SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS AND SCHEDULING OF TRIAL ISSSUES; FOLLOW UP RE: REVIEW OF FURTHER DOCUMENTS ON	·	- -	• .• •	
02/24/0	4 FINALIZED AND SERVED NOTICE TO ADMIT AND ASSEMBLED ALL DOCUMENTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	МВ	4.10	1,291.50	
•	WITH WEISSMAN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH ZINNER; MEETING WITH VS.; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS; ANALYSIS OF FURTHER REVIEW OF OFFERING PLAN; GATHERED				
	STELLIO DOCUMENTS; REVIEWED TRC' REPORT OF PARCEL 1 EARTHWORK;	-			

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

NELSON AND DIAMOND; DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE TO ZINNER RE: OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY; REVIEW OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES FROM ZINNER

OUTSTANDING ISSUES; FOLLOW UP WITH WEISSMAN RE: PRODUCTION OF UNDERWRITING FILE; REVIEW OF UNDERWRITING ISSUES RELATIVE TO

CLAIMS BY LIBERTY MUTUAL; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH ATTORNEY FOR LOCAL 15 RE:

AND LIBERTY MUTUAL RE:

	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF FEBRUA	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	TOGG PELEVANT		•	
	REVIEW OF REATH LOGS RELEVANT POINTS. AND COMPARISON TO DATA			•
	POINTS USED BY TRC FOR TRC			•
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND	•	•	
	TOWNS TO THE STIPPLEMENT		3.70	1,757.50
- 1-1/04	PREPARATION WITH V.STELLIO FOR	YDS	3.70	27.2.
02/24/04	DEPOSITION; FINALIZATION OF			
•	TOUT OF TO ADMIT.	TD	1.00	115.00
02/24/04	CREATE DURANTE DEPO BINDER WITH	ID .		•
0272770-	~	DMM	. 0.70	119.00
02/24/04	COMPILE DOCUMENTS AND INFORMATION	Dimi		
· /	FOR V. STELLIO DEPOSITION PREP.	мв	3.80	1,197.00
02/25/04	TRIAL AND PRE-TRIAL CONFERENCE		•	
•	PREP; REVIEW OF ALL REATH FIELD BOOKS, STRATEGY MEETING WITH YDS;			,
	BOOKS, STRATEGI MELETING WITH GROGG;			
•	OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH DMM;			
	REVIEW OF ADDITIONAL PAYMENT		•	•
	THE TOP WORK PERFURMED!			
	TITAL TICTO, DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO		•	
	TORRESPONDENCE TO		•	
	ZINNER: TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITTE		•	
	WEISSMAN; FOLLOW UP RE:		•	
	FOLLOW UP RE:	•		
•	DEFEND	YDS	4.60	2,185.00
02/25/04	MEETING WITH V.STELLIO; DEFEND			
•	DEPOSITION OF V.SIEDDIO, 1001	*	-	
•	DEPOSITION MEETING WITH	_		
	V.STELLIO; ADDRESS DEPOSITION ISSUES FOR TRIAL PREPARATION.			4 4 D P O O
	DOOKE HOR	MB	3.80	1,197.00
02/26/0	THE THE PETON AND SCOPE OF WORK	•		
	TOUTHOU DEAFTED CORRESPONDENCE IC	· ·		• •
•	TOO OFFICE CONFERENCES WILL IDD.			
	OBELCE CONFERENCES WITH DIM!		-	• • •
	DRAFT MEMORANDUM TO KEPCHER, GIR	•		•
	DEARTED DEARTED			_ -

. 016036 0001

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION

TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF FEBRUA	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE TO REATH; OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS AND DMM RE:	· vnd	3.10	1,472.50
2/26/04	ADDRESS DEFENSE ISSUES RAISED BY DEPOSITION FOR TRIAL PREPARATION; TRIAL PREPARATION; ADDRESS INFORMATION FROM ROTHFEILD LOGS WITH EXPERTS AND ENGINEERS;	YDS	3.10	
02/26/04	ADDRESS ISSUES FROM FAZIO NOTE. DRAFT NOTICE TO SIGN AND RETURN FOR D.PETRILLO TRANSCRIPT; COMPILE DOCUMENTS FRO ATTORNEY REVIEW; CONFERENCE RE	DMM .	1.40	238.00
)2/27/04 ·	DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT;	LB	0.10	11.50
02/27/04	CALENDAR DATES MILTIPLE TCS WITH ZINNER RE:	. MB	2.60 .	819.00
	CONFERENCE AND PREP FOR SAME, MULTIPLE TCS WITH COUNSEL FOR UNION, OCS YDS, FINALIZED FIELD BOOK CORRESPONDENCE TO TRC, DRAFTED AND FINALIZED	•		
	CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT, PREPARATION FOR RESPONSE TO MOTIONS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND			·
02/27/04	PRELIMINARY RESEARCH. ADDRESSING ISSUES FOR SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE; ADDRESS ISSUES THAT DEFENDANTS INTEND TO RAISE ON	YDS	1.10	522.50
	SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS; MEMO TO CLIENT RE LOST PROFITS INFORMATION; ADDRESSING DAMANGES		•	
02/27/04	ISSUES PER V.STELLIO. COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR EXPERT	DMM .	0.80	136.00
	REVIEW.			• ,
	TOTAL FEES SERVICES		\$	43,306.00
DISBU	JRSEMENTS:			VALUE
				71.1
MEALS TRAVEL				125.3 109.6
TRAVED	ONE/FACSIMILE -			1,622.8
	OPYING -			,

016036 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
0001 TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 03/11/04 INVOICE # 118057

VALUE

DE PROFESSIONAL	SERVICES	RENDERED	AS	OF	FEBRUARY	29,	2004	
-----------------	----------	----------	----	----	----------	-----	------	--

DISBURSEMENTS:	
	227.34
OVERTIME	0.72
COURT SERVICES .	117.00
SERVICE OF PROCESS FEES COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH	74.84

TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD....\$ 2,381.87

***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

750 Lexington Avenue New York, N.Y. 10022

(212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 04/29/04 INVOICE # 118781

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

OB DDOFFSST	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL 1	L6, 2004	•	
OR PROFIBEL		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	CALL CALL CALL CALL CALL CALL CALL CALL	LB.	0.20	25.00
02/26/04	DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT; CALENDAR DATES	•	. 1	225.00
03/01/04	COMPILE SUBPOENAS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOR REITH,	. TD	1.50	. 223.00
-	ROCKWORKS, LOPES	DMM	0.70	119.00
03/01/04	TRIAL PREP; PREP FOR		•	1,537.50
03/01/04	MEETINGS WITH YDS AND DMM; FURTHER RESEARCH RE:	MB .	4.10	1,337.30
				٠
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. MCGUIRE AND FOLLOW UP RE:			
	CONFERENCES WITH ZINNER;			
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH	. •	•	:
• •	WEISSMAN; DRAFTED DJT MEMO; PREP FOR COURT CONFERENCE; TELEPHONE	•		
• •	CONFERENCES WITH COURT; ANALYSIS OF SETTLEMENT DEMAND.			0.45 0.0
03/01/04	PHONE CALL WITH B. DIAMOND;	YDS	2.20	1,045.00
	REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS; TRIAL PREPARATION; UPDATE TRIAL PREP		,	
03/02/04	LIST. REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF NIGRO	MB	3.20	1,200.00
03/02/04	TESTIMONY FOR TRUMP FOR DJT DEPOSITION; DRAFTED DJT MEMO;			
	MITITIPLE OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH			•
•	YDS, MULTIPLE OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH DMM; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	•	•	
•	WITH P. HELMS; FOLLOW UP RE:			
	DOCUMENTATION RE: FURTHER		•	
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MATT MCGUIRE RE:			
	RE: TAMEORMATION	DMM	0-80	136.00
03/02/04	FOR COUNSEL RE TRIAL			

MORRISON COHEN SHAGER & HOLLES		DATE: 04/29/04			
016036 0001	THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. CO	LUMBUS	INVOICE # 118781		
<u> </u>	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL :	16, 2004		•	
OR PROFESSI	ONAL SERVICED LELLE	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE	
03/02/04	PREPARATION; UPDATE TASK LIST. CREATE MASTER DEPOSITION INDEX AND EXHIBIT BINDERS CREATE AND ORGANIZE FILE FOR PETRILLO	TD	3.00	450.00	
	DEPOSITION AND EXHIBITS CREATE AND ORGANIOZE FILE FOR STELLIO DEPOSITION AND EXHIBITS		1.30	617.50	
03/02/04	TRIAL PREPARATION; ADDRESS	YDS	1.50		
03/02/04 03/03/04	PREPARE FOR D. TRUMP DEPOSITION. OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS AND DMM; REVIEW OF GABE PASQUALI	YDS MB	1.10	522.50 1,125.00	
	INFORMATION AND DRAFTED AFFIDAVIT; FOLLOW UP WITH INTECAP RE:			• .	
03/03/04	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES RE: CALENDAR DEPOSITION DATES. COMPILE DAMAGES DOCUMENTS FOR	LB DMM	0.10	12.50 68.00	
03/03/04	CLIENT REVIEW.	TD	3.50	525.00	
03/04/04	AND BINDER PRIVIEW AND COMPILE NOTICES TO	TD	. 1.00	150.00	
03/04/04	SIGN AND RETURN FOR BINDER ADDENDUM TO DJT DEPOSITION MEMO;	MB	1.60	600.00	
03/05/04	SAME; FOLLOW UP RE: MEMO TO D. TRUMP RE BRIARCLIFF;	YDS	2.60	1,235.00	
- 03/05/0	MEMO OF LAW TO HELMS AND MUCCI, MULTIPLE CALLS WITH C. KEPCHER. DEVICE SIMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION	DMM	0.70	119.00	
03/05/0	FROM LIBERTY MUTUAL; DISTRIBUTE.	DMM	0.60	102.00	
·	FROM LIBERTY MUTUAL; DISTRIBUTE FROM LIBERTY MUTUAL; DISTRIBUTE AND CASE MANAGEMENT;	LB	0.30	37.50	
03/08/0	CALENDAR DATES FOR MOTION. REVIEWED TWO SEPARATE MOTIONS AN	TD MB	7.70	2,887.50	
03/00/	MEMOS OF LAW; ANALYZED CASEDAW, DRAFTED MULTIPLE OUTLINES FOR AFFIDAVITS AND PAPERS; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P.				
-	HELMS; FOLLOW UP RE: POLLOW UP RE: TAX LOSSES; OFFICE		-		

MORRISON COHEN SINGER & WELFELLY					
016036 0001	THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. C	OLUMBUS	DATE: 04/29/04 INVOICE # 118781		
				•	
	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL	16, 2004	•		
OR PROFESS.	CONALI BEREVESEE .	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE .	
	CONFERENCES WITH YDS; OFFICE			•	
	TOTAL WITTH DMM: PRELIMINARY				
	DECEARCH AND ANALYSIS; REVIEW 1112	•			
	TATAT VOTO OR MANAGEMENT OF THE TATAT	ER	1.70 '	450.50	
03/08/04	MEETING WITH MARC BACHMAN TO REVIEWED MOTION			•	
			0.40	68.00	
	TO DISMISS. REVIEW SUMMARY JUDGMENT PAPERS.	DWM ·	0.40 · 2.50	375.00	
03/08/04	TOTAL DRED - REVIEW AND COMPLETE	TD	2.50		
03/08/04	ALL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING	•			
		•			
	REVIEW AND COMPILE SIGNED		•		
•	DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS FOR COUNSEL - REVIEW AND COMPILE ALL				
	COUNSEL - REVIEW AND CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING				
•					
	ORGANIZE AND CREATE	•			
•	PATTER FOR COUNSEL REVIEW	YDS	. 4.70	2,232.50	
03/08/04	PARTARE MEMO TO CLIENT; PRONG				
	CALL D. TRUMP; RISVIII				
	MEMOS RE BEGIN DRAFTING OUTLINE				
	MEET			•	
•	WITH M. BACHMAN RE	•			
		ER	1.50	397.50	
03/09/0	1 REVIEWED MOTION, BRIEF AND				
, , ,	CONTRACTS. REVIEWED MEMO ON				
• •			4 40	1,650.00	
	4 FURTHER PREPARATION FOR TRUMP	MB	. 4.40	1,050.00	
03/09/0	DEPOSITION: DRAFTED MEMOS RE:				
	FINALIZED MOTION	TI'			
	OUTLINES; OFFICE CONFERENCES WIT	.n		-	
	- ER, YDS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE DRAFT	r ·			
	WITH TRC RE: DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO INTECAP;			•	
	ETTOPLIER REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF			•	
	CACETAW RELITED UPON BY CCC AND				
	TM. TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITT		•		
	ZINNER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	•	·		
	WITTH WEISSMAN; DRAFTED				
	CORRESPONDENCE TO WEISSMAN.	ER	2.50	662.50	
03/10/	04 RESEARCHED STANDARD FOR		3 00	_ 270.00	
	TDIAL DEED - COMPILE	TD	1.80		

TRIAL PREP - COMPILE

CORRESPONDENCE FOR DEPOSITION - EXECUTION BINDERS - REVIEW

016036[°]

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 04/29/04 INVOICE # 118781

	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	COUNSEL DEPO BINDERS - COMPILE DOC PRODUCTION FILES FOR REVIEW	YDS	0.10	47.50
)3/10/04)3/10/04	LETTER TO N. NELSON. TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WEISSMAN AND S. ZINNER; FURTHER RESEARCH FOR OPPOSITION TO MOTIONS; OFFICE CONFERENCES ER,	MB	4.20	1,575.00
	YDS & DMM; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEYS; DRAFTED STIPULATION; REVIEW OF PRODUCTION FROM LIBERTY MUTUAL AND ALL NOTES			
	FROM LIBERTY MUIDAL AND THE FROM N. DURANTE FOR CROSS EXAMINATION AT TRIAL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH ATTORNEY FOR		· .	
- 120/04	UNION RE: TELEPHONE CALLS WITH D. TRUMP RE	YDS	0.40	190.00
03/10/04	REVIEWED COURT CALENDAR; SPOKE	LB.	.0.30	37.50
03/10/04	WITH CLERK RE COMPILE CASE CITED IN LIBERTY	. DMM	1.60	272.00
	TRIAL PREPARATION.	TD . ·	0.50	75.00
03/11/04	DAILY WORKSHEETS	YDS	2.00	950.00
03/11/04 03/11/04	PREPARE CLIENT FOR DEFORMATION OF D. TRUMP; MEET D. TRUMP AFTER DEPOSITION RE TELEPHONE CALLS	YDS	3.80	1,805.00
03/11/04 03/11/04	4 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MEETING INTECAP; RESEARCHED TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH	DMM , MB	0.70 4.50	119.00 1,687.50
	ADVERSARIES; DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE TO ADVERSARIES; FOLLOW UP RESEARCH RE;			
03/11/0	RESEARCHED RESEARCHED RESEARCHED	ER	3.00	795.00
03/12/	O4 COMPILE CASES CITED IN COLUMBUS	DIMM	- 1.60	272.00

•	MORRISON COHEN SINGER & WI			
016036 0001	THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. CO	LUMBUS .	DATE: INVOIC	04/29/04 E # 118781
		6, 2004		
OR PROFESSI	[ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL 1			VALUE
		ATTORNEY	HOURS	FIOTIALA
				•
	CONSTRUCTION'S MEMORANDUM OF LAW; PDF DOCUMENTS TO GROGG AND HANZLIK			1 550 50
	PDF DOCUMENTS TO GROSS THE RESEARCHED PUNITIVE DAMAGES	· MB	4.70	1,762.50
03 /12/04	CACELAW RE:			
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TRU;			
	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TRU;			
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH		:	
	INTECAP; REVIEW OF BACKUP			
	DOCUMENTATION FOR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES; OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH			
	DAMAGES; OFFICE CONTINUES OF DMM; RESEARCHED LOST PROFITS			
	CACELAW: RESEARCHED LIMITATIONS			
	OF DAMAGES CASELAW; FOLLOW OF		•	
	TOTAL ATTORNEYS RE:			
	REVIEW OF THE LATER			
·	DOCUMENTS FOR ADMISSIONS.	TD	3.60	540.00
03/12/04	TRIAL PREP - COMPILE ALL	•		
•	CORRESPONDENCE TO AND FROM LIBERTY MUTUAL			1 DAT ED
1 - 1-1	ATTENDED WITH C. KEPCHER; PHONE	YDS	4.10	1,947.50
03/12/04	CALL WITH T. LANDAU; WORKING WITH			
•	EXPERT RE			•
		MB	4.70	1,762.50
03/15/04	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH STEVE	1.12	•	•
	GROGG; OFFICE CONFERENCED HILL	•		
•	YDS, DMM, STRATEGY MEETING/SESSION; CONDUCTED			
	EXTENSIVE RESEARCH ON			
•	SCHOOL STREET STREET STREET STREET STREET	•		
	DICERT MY CASELAW AND FOLLOW UP			•
	DELTREMENT REVIEW OF DEPOSITION			
	TRANSCOTOT OF VINNY STELLIO:			•
•	DEVITEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM STAN			
	ZINNER; ARRANGED FOR FILING AND .			
	ADDENDUM TO STIPULATION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH			
	COINCEL FOR COLUMBUS AND DISEALL.		:1 50	225.00
03/15/0	TRIAL PREP - UPDATE DEPOSITION	\mathtt{TD}	1.50	220.00
03/15/0	EVECTOR RINDER - ORGANIZE	_	•	
	DEBOGITTION FILES - COMPILE COPIES	j		
	OF MINI DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT -			
	REVIEW ALL CORRESPONDENCE FILES			
	FOR ALL WEISSMAN CORRESPONDENCE			500 00
	REGARDING LIBERTY MUTUAL O4 TRIAL PREPARATION MEETING;	DMM	1.60	272.00
03/15/	O4 TRIAL PREPARATION MESTICAL COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR OPPOSITION		_	
	TO CITMMARY ATTICMENT MOLITONS	•	0.30	37.50
03/15/		D LB	0.30	3,.30
03/15/			•	

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 04/29/04 INVOICE # 118781

	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL :	ATTORNĘY	HOURS	VALUE
	FOR FILING IN WESTCHESTER			
	SUPREME; DOCKETING AND CASE			•
	MANAGEMENT	YDS ·	1.00	475.00
3/15/04	MEET WITH D. MULVEY AND M.			
	BACHMAN.	MB	5.90	2,212.50
3/16/04	RESEARCHED SUMMARY JUDGMENT CASELAW RE:	•		
	RESEARCHED		٠	
•				
	OFFICE CONFERENCES .			
	WITH YDS RE: REVIEW OF			•
	KEPTCHER ACTION ITEMS; REVIEW OF			
	UPDATED TASK SCHEDULE AND EDITS			
	TO SAME. SCHEDULING MEETING WITH S. GROGG	YDS	0.10	47.50
3/16/04	RE			
		200 C	.0.30	142.50
3/16/04	SCHEDULING MEETING WITH S. GRUG.	YDS TD	0.10	15.00
3/16/04	OBTAIN DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT FOR			
	SCHARF	MMG	1.40	238.00
03/16/04	TO SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS.			400.00
- 10 = 104		DMM	2.40	408.00
03/17/04			•	
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM TRUMP			
•	ORGANIZATION.	LB	0.20	25.00
03/17/04	DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT;		•	
	CALENDAR DATES ORGANIZE AND CREATE E FILE FOR	' · TD	0.20	30.00
03/17/04	TRUMP DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT		2 2.0	609.50
03/18/04		ER	2.30	٥٥٠, ۲٥٥
03/10/03				
•	RESEARCHED		,	·
	TO THE GOVERNMENT OF THE PARTY			•
	RESEARCHED WHAT CONSTITUTES			
				1,312.50
Ó3/18/0	4 FOLLOW UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	МВ	3.50	1,312.50
03/18/0	WITH TRC AND ADVERSARIES; DRAFT		•	
•	CORRESPONDENCE TO ZINNER;			
	RESEARCHED CASELAW RE:			
•				
•	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS	;		
	REVIEW OF ALL DOLF ROTFELD	•		
	DOCUMENTATION.			- 47.5D
	04 PHONE CALL WITH B. DIAMOND:	YDS	0.10	= /

016036	THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V.	COLUMBUS		CE # 118781
0001	TRUMP BRIARCHIFF MANOR BEE V.			
P PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL	. 16, 2004		
,	· .	ATTORNEY	HOURS	. VALUE
		•		
	TRANSCRIPT FOR M. BACHMAN TO			
	DTVTEW	LB	0.20	25.00
03/18/04	REVIEWED CALENDAR DATES; SPOKE	1117	,	
-	WITH MB RE MOTION.	MB	0.60	2,25.00
03/22/04	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE AND			
	CASELAW FROM INTECAP.	· YDS ·	0.10	47.50
03/23/04	PHONE CALL WITH D. TRUMP.	YDS	0.80	380.00
03/23/04	PHONE CALLS WITH B. DIAMOND AND			
	D. TRUMP; FAX FROM C. KEPCHER.	MB	0.60	225.00
03/25/04	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM	L'in	•	
02,	INTECAP AND FOLLOW UP WITH TRC.	YDS	0.10	47.50
03/29/04	PHONE CALL WITH D. TRUMP.	LB	0.10	11.50
04/01/04	CONFIRMED MOTION ADJOURN DATE		0.10	47.50
04/02/04	DIAMOND AND	YDS		
04/02/02	A. WEISSELBERG; MEET WITH D.			
	TRIMP	w T	0.20	. 23.00
04/14/04	TIME AND THE AND	LB ·	0.20	
04/14/04	CASE INFORMATION.			
	CLADE TRACE OF THE STATE OF THE			
•			•	
•	•	•		
	, TOTAL FEES BEFORE DISCOU	JNTS	.\$	39,827.50
	•			
	LESS DISCOUNTS		\$	(4,664.50) .
			• •	·
	TOTAL FEES SERVICES		. : \$	35,163.00
	TOTAL FEED BERVICES			
			•	
				VALUE
DISBU	IRSEMENTS:			
		•		231.75
MEALS				417.09
TRAVEL			•	109.76
TELEPHO	ONE/FACSIMILE		•	1,016.00
PHOTOC	OPYING			203.93
MAIL	-			47.50
MESSEN	CFR			693.12
				147.00
OVERTI	E OF PROCESS FEES			
SERVIC	PIRT TCATTONS			70.00
BOOKS/	PUBLICATIONS			305.78
DATABA	ASE SEARCH			73.58
COMPUI	PERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH	•		
	•	•		·
				•
			Š	3,315.51
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS		• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	_
		שוודת הפטורה	Ś	38,478.51
	TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR	-IUTO LUVION.	••••	•
	····		•	

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION .
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 04/29/04 INVOICE # 118781

OR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL 16, 2004

VALUE

**** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY ****

750 Lexington Avenue

New York, N.Y. 10022

(212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 05/20/04 INVOICE # 119364

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
725 FIFTH AVENUE
NEW YORK, NY 10022

- PDOFFCCI	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL 3	0, 2004	•	
K KOLP221		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
04/19/04	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH YDS AND	MB	1.50	562.50
04/20/04	DMM; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH ALL ATTORNEYS AND COURT. FOLLOW UP RESEARCH RE: TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	MB	1.10	412.50
04/21/04	WITH ALL PARTIES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO COURT. DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT;	LB .	0.20	25.00
	ADJOIRNED MOTION DATES.	MB	0.60	225.00
04/21/04	FOLLOW UP WITH COURT AND ADVERSARIES AND RELATED TELEPHONE	•		
•	CALLS.	. AD2	0.10	47.50
04/21/04	UPDATE RE FOLLOW UP WITH COURT AND LB RE:	MB	0.50	187.50
04/22/04 04/23/04	DATES. FOLLOW UP RE:	МВ .	0.50	187.50
• .	. The property of the state of	.MB	6.30	2,362.50
04/27/04 04/27/04 04/28/04	REVIEW OF FILE AND MOTIONS RE: REVIEW OF LIEN DOCUMENTS AND DRAFTED ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE; RESEARCHED CASELAW FOR MEMO OF LAW; DRAFTED AFFIDAVIT OF URGENCY. CONFIRMED MOTION ADJOURNMENT DATE.	LB MB	0.10	12.50 1,162.50
/ / /	PARTIES. A ATTEND TO LIEN ISSUES; TELEPHONE	YDS	0.80	380.00
04/28/0	CALL WITH TRUMP ORGANIZATION.	LB	0.10	12.50
04/28/0 04/29/0	4 CASE MANAGEMENT		2.20	825.00
•	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH	-	•	
				

MORRISON COHEN SINGER & WEIN	STEIN, LLP
MICIERION COLLETT	

016036 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 0001 TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V.	COLUMBUS	DATE : INVOI	05/20/04 CCE # 119364
R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRII	30, 2004		
	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
CLIENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH SPEEDY LIEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. ZINNER RE: LIEN; REVIEW OF LIEN DOCUMENTS. REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF V. STELLIO AND COMMENT AND CORRECT.	YDS	1.00	475.00
•			
TOTAL FEES BEFORE DISCOL	NTS	.\$	6,877.50
LESS DISCOUNTS			(352.00)
LESS DISCOUNTS TOTAL FEES SERVICES			6,525.50
			· VALUE
DISBURSEMENTS:			15.84
•	•		10.80
TELEPHONE/FACSIMILE			3.65
PHOTOCOPYING		•	2,882.88
MAIL DATABASE SEARCH			. 41.23
DATABASE SEARCH COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH			•
•		· .	
	•		
•	• •	Š	2,954.40
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS		• • • 4	
TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR			9,479.9
	RRENT SERVICES	ONLY *****	

750 Lexington Avenue

New York, N.Y. 10022

(212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 06/22/04 INVOICE # 120066

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MAY 31,	2004		·
OR PROFESS:	IONAL BERVICES KENDERED TE	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE ·
- 1-2 /04	DRAFT LETTER TO V. STELLIO RE	DMM	0.60	102.00
.05/03/04	EXECUTING TRANSCRIPT	DMM	1.60	272.00
05/04/04	CALLS TO V. STELLIO.	MB	0.60	225.00
05/04/04	FOLLOW UP RE:	PID	•	
05/06/04	OCS YDS AND DMM CALL TO N. NELSON -	DMM .	0.20	34.00
05/07/04	TIVITZE LETTER TO STELLIO RE	DMM	0.60	102.00
	DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT; CALL TO STELLIO RE CALLS TO	,		• •
05/10/04	ZINNER - EXTENSION OF TIME.	MB	7.80	2,925.00
	IN CASELAW & TREATISES; REVIEWED CASELAW;	-		
	PRIZEMED ALL MOTION PAPERS.		. 0.10	12.50
05/10/04	TO CENTER THE AND CASE MANAGEMENT	LB	0.40	68.00
05/10/04	COMPTLE DOCUMENTS FOR COUNSED IN	DMM	0,10	
05/10/04	SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION.	YDS .	0.50	237.50
05/11/04	FOR OPPOSITION.	. ER	1.00	. 265.00
.•	NA SUL MILL AUG. AND	MB	1.10	- 412.50
05/12/0	ADDENDIM TO OUTLINES.		0.10	12.50
05/13/0	4 DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT	LB MB	2.00	750.00
05/13/0	DMM; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH INTECAP AND TRC;			
•	FOLLOW UP RE:			
	OF INTECAP AND TRC REPORTS; OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH MULVEY			
	RE: REVIEW OF CASELAW FROM INTECAP.			
-	CADELLAN TITOL TITOL			

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 06/22/04 INVOICE # 120066

	•	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE .
05/13/04	TRIAL PREP CONFERENCE; COMPILE DOCUMENTS AND INFO FOR MUCCI AND	DMM	1.80	306.00
	GREG; CALLS TO ZINNER AND WEISSMAN RE MOTION FOR SUMMARY		•	
05/13/04	JUDGMENT. WORKING ON OPP. MOTION AND AFFIDAVITS WITH EXPERTS; REVIEW	YDS ·	0.50	237.50
05/14/04	REVIEW M. GALLAGHER TRANSCRIPT RE	DMM	1.80	306.00
05/17/04	CALCULATED REPLY AND OPPOSITION	LB ·	0.10	12.50
05/17/04	DATES FOR MOTION. PULL TECTONICS REDWELD FROM TRUMP	TD	0.10	15.00
05/17/04	DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FOR DMM REVIEW REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS AND VARIOUS DOCUMENTS FOR	DMM	1.70	289.00
. 05/17/04	CONFERENCE RE: TO THE TENTE OF THE CONFERENCES YDS AND DMM;	Μ̈́B .	3.50	1,312.50
	DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE TO COOKEY, TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH EXPERTS AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO EXPERTS: REVIEW OF PROPOSALS;	-		
	REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF NOTICE TO ADMIT AND RESPONSES; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE AND REVIEWED		. •	
05/18/04	CORRESPONDENCE FROM INTECAP. COMMUNICATING WITH EXPERT FOR	YDS	0.60	.285.00
05:/18/04	OPP. TO MOTIONS. BEGAN DRAFTING MEMO OF LAW; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TRC	MB ·.	0.40	150.00
	AND INTECAP; DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE TO COURT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT;			-
05/18/0	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO WEISSMAN.	DMM	2.30	391.00
05/19/0		YDS	0.20 .	95.00
05/19/0	AFFIDAVIT.	MMC	1.70	289.00
	TO SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTIONS.	1 LB	0.20	25.00
05/19/0	DATES.	MB	0.50	187.50
05/19/0	FOLLOW UP RE:	•		

01603	6
0001	

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 06/22/04 INVOICE # 120066

FROLES	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MAY 31,	ATTORNEY.	HOURS	VALUE
			٠	
	OPPOSITION; REVIEWING AND			
	THE PAPERS.	MB .	2.10.	787.50
/21/04	REVISING DOCUMENTS FOR REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS FOR AFFIDAVITS; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE AFFIDAVITS; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE			
	AFFIDAVITS; MUDITIES; CONFERENCES WITH GROGG & HELMES;			• •
	THE TOTAL TOTAL OF PLANE			
·				
	CONFERENCES WITH COURT, OFFI			
		YDS .	0.40	190.00
5/21/04	EMATTS FROM EXPERT AND			
<i>></i> / /	PROVIDE GUIDANCE AND COUNSEL; SUPERVISE OPP TO SUMMARY JUDGMENT	•		
	SUPERVISE OPP TO BOMEZE	·	1.00	. 475.00
/ /	MOTIONS. MEET WITH D. MULVEY AND M.	YDS		
5/24/04	DACHMAN TO COMPANY TO			
	REVIEW DRAFIS.	DMM	0.60	1,02,.00
5/24/04	CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL RE:	•		
		•		525.00
	REVIEW OF COMPREHENSIVE EMAILS	. MB	1.40	, 222
05/24/04	THE THE THE THE THE THE THE THE THE	•		
	FROM GROGG AND HELL TECHTONICS DOCUMENTS; FOLLOW	•	•	
	EVENTO CONTROL DE CONT			
	UP RE: OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH			617.50
	DMM & YDS. 4. REVIEW DRAFT OF HELMES AND GROGG.	YDS	1.30 . 0.60	. 225.00.
05/25/0	CONTRED BING RIS WILL GLOSS		0.60	•
05/25/0	THE MEDICAL PRIVING OF PERSONAL PROPERTY AND			• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •
	OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS AND			
	DMM.	DMM	1.10	187,00
05/25/0	4 MEMO RE: OCATION FOR	•		
, ,	ROCK TO TOWNHOUSE LOCATION FOR AFFIRMATION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT		7 70	487.50
		- MB	1.30	
05/26/0	THE RESERVE	· MB	1.60	. 600.00
05/27/	ON COMPUTERNSIVE .			<u>.</u> ξ
05/2//	TOUR FOR EXPERTS, KEVIL	34A		•
	OF CORRESPONDENCE FOR EXPERTS,			•
	OF CORRESPONDENCE. OCS YDS AND DMM, TCS WITH GROGG AND HELMES IN PREPARATION FOR	•	•	
	TOPOTO AND ADDICE TOPOTO	•		
	DE EXPERT PERTONALLE			
	DESTRUCT OF DRAFT GROUG AND HEBELD	S .		
	THIRDAUTTE OCS DS KE: BERNE	YDS	0.10	47.5
05/27	/04 UPDATES ON EMAIL STATUS OF	منه مند بد	•	221.0
00/	OPPOSITION. /04 REVIEW MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN	DMM	1.30	221.0

016036 0001	THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. C	OLUMBUS	DATE: 06 INVOICE	/22/04 # 120066
	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MAY 31		:	
R PROFESSI	ONAL SERVICES READERS	ATTORNĖY	HOURS	. VALUE
•		•	•	
	MOTION; REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS;	·		
	FORWARD DOCUMENTS TO GROGG AND	•	•	•
	THE PART C	мв	2.10	787.50
05/28/04	ARRID VERTURALL OF STEVEN	•	• .	
03/20/	DD V ELED VELTOWATT OF			
	GROGG; DRAFIED TO THE CONFERENCES HELMES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH GROGG AND HELMES; MULTIPLE		•	
	WITH GROGG AND HELLING, OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS;			
	TOT TOW ITD WITH DIM KE:			•
	TO ANTICOPTOTS: REVIEW OF ALL	•		
	TOC TNEORMALLON FOR	•	•	
			• •	•
	OF MOTTOR TO ADMIT RESPONDED!	•		
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH			190,00
	WEISSMAN. REVIEW MATERIALS FROM EXPERTS;	YDS	0.40	
05/28/04	REVIEW MAIEKIAND TREVIEW EXPERT AFFIDAVITS AND		•	
	MEMOS OF LAW	****	1.70	637.50
- 100/04		MB ·		
05/30/04				
	TOP THE THEORY OF THE THEORY OF THE THEORY		•	•
	TOTAL WITTH YUS: KEVIN OF		•	
	TECHTONICS DOCUMENTATION; REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GALLAGHER AND			
	AND ANALYSIS OF GARRIED PETRILLO TESTIMONY FOR OPPOSITION	и.		•
	TO HELMES	•		•
	AUDIDATIT AND MEMO OF LAW COME			
	FURTHER RESEARCH			
		•		
		YDS	1.60	760.00
05/30/0	4 REVIEW AND REVISE COMMENTS TO	•		95.00
	DRAFTS.	YDS	0.20	, 93.00
05/31/0	4 REVIEW ADDITIONAL INPUTS AND	•	•	•
	COMMENT.			
	•		-	•
		ormima.	s .	16,634.0
	TOTAL FEES BEFORE DISC	OUNTS		,,
	LESS DISCOUNTS		\$	(1,726.5
				14,907.5
	TOTAL FEES SERVICES		\$	14,507.5
			•	ፕታንላፒ ፒ
	·			JAAV
DIS	BURSEMENTS:			53.0
				87.
- TRAVI	EL	_	· 	- ,
TELE:	PHONE/FACSIMILE			

and the same section of th	MORRISON-COHEN-SINGER & WEINSTEIN, LLP	DATE: 06/22/04
016036 0001	THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS .	INVOICE # 120066
B BROFESSION	AL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MAY 31, 2004	•
		VALUE
DISBURSEM	ENTS:	404.60
PHOTOCOPYIN	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	90.51
MAIL		17.50
MESSENGER		. 264.40
OVERTIME		. 261.79
·	EARCH ED COURT DOCKET SEARCH	52.57
	· ·	
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS\$	1,231.65
	TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$	16,139.15

**** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY

750 Lexington Avenue

New York, N.Y. 10022

(212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 121881

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION .
725 FIFTH AVENUE
NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13-3205994

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 30	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
6/01/04 RESEARCHED CASELAW FOR OPPOSITION	MB	8.20	3,075.00
TO TEPPTY MITUAL AND CONGINGE			
PECAN DRAFTING	,		
MOTIONS; HEATH STATE CONFERENCE OPPOSITION; OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES FROM			
AND REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM INTECAP; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES			
INTECAP; TELEPHONE COM INTERCAP WITH GROGG AND REVIEW OF			
CORRESPONDENCE FROM TRC.	.TD	0.60	69.00
FOR COUNSEL'S REVIEW	MMQ	.1.20	204.00
TOTAL CIRCUIT DECISION	MB·	5.70	2,137.50
			•
CONTRIBENCES WITH LB, DMM AND YDS;		•	
DESTRICT OF STELLIO AND INCHE			•
TRANSCRIPTS AND INSERTED ITEM			-
INTO PAPERS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MUCCI AND GROGG;		•	
TO AFFTDAVLIS AS PER		:	
THE PRIORE CONFERENCES: KEVILLE OF	-	•	•
PARTOGE NOTE FOR LIBERTY MULUALI			-
A DELDAVITO, FURTHER ADDENDUM 10	•		
COLUMBUS OPPOSITION PAPERS; INCLUSION OF TECTONIC LOGS.	•		_ 25.5
	$_{ m LB}$	0.20 10.00	3,750.
THE POHONE CONFERENCES RE:	· MB	10.00	- 7
TELEPHONE			
CONFERENCES WITH MUCCI; DRAFT			
* CORRECTONDENCE TO MUCCI AND			
GROGG; OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS; DRAFTED NEW AFFIDAVIT			
CHCHIONG AG DER TELEPHONE			
CONTERPENCES AND CORRESPONDENCE			
The Carlotte and and and the contraction			
WITH TRC AND INTEGER, CASELAW AND RESEARCH OF FIDUCIARY CASELAW AND	J		

.016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 121881

R PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 30	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
SURETY CASELAW, FURTHER RESEARCH		•	
ON_	•	•	
ADDENDUM TO MEMO OF LAW.	!	2.40	1,104.00
RW VDC RE- RW	MEF .	2.40	
	YDS	0.50	237.50
06/03/04 ATTENDING TO EXPERT ISSUES AND	IDS		
	MEF	5.40	2,484.00
06/04/04 RW SUMM JUDGMENT MOTION; MB DRFS			
OF AFFS ON CCC MOTION, DITE			·
MTG RE:			•
CONF W/MB RE:			
			4,500.00
5/04/04 RESEARCH. FOR MEF ON	MB	12.00	±1300.00
		•	•
COLLATED AND COPIED			
EOGUMENTS FOR PAPERS AND MEE;			
OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS, MEE,	•		•
TO AND DAME MITITIPLE CONFERENCE,		·	
CALLS; REVIEWED AND ANALYZE NEW		•	
DOCUMENTS FROM EXPERTS; CONTINUED DRAFTING PAPERS AND AFFIDAVITS;			
FURTHER REVIEW OF AND DIGESTING			
OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS.		5 55	629.00
	DMM	3.70	
FOR COUNSEL RE:			
	ER	2.50	562.50
06/04/04 DRAFTED SECTION OF MEMO OF LAW IN	EK		
OPPOSITION TO SUMMARY JUDGMENT	•		_
MOTION REGARDING PUNITIVE DAMAGES.	DAP -	0.80	. 340.00
06/04/04 CONFS. W/ MEF RE:	YDS	1.50	712.50
OCIDAIDA TIC WIM. MUCCI RE			•
T/C EXPERTS RE	-		
		n 40	3,404.00
06/06/04 RW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS; RW	MEF	7.40	3/2021-0
ADD'I DOCS FOR MOTIONS RE:			
RW			
EXPERT RPTS; T/C /YDS RE:			
; 170			
W/MB ON RESEARCH ISSUES;	!		
FOLLOW-UP ON RESEARCH ON 2 ISSUES	YDS _	1.40	665.00
06/07/04 ADDRESSING ISSUES FOR V. STELLIO AFFIDAVITS: ATTENTION TO ISSUES			
	•		612.00
RE: O6/07/04 OPPOSITION TO SUMMARY JUDGMENT	DWM.	- 3.60	- 612.00
06/07/04 OPPOSITION TO SUMMERCE SUSSIENTED			
·			

016036	MORRISON COHEN SINGER & W	•	DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 121881	
0001	THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. C		1	,
	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 3	0, 2004		
OR PROFESS	TONAL Back Day	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
. 06/07/04	MOTIONS. RW PTS BY EXPERTS, NOTICES TO ADMIT; RW CONTRACTS IN DETIAL RE:	MEF	7.90	3,634.00
		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
06/07/04	; NOTES FROM CALLS W/EXPERTS EDITED AFFIDAVITS; FURTHER	MB	8.10	3-, 037.50
	RESEARCH MULTIPLE CONFERENCE CALLS WITH GROGG, HELMES AND STELLIO;			
	REVIEW OF OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH			
06/08/04	MEF, YDS AND DMM.	DAP	5.30	2,252.50
06/08/0	4 REVIEW OF ALL TECTONIC LOGS AND	MB	7.90	2,962.50
	TRC AND INTECAP, INCORPORATED SAME INTO AFFIDAVITS AND MEMO OF			•
	DRAFTED COMPLETE CASE CHRONOLOGY FOR PAPERS, REVISED AFFIDAVITS AS PER EXPERTS' CHANGES, REVIEW OF ALL VILLAGE		,	
	APPROVAL DOCUMENTS AND INCORPORATED SAME INTO PAPERS, FOLLOW UP RE: FOLLOW UP WITH LB RE:		- 	
	REVIEWED AND DIGESTED STELLIO TRANSCRIPT, REVIEW OF A LIBERTY MUTUAL DISCOVERY AND INCORPORATED DEFICIENCIES INTO	ΓΓ	·	
06/08,	PAPERS A TIMEN M PACHMAN	999	1.20	570.00

016036 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 0001 TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS			DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 1218		
<u>.</u>	THE THE PERSON AS OF THE	30, 2004			
FOR PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 3	ATTORNEY	· HOURS	VALUE	
 06/08/04	SEARCHED STATE AND FEDERAL COURTS FOR CASES FILED AGAINST	. LB	0.50	62.50 ·	
06/08/04	RW DURANTE DEPO FOR LIBERTY MOTION; STELLIO AFF ISSUES W/YDS RE:	MEF	7.40	3,404.00	
	WORK ON LIBERTY MOTIONS; PUBLIC HARM AND INDEPENDENT TORT				
	ISSUES, UNDERWRITING FILE ISSUES; RW DISC FILE FOR SAME			•	
06/08/04	COMPILE DOCUMENTS AND INFORMATION FOR COUNSEL FOR OPPOSITION FOR	DMM	3.80	646.00	
06/09/04	SJ, CALLS RE: COMPREHENSIVE FOLLOW UP RESEARCH	MB	9.50	3,562.50	
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO EXPERTS; OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS AND MEF; DRAFTED ADDITIONAL AFFIDAVITS; MULTIPLE ADDENDUMS TO DOCUMENTS AS PER	1			
06/09/04	RESEARCH/INVESTIGATION ; CONFS W/MB/YDS RE: DRAWING TO USE AS EXHIBIT; CHRONOLOGY FOR USE IN DRAFTING AFFS; RW OF ADD'L FACT DOCS FROM MB TO DRF OPPOSING	MEF G	. 8.80 	4,048.00	
06/09/04	PAPERS REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT	YDS	1.00	475.00	
06/09/0	AFFIDAVITS FOR HELMS AND GROGG 4 COMPILE DOCUMENTS AND INFO FOR	DMM	3.10	527.00	
06/09/0	COUNSEL RE:	LB	0.50	62.50	
06/09/0	MANAGEMENT	DAP	. 0.70	297.50	
06/10/0	PREPARE FOR SJ OPPOSITION. MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH INTECAP & TRC, OCS YDS AND	DMM DMM	2.80 _4.10	476.00 1,537.50	

WITH INTECAP & TRC, OCS YDS AND DMM, MEF, FINALIZED LIBERTY

•	MORRISON COHER BEIGGER & I.	,		
016036 . 0001	TOTAL DOLARILIRA MANOR DOLAR		DATE: INVOI	09/14/04 CE
		n. 2004		
OR PROFESSI	CONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 3	37 230		
		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
		•		
	MUTUAL AND CCC AFFIDAVITS AS PER TCS AND OCS, FOLLOW UP RESEARCH			
-			C 00	3,128.00
/11 /01	WORK ON BRIEF IN OPPOSITION TO	MEF	6.80	3,120.00
06/11/04	ACC MOTION	DAP .	4.70	1,997.50
06/11/04	ISSUES; REVIEW	DAT	· ••	•
	EMAIL FROM BACHMAN RE:	•		
	RESEARCH RE: BEGIN REVIEW DOCUMENT PRODUCTION		•	•
	AND DEPOS.	NATO.	4.20	1,575.00
06/11/04	PRUTEW OF ALL LOST PROFITS	MB		
007==.	DOCUMENTS FROM CLIENTS AND	•		
	INCORPORATED PERTINENT INFORMATION FROM SAME INTO			•
	AFFIDAVITS AND MEMO OF LAW;			
	MITTIPLE OCS WITH INTECAP AND			
	UDC DEVIEW OF FURTHER			
	DOCUMENTATION SENT BY EXPERTS,		•	
	OCS MEF RE:		. '	•
		•		
•	REVIEW OF ALL PARCEL	· .		
	1, 2 & 3 DRAWINGS FOR USE AS			
	EXHIBITS; OCS YDS, DMM, LB	. DMM	.0.80	136.00
06/11/04	PREPARE FOR SJ OPPOSITION. PROVIDE INFORMATION FOR LIBERTY	YDS	0,.70	332.50
06/11/04	MUTUAL DEFENDANT.	errod.		357.00
06/12/04		DMM	2.10	
06/12/04		MEF	7.20	3,312.00
06/12/04	WORKING ON MOTION PAPERS	MEF	9.20	4,232.00
06/13/04	GOLF OUTING DOCS FOR PUBLIC HARM ARGUMENT; DRAFTING CCC BRIEF			306.00
122 [01	ARGUMENT; DRAFTING FURTHER REVIEW OF TRANSCRIPTS RE:	DMM	1.80	306.00
06/13/04			0.80	380.00
06/14/04	4 WORK WITH MEF	YDS -	0,0	•
,		•		,
	PUGEARCH PE	DAP	6.40	2,720.00
06/14/0	4 RESEARCH RE: CONFS. MEF; REVIEW DOCUMENT		•	
	PRODUCTION AND OTHER DISCOVERY			
	MATERIALS	MEF	9.80	4,508.00
06/14/0	4 DRAFTING NEW HELMES AFF; RW	MILE		
	VILLAGE PLANNING BOARD RESOLUTION; DRAFTING BRIEF AND	•		
	VDG ARR ON CCC MOTION			. 75.00
06/14/0	OA PRUTEWED CASES IN USDC-SDNY AND	· LB	0.60	/3.00
. 00/14/	EDNY; ARRANGED TO OBTAIN COPIES	-		
	OF COMPLAINTS.			_
				-

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 121881

				•
DDOFFEST(NAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 30	, 2004		•
PROFESSIO		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	NTERNET RESEARCH, RE:	LM	0.40	56.00
6/14/04	PREPARE FOR SJ OPPOSITION.	DMM . MB	2.30 12.00	391.00 4,500.00
	CB; DRAFTED SUBPOENA; RESEARCH RESEARCHED TORTIOUS INTERFERENCE CLAIM; DRAFTED AMENDED COMPLAINT; DRAFTED NEW POINTS FOR MEMO OF LAW RE: REVIEW OF FURTHER DRAWINGS AND CONTRACT RELATED ROCLIMENTS AND ADDENDUMS TO			
	EXISTING DOCUMENTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WEISSMAN; REVIEW AND DRAFTED DOCUMENT RE: ; REVIEW OF ALL LM DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND DRAFTED MEMO RE: FOLLOW UP RE:	ER	2.50	562.50
6/15/04	REVIEW OF PENDING RESEARCHED CASE LAW REQUIRING			
• • • • •	RESEARCHED CASE LAW ON NEED FOR	·		
06/15/04	FOR SERVICE; CHECKED SITTED COPYING OF COMPLAINTS; DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT; CALENDAR DATES; SEARCHED FOR CASES PENDING IN NEW YORK SUPREME AGAINST ARRANGED TO OBTAIN	LB	260	325.00
06/15/04	ADDITIONAL COMPLAINTS. PREPARE FOR OPPOSITION TO SUMMARY	DWM	3.80	646.00
06/15/04	JUDGMENT MOTIONS.	мв	10.00	3,750.00

	MORIGION COLLECTION			
016036	MULTAND DOTADILITIES MANUE THE A. CONSTRUCT			09/14/04 CE # 121881
				•
D PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 3	0, 2004		
or Thosas		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	•			
	DRAWINGS AND WORKED WITH GROGG &		•	
	DM ON NEW DRAWINGS.	YDS	. 0.90	427.50
06/15/04	ADDRESSING POTENTIAL USE OF	IDS	0.50	
00, ==,	EXHIBITS AND TESTIMONY FROM			_
	DEPOSITION; REVIEW AND REVISE	•		
	PAPERS. WORK-ON OPP TO LIBERTY MOTION;	MEF	12.70	5,842.00
06/15/04	CONF W/DAP RE:			
	RESEARCH	_		
	CANDALA EO OPTATA	TP	1.50	172.50
06/15/04	ATTENDED QUEENS SUPREME TO OBTAIN			
•	COMPLAINTS; ,			4,887.50
12 - 104	CONFS. MEF; CONFS. BACHMAN;	DAP	11.50	4,887.50
06/15/04	PERTURN BILLIE MATEUTADO DOFFICIENTE			
	PUNITIVE DAMAGES CLAIM; CONTINUE			•
•	RESEARCH RE:;			•
	MULTIPLE OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH	. MB	. 11.90	4,462.50
06/16/04	ALL EXPERTS, STELLIO, DMM, LB;		•	
	DEAFTED CROSS MOTION, DRAFTED	•		
	STELLIO AFFIDAVIT; ADDENDUM TO			
	ALL DOCUMENTS; RESEARCHED TORTIOUS INTERFERENCE, DRAFTED			
	PORTION; DRAFTED AFFIRMATION OF			
	GOOD FAITH; CULLED MULTIPLE			
	PROJECT DOCUMENTS; OFFICE	90		
-	CONFERENCES WITH EXPERTS RE:	DSG	0.50	.150.00
06/16/04	1 LECAL RESEARCH RE			
- 1 10	4 COMPILING EXHIBITS FOR SUMMARY	AC	3.00	405.00
06/16/0	JUDGMENT OPPOSITION	× 57770	12.30	5,658.00
06/16/0	THE BEAUTIFUL TO THE STATE OF T	MEF	. 12.30	3,030.00
00/20/	. WORK ON YDS	V	·	•
	AFF IN OPP TO LIBERTY MOTION;	•		
	CROSS-MOTION TO AMEND AND COMPEL			
	DISCOVERY: DRAFTING CROSS-MOTION	•	٠	
	PAPERS; RESEARCH ON CROSS-MOTION	į		
	REVIEWING	h		
		K.	•	•
	04 OPPOSITION TO SUMMARY JUDGMENT	DMM	4.20	714.00
06/16/	04 OPPOSITION TO SUMMARI BUDGMENT MOTIONS			007 50
00/20/	ON OBTAINED COPIES OF THREE	TP	2.50	287.50
06/16/	COMPLAINTS FROM QUEENS SUPREME.	ישרת	2.00	950.00
201201	ATTEND TO LIMITED ISSUES AND	YDS	2.00	<u> </u>

06/16/04 ATTEND TO LIMITED ISSUES AND

REVIEW OF COMPLETED DOCUMENTS;

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 121881

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 30	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V.			
CHRITITO RE-			
MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND E-MAILS WITH B. DIAMOND.			
PESEARCH RE:	DAP	14.40	6,120.00
6/16/04 REVISE BRIEFS. IN OPP. TO	•		
TOWN FOR SIMMARY JUDGMENT			612.00
PRO ATMANA 13 V . 11 11 (PRINTIN)	DMM	3.60	612.00
MOTTONS	AC	1.00	135.00
TARY OF TRUMP'S OFFICE	MB	11.00	4,125.00
I - I OA DINTATA YELL ALLI PAPILLO, III -	1 4.45		•
ADDITIONAL CASELAW; CONDUCTED FURTHER RESEARCH; DRAFTED LETTERS			
TO COURT AND ADVERSARIES;			
MET EDHONE CONFERENCES WITH			
EVDERTS AND ADVERSARIES; MULTIPLE			
· OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS DIMM,			
MEF, DAP, COLLATED EXHIBITS;			
ADDED LANGUAGE RE: TELEPHONE CONFERENCES			
WITH COURT AND FARRELLY &		•	
TAMBERRELLA.		12.00	6,394.00
OC /17/04 FINALIZING MOTION PAPERS;	· MEF	13.90	0,30,2.00
GIRDOFNA STELLIO AFF	AC .	2.50	337.50
OC/17/D4 REVIEWING AND ARRANGING EXHIBITS	AC .		
FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT	DAP	7.50	3,187.50
06/17/04 CONTINUE DRAFT, EDIT, REVISE BRIEFS AND AFFIDAVITS IN OPP. TO	•	•	
OF MOREON. DRAFT PROPOSED FOURIA			
AMENDED COMPLAINT; REVISE BRIEF;			• •
CONTROL MER CONF. BACHMAN		3:00	1,425.00
TOCATING INFORMATION FOR PAPERS;	YDS	3.00	
DEVICE V STELLIO AFFIDAVIII	•		
FINAL REVIEW OF ALL DOCUMENTS			_
BEING FILED; SIGN AFFIDAVITS, ETC	MEF	. 2.20	1,012.00
06/18/04 E-MAILS W/MB/DAP RE:			1,088.00
EINALIZE OPPOSITION TO SUMMARY	DMM	6.40	T, 088.00
06/18/04 FINALIZE OPPOSITION TO BOWARD JUDGMENT MOTIONS; PREPARE FOR			
SERVICE AND FILING.	WD C	2.10	997.50
A CALL DENTEW AFFIDAVIT AND CREATE	YDS	2.10	-
AFFIDAVITS AND DRAFTS FINALIZING	•		
PAPERS AND ADDRESSING SERVICE	Н		
ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MULVEY AND M. FLYNN RE:			
D. MODARY AND M. PHIMA		4,00	1,700.00
	DAP ·		

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 121881

R PROFESSE	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 30	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	AND PREPARE SAME FOR FILING;			
1 101	CONFS. DM; CONFS. MB	MB	4.60	1,725.00
06/18/04	LOCATED AND COLLATED FINAL EXHIBITS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES			
	WITH EXPERTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH ADVERSARIES; OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH YDS; DMM,			
	MER AND DAP.	AC	6.50	877.50
06/18/04	REVIEWING, PREPARING AND APPANGING BRIEFS AND EXHIBITS FOR		•	•
06/21/04	SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION. REVIEWED CPLR AND NOTICE OF CROSS-MOTION; FOLLOW UP RE	LB	. 0.40	50.00
i	DEFIDAVITS OF SERVICE FOR MOTION			
154 / 54	AND SUPPORTING PAPERS. REVIEWED AND ARRANGED DOCUMENTS	AC	2.00	270.00
·	TO BE SERVED. T/C W/LB RE:	MEF	0.30	138.00
06/21/04	CONTINUE FOR FILING WITH	DMM	1.40	238.00.
06/21/04	CLERK OF THE COURT.	, AC	2.50	337.50
06/22/04	JUDGMENT BINDERS.	AC	3.00	405.00
06/22/04	SUMMARY JUDGMENT, BRIEF MOTTON AND	LB	0.40	50.00
06/22/04	AFFIDAVITS FOR FILING IN WESTCHESTER SUPREME; ARRANGED FOR			•
	TITTING .	· · AC	2.50	. 337.50
06/23/04	1 REVIEWED CASES FROM BRIEFS AND	110		25.00
	MADE BINDER.	LB	. 0.20	450.00
06/24/0		MB	120	· .
06/24/0	4 FOLLOW OF WITH COURTERENCES ADVERSARIES; OFFICE CONFERENCES			•
06/24/0	WITH YDS, MEF AND LB. A NOTICE OF CROSS-MOTION FILED IN	ED .	2.50	287.50
. •	WESTCHESTER SUP. CT.	LB	0.30	37.50
.06/25/0	CATESTOND DATES FOR MOTION.	T 173	0.10	12.50
100/1		LB	0.10	12.50
06/28/0	CACE MANAGEMENT	LB	0.10	12.50
06/29/	COMPTRIED MOTTON RETURN DAIL.	LB VDG	0.10	47.50
. 06/30/ 06/30/	OA REVIEW RESPONSE TO SUBPORME KELL.	YDS	.	
00/30/	UNDERWRITING FILE.			-

016036 0001

ЭR

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 121881

•					
R PROFESSIONAL SERV	ICES RENDERED	AS OF JUNE 30, 20	004		
C 22002		•	ORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
•		1 L 1 2 4 V			
			·	•	
•	TOTAL FEES BEI	FORE DISCOUNTS	\$		141,759.00
				•	/
<u> </u>	LESS DISCOUNTS	3	\$	•	(44,595.00)
			٠ .		. 97,164.00
	TOTAL FEES SEI	RVICES			. 2//====
	•				
				•	. VALUE
DISBURSEMENTS:			•		
		•	•		. 159.28
MEALS					1,067.75 239.18
TRAVEL TELEPHONE/FACSIMII	ਜ਼ ਼				1,930.59
PHOTOCOPYING					213.98
	•	•		•	35.00
MAIL MESSENGER	• •	•			3,278.48
OVERTIME	•		•		1.71
COURT SERVICES	•	•	•		444.50
CERVICE OF PROCESS	S FEES -		•	•	45.00
COURT FILING & .MI	SC FEES			•	100.00
BOOKS/PUBLICATION	S			·.	103.70
STORAGE COSTS		,	•	•	7,013.15
DATABASE SEARCH		CITT		•	104.63
COMPUTERIZED COUR	T DOCKET SEAR	CH			
·		· · ·			_
		;			·
•	•				
•	TOTAL DISBUR	SEMENTS		\$	14,736.95
-	`	:			111,900.95
	TOTAL BALANC	E DUE FOR THIS P	ERIOD	7	111/200,25.
		· ·		• .	
		בת הסם מוזם פאותי פ	ERVICES ON	LY *****	
* * * *	** THIS BILL	IS FOR CURRENT S	almed also be V and a formation bear the first to	•	

MORRISON-COHEN-SINGER-&-WEINSTEIN, LLP

750 Lexington Avenue New York, N.Y. 10022

(212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 121882

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE .
NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13-3205994

	ATTORNEY	HOURS	
ARIAC (DA PRYTEWED MOTION DATES.		UOUKS	VALUE
	LB ·	0.10	12.50
07/07/04 REVIEWED SUMMARY JUDGMENT PAPERS	AC	2.50	337.50
AND PUT TOGETHER BINDER 07/07/04 TCONF./CORRESPONDENCE	MEF	0.10	46.00
(BOND BROKER) RE:	MEF	0.40	184.00
07/09/04 T.CONF. W/ COUNSEL FOR LIBERTY RE:	PIDE		
EMAILS TO ALLIED'S			
COUNSEL. 07/14/04 TCONF. WITH LIBERTY'S COUNSEL RE:	MEF	0.30	138.00
BRIEFING SCHEDULE, ETC.; EMAIL			•
CONFIRMATION TO ALL.	LB	0.10	12.50
07/19/04 CONFIRMED MOTION RETURN DATE.	LB	0.30	37.50
07/19/04 CONTITION AND CASE MANAGEMENT;			
CALENDAR DATES 07/30/04 CONFIRMED MOTION RETURN DATE.	LB	0.10	12.50
TOTAL FEES SERVICES		. \$	780.50
			VALUE
DISBURSEMENTS:			VALUE
			617.91
MEALS -			645.28
TRAVEL			41.04
TELEPHONE/FACSIMILE			14.85
PHOTOCOPYING			16.56
MAIL			2,548.19
OVERTIME			1,355,66
SERVICE OF PROCESS FEES			186.84
COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH			

5,426.33

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 121882

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JULY 31, 2004

VALUE

TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD:....\$

6,206.83

**** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

MORRISON-COHEN-SINGER-&-WEINSTEIN, LLP-

750 Lexington Avenue

New York, N.Y. 10022

(212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/14/04 INVOICE # 121883

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
725 FIFTH AVENUE
NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13-3205994

-CR DROFFCS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF AUGUS	T 31, 2004		
OR PROFESS		ATTORNEY	HOURS	· VALUE
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. WEISSEMAN	YDS	0.10	47.50
08/26/04	OF LIBERTY MUTUAL.	YDS	0.20	95.00
0B/31/04	PREPARE AUDIT RESPONSE.			
	TOTAL FEES SERVICES		.\$	142.50
				VALUE
DISBU	RSEMENTS:			111.18
TRAVEL			•	2.20
TELEPHO	NE/FACSIMILE			28.54
PHOTOCO	PYING .		•	1.34
MATT.				244.93
	OF PROCESS FEES	•		13.14
COMPUTE	RIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH			
	-	•		
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS		\$	401.33
	TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR T	HIS PERIOD	\$	543.83
	-	•		

***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

750 Lexington Avenue

New York, N.Y. 10022

(212) 735-8600

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 10/13/04 INVOICE # 122492

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13-3205994

FOR PROFESSI	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF SEPTEM	BER 30, 2004		
FOR 2200		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
09/08/04	CONFIRMED DATES FOR MOTION REPLY;	LB	0.20	25.00
	DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT	LB	0.10	12.50
U - / 1	OBTAINED JUDGE INFORMATION.	MEF	4.40	2,024.00
09/10/04	RW OPP PAPERS FROM LIBERTY AND REPLY FROM COLUMBUS IN ORDER TO WORK ON RESPONSES; PREP SUMM OF RESPONSE FOR PAPERS AND MTG W/YDS			
09/10/04	REVIEW SERVICE BY COLUMBUS AND	YDS	0.50	237.50
/= - 1 o 1	LIBERTY. WORKING ON OUTLINE FROM OPP	MEF	5.90	2,714.00
09/13/04	PAPERS FROM LIBERTY AND REPLY PAPERS FROM COLUMBUS; CONF W/YDS RE: CASES CITED FOR OUR RESPONSE AND DO ADD'L RESEARCH FOR RESPONSE			05.00
09/13/04		LB	0.20	25.00
09/14/04	WORKING ON REPLY TO OUR CROSS-MOTION AGAINST LIBERTY; RW DURANTE DEPO TRANSCRIPT FOR SAME AND FILES FROM THE BROKER FOR	MEF	7.80	3,588.00
09/14/04	LIBERTY COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR COUNSEL	DMM	.0.70	119.00
09/15/04	OUR SUR-REPLY ON COLUMBUS MOTION;	MEF .	7.80	3,588.00
09/15/04	OF LAW: REVIEW SUPPLEMENT -	YDS	1.00	475.00
09/15/04	DOCUMENTS AND INFO FOR COUNSEL RE	DMM	0.80	136.00
09/16/04	REPLY. FINALIZING ALL MOTION PAPERS: 2	MEF	7.60	3,496.00
09/16/04	AFFS AND A BRIEF FINALIZE DOCUMENTS FOR REPLY TO	DMM	0.80	136.00
09/20/04	CROSS MOTION; LETTER TO JUDGE.	LB	0.10	12.50

016036 0001

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS DATE: 10/13/04 INVOICE # 122492

FOR PROFESSIONAL	SERVICES	RENDERED	AS	OF	SEPTEMBER	30,	2004	

ATTORNEY

HOURS

VALUE

TOTAL FEES SERVICES.....\$

16,588.50

DISBURSEMENTS:

VALUE

16.43

TELEPHONE/FACSIMILE PHOTOCOPYING MAIL COURT REPORTER SERVICES

293.80 62.77

COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH

76.00 39.42

488.42

TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD....\$

17,076.92

THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS.....\$

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 12/29/04 INVOICE # 124215

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13-3205994

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF NOVEMBER 30, 2004

DISBURSEMENTS: PROFESSIONAL FEES	VALUE 8,547.45
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS\$	8,547.45
\cdot	8,547.45
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$	
LESS: APPLICATION OF RETAINER AGAINST CURRENT FEES & DISBURSEMENTS\$	(8,547.45)
TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$	0.00
DALANCE OF RETAINER REMAINING FOR THE NEXT BILLING PERIOD . \$	475.00

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 01/10/05 INVOICE # 124417

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIONUMBER 13-3205994

•	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF DECEM	BER 31, 2004		
FOR PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED 110 00 1 1	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
10/13/04 12/16/04	COMPILE INFORMATION FOR COUNSEL. READ AND REVIEWED DECISION;	LB '	0.20 0.30	34.00 . 37.50
12/10/01	COPIED AND DISTRIBUTED DOCUMENTS TO ATTORNEYS; DOCKETING AND CASE			
12/27/04	ENTRY DOCUMENTS TO ATTORNETS,	LB .	0.20	. 25.00
	DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT; CALENDAR DATES	•	-	
	TOTAL FEES SERVICES		.\$	96.50
		•		VALUE
DISBU	RSEMENTS:			
	•	,		116.28
TRAVEL	NE/FACSIMILE		•	.39.35 42.19
PHOTOCO	PYING		-	2.45
MAIL				17.50
MESSENG				390.69
OVERTIM	E		•	408.50
COURT F	REPORTER SERVICES OF PROCESS FEES			135.00
SERVICE	SE SEARCH			115.41 135.78
MISCELI	ANEOUS			152.92
COMPUTI	ERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH		-	
	·			
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS		\$	1,556.07
	TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR T	THIS PERIÓD	\$	1,652.57

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 01/10/05 INVOICE # 124417

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF DECEMBER 31, 2004

VALUE

***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 02/09/05 INVOICE # 125000

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIONUMBER 13-3205994

	•			
HOD DPOFESSI	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED ÀS OF JANUARY	31, 2005		•
FOK PROPERS		ATTORNEY	HOURS .	VALUE
01/04/05	CASE MANAGEMENT	LB	0.10 0.60	12.5 ⁰ 75.00
02/02/	REVIEWED DECISION; REVIEWED DOCKET ENTRIES AND COURT PAPERS FILE; REVIEWED COMPLETE CASE CALENDAR FOR EXPERT DISCLOSURE DATES; COPIED AND DISTRIBUTED DOCUMENTS TO ATTORNEYS; DOCKETING	LB	0.00	. , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,
• •	AND CASE MANAGEMENT	LB	0.10	12.50
	CALLED CLERK RE REVIEW AND RESPOND AND EMAIL FROM	YDS	0.20	95.00
01/17/05	M. SCARBOROUGH RE			
01/17/05	PREPARE DRAFT OUTLINE OF DIRECT	YDS	1.00	475.00
01/17/05	EXAMINATION OF DJT. DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT;	LB	0.20	25.00
01/10/02	CALEMDAR DATES	SPM	0.70	98.00
01/18/05	SEARCH FOR DOCUMENTS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW; CONFERENCES RE	YDS	1.00	475.00
01/18/05	PREPARE DRAFT OUTLINE OF DIRECT EXAMINATION OF DJT.			
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM	SPM	0.50	70.00
01/19/05	STORAGE FOR EXPERT. TELEPHONE AND E-MAIL RE		•	
01/25/05	VERIFIED SERVICE ADDRESS	LB	0.10	12.50
01/25/05	LIBERTY'S COUNSEL. OBTAINED UPDATED DRAFT RULES;	LB	0.20	25.00
	REVIEWED CASE ONLINE.	SPM	0.20	28.00
01/26/05				25.00
01/27/05	RESEARCHED CASE ONLINE FOR TRIAL	LB	0.20	25.00
01/28/05	DATE; CALENDAR TRIAL DATE.	YDS	0.50	237.50
	ISSUES FOR DJT, CK AND VS; CROSS		·	

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 02/09/05 INVOICE # 125000

TOP PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JANUA	RY 31, 2005		(
FOR TROTIES	•	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE · ·
01/28/05	W/YDS TO ASSIGN TASK AND DEVELOP	MEF	0.80	380.00
01/31/05	STRATEGY EMAIL'WITH M. SCARBOROUGH RE	YDS	. 0.10	47.50
01/31/05	CASE MANAGEMENT	LB	0.10	12.50
	TOTAL FEES SERVICES		.\$	2,106.00
DISBU	RSEMENTS:			VALUE
	NE/FACSIMILE		·	0.56 51.20 37.67
		• .		·
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS		\$.	89.43
	TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR TH	IS PERIOD	\$	2,195.43
			O1T 17 ++++	

***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY ****

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 03/15/05 INVOICE # 125997

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
725 FIFTH AVENUE
NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIC NUMBER 13-3205994

•			•	
OR PROFESSI	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF FEBRU	ARY 28, 2005		•
		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
02/02/05	REVIEWED COMMERCIAL DIVISION RULES; COPIED AND DISTRIBUTED DOCUMENTS TO ATTORNEYS; DOCKETING	ĽΒ	0.30	37.50
02/08/05	AND CASE MANAGEMENT; CALENDAR DATES MEETING WITH MARY FLYNN, RE: COMPILE	LM	1.10	181.50
02/09/05	CONTACTS LIST FOR TRIAL. UPDATE CONTACT LIST; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HELMS AND GROGG,	LM	0.80	132.00
02/16/05	RE: DOCUMENTS	SPM	1.20	168.00
02/17/05	PER ATTORNEY REQUEST. CONF W/YDS RE:	MEF	0.40	190.00
	REVIEW FILE HISTORY RE	SPM	0.60	84.00
02/22/05 02/23/05	SEND DOCUMENTS TO COUNSEL FOR REVIEW; T/C RE	SPM	0.50	70.00
) TOTAL FEES SERVICES		\$	863.00
DT ¢RII	RSEMENTS:	·		VALUE
			•	4.70
TELEPHO	NE/FACSIMILE .			16.80
PHOTOCC) L X T M C	•		0.37 57.75
MAIL STORAGI COMPUTI	E COSTS ERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH			160.69

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 03/15/05 INVOICE # 125997

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF FEBRUARY 28, 2005	VALUE
DISBURSEMENTS: TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS\$	240.31
TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$	1,103.31
**** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY ****	

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 04/06/05 INVOICE # 126332

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIC NUMBER 13-3205994

FOR PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MARCH		HOURS	VALUE
		ATTORNEY	. 1100110	
03/03/05	CASE MANAGEMENT TRIAL PREPARATION; COMPILE TRUMP	LB LM	0.10 1.20	12.50 198.00
03/04/05	AND STELLIO DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS FOR COUNSEL TO	•		
	REVIEW; COMPILE TIMELINE.	LB	0.20	25.00
03/10/05 03/11/05	OBTAINED COMPLAINT FROM USDC-SDNY TRIAL PREPARATION; COMPILE AND ORGANIZE CASE FILE FOR ATTORNEY	. LM	2.40	396.00
03/11/05	REVIEW. RW TB DOC PRODUCTION TO DESIGNATE	MEF	3.80	1,805.00
•	EVELTETTS FOR TRIAL	. LM	0.50	82.50
03/14/05	COMPILE AND ORGANIZE CASE FILE FOR TRIAL PREPARATION. CONTINUE REVIEW OF TB DOC	MEF.	7.60	3,610.00
03/14/05	PRODUCTION TO DESIGNATE EXHLUSTED			
	FOR TRIAL; RW PLEADINGS TO PREP OUTLINE OF ISSUES FOR TRIAL; MTG			
. 03/14/05	W/YDS RE: CONFER WITH M. FLYNN RE	YDS	0.30 .	142.50
	CONFERENCE WITH M. SCARBOROUGH.	YDS	1.00	475.00
03/15/09		MEF	7.20	3,420.00
03/15/0	5 COMPLETE REVIEW OF 4 BOXES OF TB PRODUCTION; MTG W/YDS RE:	PILIL		
. •	; RW			
03/15/0	ALL TB EXPERT REPORTS AND LTRS; RW COLUMBUS PRODUCTION FOR ADD'L DESIGNATION OF EXHIBITS TRIAL PREPARATION; PREPARE CHART	LM	2.80	462.00
	OF DEPONENTS TITLES AND COMPANIES; COMPILE AND PREPARE		•	

016036 0001

PHOTOCOPYING

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS DATE: 04/06/05 INVOICE # 126332

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MARCH 15, 2005

ATTORNEY

HOURS

VALUE

10,628.50

BINDERS OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS AND DEPOSITION EXHIBITS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW.

	TOTAL FEES SERVICES	20,02010
DISBURSEMENTS:		VALUE
		1,454.70
HOTOCOPYING		
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS\$	1,454.70
•	TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$	12,083.20

**** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY . *****

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 04/12/05 INVOICE # 126682

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION .
725 FIFTH AVENUE
NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13-3205994

				-
TOR DPOFFSS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MARCH	31, 2005		
FOK PROFITOR		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
03/16/05 03/16/05	TRIAL PREPARATION WITH M. FLYNN. CONTINUE DESIGNATING THE DOCS FROM COLUMBUS' PRODUCTION TO BE	YDS MEF	1.00 5.30	475.00 2,517.50
03/17/05	USED AS TRIAL EXHIBITS; RW LIBERTY PRODUCTION FOR SAME DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT;	LB	0.20	25.00
03/18/05	UPDATED SERVICE LIST T/C W/ZIMMER RE: PRE-TRIAL	MEF	3.90	1,852.50
00,1	SUBMISSIONS, AMENDMENT OF PLEADINGS, ETC.; FINISH REVIEW OF PRODUCTION AND	•		
03/21/05	PRODUCTION TRIAL PREP RE: RW OF DEPO TRANSCRIPTS	MEF	4.20	1,995.00
03/22/05	FOR PREP OF DIRECTS AND CROSSES CONTINUED TRIAL PREP; CONFERENCE W/OPP CO RE: PRE-TRIAL SCHEDULE,	MEF	6.80	3,230.00
03/23/05	NEGOTIATION OF EXHIBITS; CONTINUED RW OF DEPO TESTIMONY FOR PREP OF EXAMINATIONS TELEPHONE TO PART CLERK/LAW CLERK RE TRIAL SUBMISSION REQUIREMENTS;	SPM	0.30	36,00
03/23/05	RESEARCH RE	MEF	4.70	2,232.50
03/23/0	EXAMINATIONS TRIAL PREPARATION; ORGANIZE CASE	LM	1.80	297.00
03/24/0	FILE; COMPILE TRIAL EXHIBITS.	SPM	0.50	60.00
03/24/0	COMPLE AND	LM .	4.20	693.00
03/25/0	CASE FILE.	M.I	1.60	264.00

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 04/12/05 INVOICE # 126682

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	AS OF MARCH 3	1, 2005		· .
•		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
FILES FOR DOCUMENT PROD COMPILE TRIAL EXHIBITS	OUCTIONS; AND UPDATE			
EXHIBIT LIST. 03/28/05 WORK ON GROGG DIRECT. 03/29/05 WORK ON DEMONSTRATIVE E OUTLINES FOR HOLMES & G	EXHIBITS;	MEF MEF	4.90 4.60	2,327.50 2,185.00
(EXHIBITS/OPINIONS/UPDA 03/30/05 TRIAL PREP: RW DEPO TRA AND ADDITIONAL EXHIBITS	ATE). ANSCRIPTS	MEF	2.40	1,140.00
HOLMES OUTLINE. 03/31/05 WORK ON HELMES DIRECT.		MEF	2,20	1,045.00
TOTAL FEES SE	ERVICES		. \$	20,375.00
DISBURSEMENTS:				VALUE
TELEPHONE/FACSIMILE PHOTOCOPYING MAIL STORAGE COSTS		·		9.20 3.30 11.18 87.25
TOTAL DISBUR	SEMENTS		\$	110.93
TOTAL BALANC	E DUE FOR THI	S PERIOD	. . \$	20,485.93

**** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY ****

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 05/10/05 INVOICE # 127381

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, MY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIONUMBER 13-3205994

FOR PROFESSION	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL 1	15, 2005		
FOR THOTOLOG		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
04/01/05	T/C W/LM RE: EXHIBITS; ADD'L DOC RW AND RW OF DEPO TRANSCRIPTS IN	MEF	6.10	2,897.50
	PREP FOR TRIAL RW CLIENT BINDERS AND PREPARE	MEF	2.20	1,045.00
04/04/	PACKAGE FOR HELMES TOWNTHE CHANGE ORDER EXHIBIT;	LM	0.70	115.50
04/04/05	COMPILE CHANGE COMPILE BINDERS FOR EXPERT HELMES. T/C W/HELMES; T/C W/LM RE:	MEF	7.50	3,562.50
04/05/05	WORKING ON EXHBITS	MEF	5.60	2,660.00
04/06/05 ·	AND OUTLINES; CROSS EXAMINATION OF FILES	ERH	7.00	1,925.00
04/06/05	REVIEW PLEADINGS COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR WITNESS	LM	0.80	132.00
04/07/05 04/07/05	PREPARATION, RE:	ERH	7.40	2,035.00
04/07/05	REQUESTS/DOCUMENTS RE	YDS	0.20	
04/07/05	UPDATE TO M. SCARBOROUGH.	MEF	4.90	2,327.50
	PREP SESSION W/GROGG & HELMES;			. •
	T/C W/ZINNER	LB	0.20	25.00
04/08/05	REVIEWED DOCKET ENTRIES ASSEMBLE AND INDEX POTENTIALTRIAL		1.80	252.00
04/08/05	EXHIBITS.	LM	2.80	462.00
0 <u>4</u> /08/05	RE: CRESTON OF GROGG; REVISION	MEF	7.60	3,610.00
04/11/05	TO EXHIBIT LIST; PREP FOR HELMES	YDS	0.50	237.50
04/11/09	TRIAL PREP FOR EXPERTS WITH M.		2.80	462.00
04/11/0	TO THE RESERVENCE OF THE PROPERTY OF THE PROPE	LM	2.00	

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 05/10/05 INVOICE # 127381

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL	15, 2005		
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RELIGIONAL	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
UPDATE EXHIBIT LIST. O4/11/05 TRIAL PREP/ REVIEW DOCS/REVISE	ERH	7.20	1,980.00
EXHIBIT LIST.	LB	0.10	12.50
04/11/05 UPDATED STAFF INFORMATION; FORWARDED ALL CALENDAR DATES TO EH	ERH	7.50	2,062.50
04/12/05 DRAFT REVISED AMENDED COMPLAINT/RESEARCH RE			
04/12/05 UPDATE EXHIBIT LIST; REVIEW	LM	4.30	709.50
EXHIBIT LIST.	MEF	7.90	3,752.50
04/12/05 TRIAL PREP; MTG W/YDS RE: STRATEGY, DOCUMENTS, ETC.;	. •	•	
SELECTION OF TRIAL EXHIBITS; T/C W/OPPOSING COUNSEL; T/C W/LM RE:	YDS	1.00	475.00 .
; EMAILS WITH M. SCARBOROUGH RE BEVIEW EXHIBIT LIST.		7 70	3,657.50
04/13/05 TRIAL PREP; RW LIST OF EXHIBITS FROM COLUMBUS; RW REVISED COMPLAINT: T/C W/YDS RE:	MEF	7.70	
. WORK ON NEW DAMAGES		= 50	907.50
DOCS DOCS DOCS O 4/13/05 COMPILE PLAINTIFF'S TRIAL	LM	5.50	•
EXHIBITS. 04/13/05 SCHEDULING WITH C. KEPCHER;	YDS	0.20	95.00
ATTENDING TO O4/14/05 TRIAL PREP - TEAM MTG; T/C O4/14/05 TRIAL PREP - EXCHANGES OF EX	MEF	7.20	3,420.00
LISTS, WORKING ON WITNESS FILES FOR EXAMINATIONS	ERH	2.80	770.00
The state of the s	₹ S LM	4.30	709.50
04/14/05 COMPILE AND ORGANIZE PLAINTIFF'S AND DEFENDANT'S TRIAL EXHIBITS; ORGANIZE DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT AND EXHIBITS FOR TRIAL; MEETING			
WITH MARY FLYNN, RE:			47.50
04/14/05 COMPLETE TUPICAL OUTLINES FOR	YDS	0.10	4. - 2 -

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 05/10/05 INVOICE # 127381

0002				
OR PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRI	L 15, 2005		•
		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
04/15/05	TRUMP AND KEPCHER. COMPILE PLAINTIFF'S AND DEFENDANT'S TRIAL EXHIBITS.	I _M	3.80	627.00
				,
	TOTAL FEES SERVICES		. \$	41,069.50
				VALUE
TELEPHOI PHOTOCO	RSEMENTS: NE/FACSIMILE PYING RIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH			13.20 698.10 42.74 59.79
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR '			813.83
	***** THIS BILL IS FOR CUR	RENT SERVICES	ONLY ****	

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 05/12/05 INVOICE # 127382

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIC NUMBER 13-3205994

				•
TOP PROFESSI	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL	30, 2005	•	•
FOR FROIDS	•	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	CALL WITH DIT.	YDS	0.10	47.50
04/18/05 04/18/05	UPDATE CALL WITH DJT. COMPILE AND ORGANIZE PLAINTIFF'S	Mıl	5.50	907.50
04/19/05	AND DEFENDANT'S TRIAL EXHIBITS. COMPILE AND PREPARE PLAINTIFF'S	LM	3.10	511.50
•	AND DEFENDANT'S TRIAL EXHIBITS. DRED SESSION W/HELMES ON PHONE;	MEF	7.90	3,752.50
04/20/05	RW NEW DOCS JUST PRODUCED BY COLUMBUS,			
•	DAYMENTS TO SUBS; T/C W/HELIMES	•	•	
	OFFICE (M. FULENWIDER) RE: CONF W/EH RE:			
	; T/C W/YDS RE: WORK ON TRIAL		·	
04/20/05	EXHIBITS KEPCHER MEETING PREP/ REVIEW	ERH	3.40	935.00
04/20/05	DOCS-EXHIBIT LIST PREPARE MEETING WITH C. KEPCHER;	YDS	0.60	285.00
04/20/05	EMAILS WITH M. SCARBOROUGH RE			·
	ARRANGING SPECTRUM WITNESSES.	TÀL	2.30	322.00
04/20/05	DAMAGE FILES.	ERH	0.50	<u>1</u> 37.50
04/21/05 04/21/05	TOTAL PRED - REVIEWING NEWLI	MEF	6.80	3,230.00
04,721,03	PRODUCED CCC DOCS, WORK ON DIRECT AND CROSS FILES, RESEARCH FOR	•		
	MOTION IN LIMINE ISSUES RE:	•		
04/21/09	5 SCHEDULING WITH C. KEPCHER.	YDŠ LM	0.1.0 3.60	47.50 594.00
04/21/0	EXHIBITS; PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE	<u></u>		
	TO ZINNER, RE: PREPARE E-MAIL TO		,	
	EXPERTS, RE:			
		•		

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 05/12/05 INVOICE # 127382

	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL 3	30, 2005		
OR PROFESSI	ONAL SERVICES -	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
04/22/05	TRIAL PREP - PREP FOR SESSION W/HELMES ON MONDAY; RW EXHIBITS	MEF	8.20	3,895.00
	DESIGNATED BY COLUMBUS FOR PURPOSES OF OBJECTION OR CONSENT TO ADMISSION; DRAFTING MOTIONS IN LIMINE	LM	5.60	924.00
04/22/05	COMPILE AND PREPARE TRIAL EXHIBITS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH EXPERTS, RE: PREPARE E-MAIL TO STANLEY ZINNER,			
04/22/05	RE: COMPILING EXHIBITS. TRAIL PREP SCHEDULING WITH C. KEPCHER AND OUTLINE TRIAL PREP; CALL WITH STELLIO RE SCHEDULING;	YDS	0.40	190.00
04/25/05	CALL WITH C. DETHOMAS RE COMPILE DEFENDANT'S TRIAL EXHIBITS; ASSIST WITH EXPERT	LM	4.70	775.50
04/25/05	EXPERT DOCUMENTS TO COMPLETE THE EXHIBIT LIST. TRIAL PREP - PREP SESSION TRIAL PREP - PREP SESSION	MEF	5.70	2,707.50
24/25/05	MYHELMES AND PARCEL DOCS THEY BROUGHT; RESEARCH FOR MOTIONS IN LIMINE COMPILE AND ORGANIZE TRIAL	LM	5.70	940.50
04/26/05 04/26/05	EXHIBITS.	MEF	8.80	4,180.00
04/26/0	OBJECTIONS	YDS .	2.10	997.50
	ISSUES FOR IN LIMINE MOTION; REVISIONS TO C. KEPCHER OUTLINE AND CIRCULATE TO C. KEPCHER WITH			
04/26/0	TIME LINE. CONFERENCE CALL/YDS KEPCHER/ DRAFT MEMO RE CONFERENCE CALL/REVIEW KEPCHER DIRECT	ERH .	3.00	825.00
04/27/	TESTIMONY/RESEARCH RE 05. ISSUES FOR HELMES RE: T/C W/YDS RE:	MEF	5.90	2,802.50

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

PATE: 05/12/05 INVOICE # 127382

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL 30	, 2005		
	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
PRESENTATION; PREP FOR CROSSES ON ; PULLING DOCS FOR USE AS EXHIBITS W/HELMES REVIEW OF STELLIO DEPOSITION TO PREPARE TRIAL OUTLINE WITH EXHIBITS; DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; REVIEW AND COMMENT	YDS	2.00	950.00
ON ALL THREE MOTIONS IN LIMINE; REVIEW AND UPDATE FROM S. BORAS REQUESTED BY EXPERT. O4/27/05 ASSIST COUNSEL WITH MOTIONS IN	LM	6.70	1,105.50
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ZINNER, RE: EXHIBIT OBJECTIONS; CITE CHECK MOTIONS IN LIMINE. O4/28/05 EMAILS AND TELEPHONE RE ;	SPM	0.80	96.00
OPDATES RE REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE O4/28/05 TRIAL PREP: FINALLIZING 3 MOTIONS IN LIMINE; RW SALES INFO FOR LOST	· MEF	9.30	4,417.50
PROFITS CLAIM; T/C W/YDS RE: LIBERTY: T/C W/YDS RE: DEPO DESIGNATIONS, WORKLINE ON BACK-UP DOCUMENTATION FOR 04/28/05 EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CALLS WITH	YDS	1.00	475.00
M. SCARBOROUGH RE FINAL REVIEW AND SIGN MOTIONS IN LIMINE. O4/28/05 COMPILE EXHIBITS TO MOTIONS IN LIMINE: PREPARE MOTIONS IN LIMINE	ΓW ·	5.80	957.00
FOR SERVICE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE. WITH PART CLERK, RE; PROOF READ QUOTES IN MOTIONS IN LIMINIE; PREPARE LEGAL BACKS; PROUTEW AND PREPARE MOTIONS IN	LM	10.70	1,765.50
LIMINE FOR SERVICE AND FILING; COMPILE AND PREPARE WITNESS PREP FILES. 04/29/05 PREPARE MOTIONS IN LIMINE AND	SPM	0.50	60.00

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 05/12/05 INVOICE # 127382

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF APRIL 30, 2005	
ATTORNEY HOURS	VALUE
04/29/05 T/C W/YDS RE: TRIAL PLAN; LEGAL	3,895.00
RESEACH FOR PLT BRIEF; PULLING DOCS FOR USE AS EXHIBITS FOR STELLIO, DETHOMAS & CAROLYN O4/29/05 TRIAL PREPARATION WITH M. FLYNN YDS 3.00 RE REVIEW OF STELLIO AND THOMPSON DEPOSITION AND	1,425.00
REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL EXHIBITS; REVIEW OF ZINNER OBJECTIONS TO TRUMP TRIAL EXHIBITS. O4/30/05 ORGANIZE TRIAL PREPARATION YDS 2.00 MATERIALS FOR V. STELLIO, C. KEPCHER AND C. DETHOMAS.	950.00
KEPCHER AND C. DETHOMAS: 04/30/05 RESEACH FOR PRE-TRIAL BRIEF; MEF 7.70 DRAFTING PRE-TRIAL BRIEF	3,457.30
TOTAL FEES SERVICES\$	48,761.50
DISBURSEMENTS:	VALUE
TELEPHONE/FACSIMILE PHOTOCOPYING COURT FILING & MISC FEES STORAGE COSTS	22.50 3,819.90 135.00 74.45
STORAGE COSIS	
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS\$	4,051.85
TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$	52,813.35

***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 06/09/05 INVOICE # 128136

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIONUMBER 13-3205994

FOR PROFESSI	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MAY 15,	2005		
		ÄTTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE .
05/01/05	RW ZINNER OBJECTIONS TO OUR	MEF	0.50 .	237.50
05//	EXHIBITS; COMPARE ZINNER EXHIBITS ADDRESS SCHEDULING DOCUMENTS AND	YDS .	2.60	1,235.00
05/02/05	POTENTIAL MATTERS RE WITNESSES, EXHIBITS AND PREP OF			
	MATERIALS FOR SPECTRUM, TRUMP, STELLIO AND KEPCHER.		n (0	4,085.00
05/02/05	ADD'L EXHIBITS FOR TRIAL; MTG	MEF	8.60	4,085.00
٠	ZINNER EXHIBITS; PREP FOR SESSION W/HELMES; RW HELMES' ANALYSIS			
05/02/05	ASSIST WITH TRIAL PREPARATION;	LM	7.60	1,254.00
05/02/05	COMPILE AND ORGANIZE WITNESS PREP FILES FOR V. STELLIO, K. KEPLER AND TRUMP; COMPILE AND ORGANIZE	•		
1 10 m	TRIAL EXHIBITS. REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PRE-TRIAL	YDS	3.00	1,425.00
05/03/05	BRIEF AND EXHIBIT LIST; PREPARE		_	
	MATERIALS FOR V. STELLIO AND K. KEPCHER WITH EXHIBIT REFERENCE;			
	EMAILS RE			
	STATUS OF SALES AND MARKETING; STATUS OF COSTS.	т ъя	- - 8.50	1,402.50
05/03/05	ASSIST WITH TRIAL PREPARATIONS; COMPILE TRIAL EXHIBITS; CITE	LM	- 0.30	-,
	CHECK PRE-TRIAL MEMORANDUM OF LAW.	· MEF	- 7.00	3,325.00
05/03/05	ADDRESS PROJECT SCHEDULE ISSUES PREP OF HELMES; REVISING INTEREST CALCULATION; E-MAILS			
	W/ZINNER RE: MENDING PLEADINGS;			
05/04/05	T/C W/LM RE: PREPARE WITNESS LIST; FINALIZE	LM	6.80	1,122.00
05/04/05	CITE CHECKS ON PRE-TRIAL			
	MEMORANDUM OF LAW; COMPILE TRIAL			

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 06/09/05 INVOICE # 128136

FOR PROFESSI	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MAY 15,	2005		
FOIC TROUBLE		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE · ·
	EXHIBITS AND UPDATE WITNESS LIST; PREPARE JUDICIAL SUBPOENAS. PREPARE TRIAL BINDER FOR DONALD J. TRUMP; CALL WITH M. FLYNN TO K. PLUNKETT; TRIAL PREPARATION OF MATERIALS FOR V. STELLIO DIRECT	YDS	2.00	950.00
05/04/05 ·	INCLUDING VIDEO; ADDRESSING POTENTIAL TRIAL SUBPOENA. TRIAL PREP: SALES OF UNITS; PREPARATION OF REVISED DAMAGES OUTLINE FOR EXAMINATION OF HELMES: ISSUES FOR VS DIRECT;	MEF	8.20	3,895.00
05/05/05	WORK ON OUTLINES; FINALIZE PRE-TRIAL BRIEF ASSIST WITH TRIAL PREPARATIONS; PREPARE TABLE OF AUTHORITIES FOR PRE-TRIAL MEMORANDUM OF LAW; FINALIZE PRE-TRIAL MEMORANDUM OF	ΓW	9.90	1,633.50
05/05/05	LAW; UPDATE EXHIBIT LIST AND COMPILE EXHIBITS; UPDATE WITNESS LIST. PREPARATION CALL WITH CHRIS DETHOMAS; WORKING ON PRE-TRIAL SUBMISSIONS: PREPARE R. THOMPSON	YDS	3,00	1,425.00
	WITNESS DESIGNATIONS; ADDRESS ISSUES RE ISSUES RE	ERH	· 7.00	- 1,925.00·
05/05/05	TRIAL PREP; RESEARCH RE:	ERA	r,	•
05/05/05	T/C W/OPPOSING COUNSEL; COMPLETE ALL PRE-TRIAL DOCS DUE TO COURT TOMORROW, PRE-TRIAL BRIEF, EXHIBIT/WITNESS LISTS, DEPO DESIGNATIONS; RW ZINNER'S PROPOSED AMENDED PLEADING; T/C W/PLUNKETT RE: REVISING DAMAGES CHARTS FOR BRIEF	MEF	7.80	_ 3,705.00 -
05/06/0!	THE THE TOTAL PROTUNTATION . T/C	MEF	8.80	4,180.00

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MAY 15	5, 2005		
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES TELLES	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
T/C W/GROSS RE: ORDER FOR USE OF VIDEO; RW NEW EXHIBITS DESIGNATED BY COLUMBUS FINAL TRIAL DOCUMENT REVIEW; ALL DAY PREPARATION WITH V. STELLIO; FINALIZE PRE-TRIAL SUBMISSIONS; SCHEDULING ISSUES FOR D.J. TRUMP	YDS	7.00	3,325.00 .
PREPARATION; ADDRESSING PURCHASE AGREEMENT INFORMATION. 05/06/05 ASSIST WITH TRIAL PREPARATIONS; COMPILE AND ORGANIZE TRIAL DOCUMENTS FOR SERVICE AND FILING	LM	9.10	1,501.50
WITH COURT; COMPILE BINDER OF EXHIBITS FOR COUNSEL TO REVIEW. ORGANIZE PLAINTIFF TRIAL EXHIBITS; ASSIST WITH WITNESS		3.50	962.50
ACCOUNTED TO THE PREPARATION TO	ERH		
PRE-TRIAL ORDER/SUBMISSION	MEF	.1.10	522.50
05/07/05 SITE VISIT TO TROMP NATIONAL W/CHRIS HANZLIK IN PREP FOR TRIAL 05/09/05 ASSIST WITH WITNESS PREPARATION; COMPILE WITNESS BINDERS FOR	LM L.	8.00	1,320.00
CAROLYN KEPCHER AND DONALD IRONAL COMPILE AND ORGANIZE PLAINTIFF'S TRIAL EXHIBITS. 05/09/05 CAROLYN KEPCHER PREPARATION; REVISIONS TO V. STELLIO OUTLINE; ADDRESSING COLUMBUS PRE-TRIAL DISCLOSURES AND WITNESS	YDS	3.50	1,662.50.
PREPARATION. 05/09/05 DRAFT TRIAL SUBPOENAS/TRIAL PRE	P ERH	· 2.00 9.60	4,560.00
WORK ON GROGG OUTLINE; PREP GROW	30	7.00	
AT HIS OFFICE; RW TRIAL MENO BI COLUMBUS, COLUMBUS, WITNESS LIS	T;		
PAYMENT TO SUBCONTRACTORS CLAIM 05/10/05 ASSIST WITH TRIAL PREPARATIONS; COMPILE PLAINTIFF'S EXHIBITS TO EXCHANGE WITH ADVERSARY; COMPIL)	8.10	1,336.50
EXCITATION OF THE EXHIBIT BINDERS FOR JUDGE; ORGANIZE DEFENDANT'S NEW EXHIBITED OF THE COLUMN OF TH		2.00	950.00

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DROFESSIO	NAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MAY 15	, 2005		•
on Thomas		ATTORNEÝ	HOURS	VALUE ·
•	EPCHER: ADDRESSING ISSUES OF DDRESSING ISSUES OF J. DELANO'S			
	DEATH. ADDRESS COLUMBUS ISSUES FROM PRE-TRIAL SUBMISSIONS,	MEF	9.90	4,702.50
	RW COLUMBUS' OPPOSITION TO OUR MOTIONS IN LIMINE; REVISE Q&A OUTLINES FOR			·
05/11/05	HELMES & GROGG CALL WITH V. STELLIO AND R. FHOMPSON: PREPARATION SESSION	. YDS	3.50	1,662.50
1	WITH D.J. TRUMP; PREPARATION WITH C. DETHOMAS; UPDATE DETHOMAS PREPARATION.			4,845.00
05/11/05	DRF REPLIES TO OUR MOTIONS IN LIMINE; REVISIONS TO OUR EXHIBIT LIST; PREP SESSION W/GROGG	MEF	10.20	
/33 /05	ASSIST WITH TRIAL PREPARATIONS	ΓW	7.30	1,204.50
	TRIAL EXHIBITS TO EXCHANGE WITH ADVERSARY; UPDATE DEMONSTRATIVE EXHIBITS.		9.30	4,417.50
05/12/05	PREP FOR HELMES; T/C W/THE JUDGE RE: MTG W/YDS RE: PREP OF EARTHWORK CONTRACT CONDITIONS SHEET FOR YDS	MEF	3.30	
05/12/05	OPENING STATEMENT RESEARCH RE:	ERH	2.80	770.00
05/12/05	ASSIST WITH TRIAL PREPARATIONS; COMPILE AND PREPARE TRIAL EXHIBITS; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S	. 'LM	6.80	1,122.00
. 05/12/05	EXHIBIT BINDERS. PREPARATION FOR MEETING WITH V. STELLIO TRIAL OUTLINE; REVIEW REPLY ON MOTIONS IN LIMINE;	YDS	2.00	950.00
05/13/05	CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT RE PREP OF HELMES; NEGOTIATE ADMISSIBILITY OF EXHIBITS W/ZINNER; NEW CHART FOR GROGG	MEF	8.80	4,180.00
05/13/05	DIRECT	ERH	1.00	275.00

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 06/09/05 INVOICE # 128136

FOR PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF MAY 15	, 2005		
		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUĘ
05/13/05 05/13/05	PREPARATION OF V. STELLIO. ASSIST WITH TRIAL PREPARATIONS;	YDS LM	6.50 6.20	3,087.50 1,023.00
05/15/05	UPDATE EXHIBIT LISTS AND EXHIBITS; COMPILE TRIAL MATERIALS. COMPILE AND ORGANIZE TRIAL MATERIALS; FINALIZE TRIAL	LM	9.00	1,485.00
	EXHIBITS AND EXHIBIT LIST. COMPILE WITNESS BINDERS; UPDATE JUDGES BINDERS WITH UPDATED			
. 05/15/05	EXHIBITS. MTG W/GROGG FOR LAST PREP SESSION; T/C W/LM RE: ADDRESS POINTS FOR OPENING	MEF	8.50	4,037.50
05/15/05	STATEMENT PREPARE OPENING ARGUMENT FOR	YDS .	3.00	1,425.00
05/15/05	TRIAL. PREP FOR TRIAL- FIRST WITNESS - GROGG	MEF	7.20	3,420.00
	TOTAL FEES SERVICES		\$	87,097.00
	TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR TH	IS PERIOD	\$	87,097.00

THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 06/10/05 INVOICE # 128155

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIC NUMBER 13-3205994

				•
- PROPERCET	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 8,	2005		
OK PROFESSI		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	ODENING	YDS	7.00	3,325.00
00/ /	FIRST DAY OF TRIAL; OPENING STATEMENT; S. GROGG WITNESS. TRIAL AND PREP FOR FOLLOWING DAY	MEF	10.70	5,082.50
05/16/05	TOT TONTO C C	LM	9.60	1,584.00
05/16/05	COMPILE AND ORGANIZE TRIAL BOXES FOR COURT; SET UP TRIAL BOXES AT COURT; ATTEND AND ASSIST AT			
•	TRIAL; COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR		•	
	GROGG RE-DIRECT. TRIAL AND PREP FOR FOLLOWING DAY	MEF	11.20	5,320.00 99.00
05/17/05 05/17/05	COMPILE AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS	LM	0.60	99.00
	QUESTIONS THAT ARISE FROM TRIAL.	YDS	10.00	4,750.00
05/17/05	DIRECT, CROSS AND REDIRECT; START STELLIO DIRECT; REVISE STELLIO		·	
	DTRECT.	$ exttt{TPM}$	2.40	. 60.00
05/18/05	TOTAL PATTORNOE CHART.	YDS	7.00	3,325.00
05/18/05	5 % TO DUTE 1 K A 1 - D L L L L L L L L L L L L L L L L L L	MEF	9.30	4,417.50
05/18/05 05/18/05	TRIAL AND PREP FOR POLICY ARISE	LM	1.20	198.00
	FROM TRIAL; COORDINATE WITHESSES.	TPM	1.20	30.00
05/19/05 05/19/05	TOTAL DAY FOUR - REPCHER	YDS	7.00	3,325.00
03/12/02	OFFICE AND CROSS.	MEF	9.70	4,607.50
05/19/05 05/19/05	TRIAL AND PREP FOR FOLLOWING DATE	LM	2.40	396.00
03/ 12/ 01	FOR COINSEL TO REVIEW; RESPOND TO			_
	ATTORNEY REQUESTS FROM TRIAL.	MEF	5.20	2,470.00
05/20/0	5 TRIAL AND TRIAL PREP	YDS	4.00	1,900.00
05/20/0	c TRIAL DAY FIVE - SIMULTO SITURE,			
	KEPCHER DIRECT AND CROSS; TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. TRUMP;			
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. TROMP			

· "本意思想"。

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

FOR PROFESSI	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 8	2005		
•		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
03/2-/	UPDATE BINDER OF TRIAL TRANSCRIPTS FOR COUNSEL TO	LM	2.50	412.50
	REVIEW; COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR COUNSELS REVIEW, RE:		•	
	ORGANIZE COURT REPORTER FOR UPCOMING	•		·
05/21/05	DEPOSITION. RESEARCH RE	· ERH	5.00	1,375.00
05/22/05	PREPARATION WITH D. TRUMP; ADDITIONAL PREPARATION.	YDS	1.00	475.00
	The second secon	MEF	6.50	3,087.50
00/ =-	PREP AND TRIAL ,	MEF	8.90	4,227.50
05/23/05	TRIAL DAY 6 - C. DETHOMAS; PHIL	YDS	7.00	3,325.00
05/23/05	HELMS, D. TRUMP; MEETING WITH A. STARK RE TESTIFYING.		•	
05/23/05	PREPARE DAMAGES CHART FOR TRIAL EXHIBIT	LM	1.30	214.50
05/24/05	CHART WITH ADMITTED EXHIBITS. REVISING EXHIBIT BOARDS; PREPPING HELMES; T/C W/ZINNER RE: ADD'L	MEF	10.70	5,082.50
	TRUMP WITNESS; RW TRIAL TRANSCRIPT AND TAB FOR USE WITH LATER WITNESSES; REVISING HELMES OUTLINE			
05/24/05	UPDATE TRIAL TRANSCRIPTS AND LOAD ONTO SUMMATION FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW; UPDATE DAMAGE CHARTS FOR	LM	6.80	1,122.00
	TRIAL EXHIBITS; ATTENDED TO ATTORNEY REQUEST REGARDING TRIAL MATTERS; COMPILE NEW TRIAL			
05/24/05	EXHIBITS. SEARCH DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS FOR MATERIALS REQUESTED BY COUNSEL	ERH	5.50	1,512.50
05/24/05	FROM COURT AND PROVIDE RESPONSES STRATEGY FOR P. HELMS TESTIMONY AND ADJUSTMENTS.	YDS	1.00	475.00
05/25/05	TRIAL; CONFER DIRECTED VERDICT ISSUES FOR RESEARCH	MEF	9.20	4,370.00
05/25/05	TRIAL DAY SEVEN - P. HELMS DIRECT AND CROSS.	YDS	7.00	3,325.00
05/25/05	TOTAL PRINTING DEPOCTOR	ERH	10.50	2,887.50

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

	NAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 8	, 2005 .		
OR PROFESSIO	NAL SERVICES REPOSITE	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
05/25/05 P	ATTEND TRIAL AND ORGANIZE TRIAL	LM ·	7.70	1,270.50
7	MATERIALS; RESPOND TO ATTORNEY PRIAL REQUESTS. PREP FOR TRIAL; PREP FOR AND TAKE DEPOSITION OF PETRILLO RE	MEF	9.20	4,370.00
	PREPARATION OF A. STARK; PREPARE DESIGNATIONS OF DEPOSITION	YDS	7.00	3,325.00
	TESTIMONY TO SUPPLEMENT DIRECT			
	ANTICIPATED MOTION FOR A DIRECTED VERDICT BY REVIEWING TRIAL; RECORD AND ADDRESSING LEGAL			
05/26/05	ISSUES AND LEGAL RESEARCH. RESEARCH RE	ERH	12.60	. 3,465.00
05/26/05	COMPILE AND ORGANIZE DEPOSITION	LM	7.00	1,155.00
327	DESIGNATIONS; UPDATE TRIAL TRANSCRIPTS AND EVIDENCE LIST; RESPOND TO ATTORNEY REQUESTS			
•	REGARDING TRIAL AND DEPOSITION PREPARATIONS.	, , ,	4.00	1,900.00
05/27/05	TRIAL DAY EIGHT - A. STARK, ADMISSIONS, DEPOSITION DESIGNATIONS; MOTIONS FOR DIRECTED VERDICT; ADDRESSING ADDITIONAL ISSUES RAISED BY	YDS	4.00	
	LIBERTY MUTUAL.	MEF	4.20	1,995.00
05/27/05 05/27/05	TRIAL TRIAL PREP; REVIEW DEPOSITION TESTIMONY ON LOST PROFITS FOR	ERH	2.00	550.00
. 05/27/05	CROSS EXAMINATION COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR COUNSEL TO REVIEW FOR TRIAL; LOAD TRANSCRIPTS ONTO SUMMATION; FOR REVIEW; RESPOND TO ATTORNEY	LM	0.80	132.00
05/28/05	REQUESTS FROM TRIAL. RESEARCH/DRAFT OPPOSITION TO	ERH	5.80	1,595.00
05/29/05	MOTION FOR DIRECTED VERDICT PREP FOR CROSS OF DEFENDANT	MEF	7.40	3,515.00
05/29/05	WITNESSES; GENERAL OUTLINES	YDS	1.00	475.00

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

•		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE .
(OPPOSITION TO LIBERTY'S MOTION			
05/29/05	FOR A DIRECTED VERDICT. REVISE OPPOSITION TO DIRECTED	ERH	1.80	495.00
03/2-1	TERRITOR MOTION .	MEF	6.80	3,230.00
05/30/05	PREP FOR CROSS OF GALLAGHER	YDS	2.50	1,187.50
110-	FINAL REVISION TO SUPPLEMENTAL			
	MEMO OF LAW IN OPPOSITION TO			
	LIBERTY'S MOTION FOR A DIRECTED		•	
	VERDICT; BEGIN PREPARATION FOR D.			
	PETRILLO CROSS; PROVIDE M. FLYNN WITH POTENTIAL CROSS-POINTS FOR			
	GALLAGHER; UPDATE MEMO TO M. LOKEY			- 252 00
	ASSIST AT TRIAL; ORGANIZE TRIAL	LM	8.20	1,353.00
05/31/05	EXHIBITS; RESPOND TO ATTORNEY			
	REQUESTS.			3,895.00
- / /05	TRIAL AND PREP, FOR NEXT DAY	MEF	8.20 · 7.00	3,325.00
05/31/05	TRIT DAY NINE - M. GALLACHER	YDS .	7.00	3,323.00
05/31/05	DIRECT AND CROSS; PREPARATION FOR			
	CROSS OF PETRILLO, WIDMAN AND			
	MICRO	YDS	7.00	3,325.00
06/01/05	TRIAL DAY TEN - M. GALLAGHER	100		
	CBOSS M DONNELL DIRECT THE			
	CROSS; G. WIDMAN DIRECT AND			
	CROSS; G. WIDHAN DIREPARATION FOR			
	PETRILLO CROSS. COMPILE TRIAL TRANSCRIPTS FOR	LM	0.70	115.50
06/01/05	ATTORNEY REVIEW AND UPDATE			
				4 370 00
	EVIDENCE. TRIAL REVIEW LIBERTY MULTI PAPERS	MEF	9.20	4,370.00
06/01/05	PRODUCED PURSUANT TO ADDITIONAL		•	
	GIRDOENA FOR DIRANTE CROSS.	_	7 00	3,325.00
100 /OF	TOTAL DAY ELEVEN - N. DURANTE	YDS	7.00	3,323.0-
06/02/03	DIDECT AND CRUSS; D. FEITCELL	•		
	DIRECT; MOTIONS ON EVIDENCE;	•		•
	NTORO CROSS-PREP.	MEF	8.30	3,942.50
06/02/05	TRIAL AND PREP FOR NEXT DAY	LM	2.60	429.00
06/02/05	· ILDUATE EALISENCE, COMPTINE	7.11.1		
	DOCUMENTS FOR COUNSEL TO RELY IN			
	FOR TRIAL.	LB	1.00	125.00
06/03/0	5 REVIEWED DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FOR			
•	MEMO: PREPARED DOCUMENTS FOR THEFE	MEF	5.60	2,660.00
06/03/0	5 WORK ON LOST PROFITS; REBUTTAL CASE; REVIEW GALLAGHER TRIAL			

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 8	, 2005		
FOR PROFESSION	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
OUTLINE: MT WITH GROGG RE			
	LM	5.60	924.00
06/03/05 REVIEW DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR			
Trust TOCOLNICION FOR ASSOCIATION			
RESPOND TO ATTORNEY REQUESTS FOR		•,	
TRIAL PREPARATIONS; UPDATE EXHIBIT LIST WITH ADMITTED			
EXHIBITS.		r r0	2,612.50
DETATLED CROSS FOR D.	YDS	5.50	2,012.00
DETENTIO: PREPARE DETAILED CROSS			
OF AUGTE NIGRO; INTERVIEW D.		•	
GRADION AS POTENTIAL REBUTTAL			
WITNESS; ADDRESS POTENTIAL ISSUES			
FOR V. STELLIO REBUTTAL.	MEF	4.40	2,090.00
06/05/05 RW DRAFT NIGRO AND PETRILLO CROSSES; TCONF. WITH YDS RE			•
THE CONTRACT TO RESIDENCE IN CONTROLS	•		
DATLY TIX AND SPECTRUM FIELD LOGS			•
BE VARTOUS ITEMS FROM EX 39			•
(SIMMARY OF TRUCK TIX) FOR			
POGGIETA TISE ON CROSS OF			•
PETRILLO; TRW SPUNKY DOCS FOR			
POTENTIAL USE ON REBUTTAL O6/05/05 CONFERENCE WITH M. FLYNN RE	YDS	0.50	237.50
06/05/05 CONFERENCE WITH M. FILMN RE	3		
PREPARE FOR COURT.		7.00	3,325.00
DAY - PETRILLO CROSS,	YDS	7.00	5,525.00
COLUMBIS EXPERT DIRECT AND CROSS,			•
TIGE DIRECT AND CROSS, MOTION			
FOR DIRECTED VERDICT OF STELLIO			
REBUTTAL DIRECT AND CROSS; SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE WITH COURT	•		
	MEF	7.60	3,610.00 1,303.50
	TW ·	7.90	1,303.50
FOR CROSS MOTION; ASSIST AT	· -		•
TRIAL; RESPOND TO ATTORNEY	٠		
PECTESTS.	MEF	5.40	2,565.00
TARKOL PREPARE GROGG DIRECT, PREP WITH	LIME		
CPOCG EXHIBITS; RW DEDANG			•
TRANSCRIPT FOR POTENTIAL			==0 ==0
DESIGNATIONS 06/07/05 PREPARE STATUS MEMO TO M. LOKEY;	, YDS	1.50	712.50
MEET WITH CLIENT.		2 20	511.50
06/07/05 COMPILE TRANSCRIPTS FOR COUNSEL	IJM	3.10	344.00
00/01/05			

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

FOR PROFESS	IONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 8	, 2005	HOURS	VALUE
06/08/05	TO REVIEW; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PHIL HELMES; PREPARE COVER PAGES FOR DEPOSITION TESTIMONY; ORGANIZE PICK UP OF MATERIALS FROM COURT. TRAVEL TO AND FROM COURT TO PICK UP TRIAL MATERIALS; COMPILE AND	 LM	. 4.40	726.00
06/08/05 06/08/05	ORGANIZE TRIAL MATERIALS IN WITNESS ROOM. PREPARE AND FINAL TRIAL DAY	MEF YDS	3.50 2.20	1,662.50 1,045.00
	TOTAL FEES SERVICES		\$	149,631.00
	TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR TH	IS PERIOD	\$	149,631.00
- ·	***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRE	ENT SERVICES	ONLY ****	

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 06/10/05 INVOICE # 128156

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIC NUMBER 13-3205994

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF JUNE 8, 2005

DISBURSEMENTS:	VALUE
MEALS TRAVEL TELEPHONE/FACSIMILE PHOTOCOPYING MAIL MESSENGER OVERTIME SERVICE OF PROCESS FEES STORAGE COSTS DATABASE SEARCH COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH	70.71 124.95 288.98 6,927.00 515.28 218.50 501.77 375.00 25.30 1,307.03 28.87
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS\$	10,383.39
TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$	10,383.39
	*c

***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION . TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/16/05 INVOICE # 130947

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13-3205994

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF AUGUS	T 31, 2005		
OK FROI BODDE	ATTORNEY.	HOURS	VALUE
06/02/05 CONFS. MEF RE:	DAP	0.30	130.50
OV CONTROL ON	LM	3.80	627,00
10AD TRIAL TRANSCRIPTS ON SUMMATION; COMPILE ORIGINAL TRIAL TRANSCRIPT FOR CASE FILE; COMPILE TRIAL TRANSCRIPTS FOR COUNSEL TO REVIEW; ORGANIZE TRIAL MATERIALS FOR CASE FILE. 106/13/05 UPDATE ADMITTED EXHIBIT CHART; ORGANIZE TRIAL MATERIALS; COMPILE	LM	3.10	511.50
ORGANIZE TRIAL MATERIALS, CONTROL TRIAL TRANSCRIPTS FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW. 06/14/05 BEGIN WORK ON POST-TRIAL PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS	·	4.90	2,327.50
OF LAW - OUTLINE 06/15/05 WORK ON POST-TRIAL FACT PORTION	· MEF	3.80	1,805.00
OF SUBMISSION	JL	0.40	200.00
06/16/05 AUDIT LETTER REVIEW.	LM	0.50	82.50
06/17/05 RE-ORGANIZE TRIAL EXHIBITS IN PREPARATION OF POST TRIAL BRIEF.	MEF	3.70	1,757.50
	. LB	0.20	25.00
06/23/05 CASE MANAGEMENT 06/27/05 WORK ON POST-TRIAL SUBMISSIONS	MEF	4.80	2,280.00
	MEF	4,20	1,995.00
06/30/05 WORK ON POST-TRIAL BRIEF - LAW	. MEF	2.70	1,282.50
PORTIÓN	MEF	6.60	3,135.00
07/07/05 WORKING ON POST-TRIAL BRIEF .	MEF.	3.80	1,805.00
07/11/05 WORK ON POST-TRIAL BRIEF	MEF	2.60	1,235.00
07/12/05 WORK ON POST-TRIAL BRIEF	MEF	5.60	2,660.00
07/12/05 DRAFTING FINDINGS OF FACT 07/14/05 DRAFTING FINDINGS OF FACT; RW	MEF	6.20	2,945.00
TRANSCRIPT CITES FOR SAME 07/14/05 RESEARCH RE:	DAP	0.70	304.50
07/15/05 RESEARCH RE:	DAP	3.60	1,566.00

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION . TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

- PROFFICET/	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF AUGUST	31, 2005	•	-
OK AKOREPPI		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
07/15/05	COMPLETING TRANSCRIPT CITATIONS TO POST-TRIAL BRIEF; DRAFT LAW	MEF	7.70	3,657.50
	TO POST-IRIAN ERITA,		6.60	3,135.00
	DEUTCE POST-TRIAL BRIEF	MEF	6.70	3,182.50
	TITLE POST-TRIAL BRIEF	MEF	3.80	1,805.00
07/17/05 07/18/05	REVISING POST-TRIAL BRIEF FOR	MEF	3.00	 , -
0.1/ 18/ 02		YDS .	0.30	142.50
07/18/05	MODETIC ON POST-TRIAL SUBMISSION.	LM	2.40	396.00
07/18/03	COMPILE TRIAL EXHIBITS FOR COUNSEL TO REVIEW; CITE CHECK	. TIM	, 2 ,12	
07/19/05	POST TRIAL BRIEF. WORKING ON POST-TRIAL BRIEF;	MEF	4.20	1,995.00
07/19/05	FINALIZE REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT POST	YDS	1.30	617.50
	TRIAL SUBMISSION. INCORPORATING	MEF	3.80	1,805.00
07/20/05	ADDING TRANSCRIPT AND			:
	EVUTETT CTTES	T 14	6.80	1,122.00
07/20/05	GIRE CURCK POST TRIAL BRIEF.	LM YDS	1.00	475.00
07/20/05	WORKING AND COMMENTING ON POST	100		
01/20/02	TRIAL SUBMISSION.	LB	0.10	12.50
07/21/05	PRITERIED DOCKET		1.00	475.00
07/21/05	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT, INC.		2.10	346.50
07/21/05	DOCT-TOTAL BRIEF.	YDS.	0.50	237.50
07/22/05		100.		•
07/22/05	COURT.	. LB	0.60	75.00
0 // 22/ 0-	SERVICE AND FILING IN WESTCHESTER; DOCKETING AND CASE		,•	
07/22/0	MANAGEMENT 5 COMPILE AND PREPARE DOCUMENT FOR	LM	0.80	132.00
0 / / 22/	CERUTCE AND FILING.	LB	0.20	25.00
07/25/0	- DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT	YDS	0.50	237.50
07/25/0	5 REVIEW COLUMBUS POTENTIAL	100		
	OTTOMT CCT (N)	LM	1.60	264.00
07/25/0	505MISSION. 5 FOLLOW UP WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL, 65 FOLLOW UP WITH DEFENSE CONGANIZE			
•	RE: POST TRIAL BRIEFS; ORGINIZATION			
07/25/0	CASE FILE FOR RECORDS. SOURCE ON RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT'S	MEF	4.40	2,090.00

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

FOR PROFESSI	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF AUGUST	31, 2005		
Fore 2200		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
	POST-TRIAL SUBMISSIONS.			
07/27/05	WORK ON DRAFT OF REPLY PAPERS	MEF	3.30	1,567.50
07/28/05	LEGAL ARGUMENT. WORK ON DRAFT REPLY PAPERS -	MEF	4.90	2,327.50
01/20/	FACTUAL CONTENTIONS.	LB .	0.10	12.50
08/01/05	CASE MANAGEMENT	LB	0.20	25.00
08/03/05	OBTAINED JUDGE INFORMATION; ADJOURNED DATES FOR BRIEFS	200		
1 105	T/C W/FARELLY (JUDGE'S LAW	MEF	0.10	47.50
08/03/05	SECRETARY) AND OPPOSING COUNSEL ZINNER		•	
//	WORKING ON REPLY MEMORANDUM	MEF	6.BÒ	3,230.00
08/08/05 08/09/05	WORKING ON REPLY MEMORANDUM	MEF	5.30	2,517.50
08/09/05	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON POST TRIAL	YDS .	0.70	332.50
08/ 10/ 02	REPLY BRIEF.		E E O	3,657.50
08/10/05	WORKING ON REPLY MEMORANDUM;	MEF	7.70	3,057.50
00/ 20/	COMPLETE DRAFT, FILL IN ALL	•		
•	RECORD CITES TO TRANSCRIPT, ADD'L			
	CASE LAW ON			
	TC WITH DFT COUNSEL RE	LB .	0.20	25.00
08/11/05	TC WITH DFT COUNSEL AND CASE			
	MANAGEMENT; ADJOURNED DATES			
20/77/05	. DOLLA	LM	1.80	297.00
08/11/05 08/11/05		YDS	0.50	237.50
08/11/05	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	MEF	1.50	712.50
08/11/05	SIGN-OFF FOR FILING; T/C			•
	W/ADVERSARY'S OFFICE RE: THEIR		•	
	REQUEST FOR AN EXTENSION	7.50	0.20	25.00 ·
08/12/05	TC WITH DFT COUNSEL RE LETTER TO	LB	0.20	2010
•	JUDGE'S CLERK; DOCKETING AND CASE			
•	MANAGEMENT	LB	0.30	37.50
08/19/05	REVIEWED REPLY BRIEF; ARRANGED	יונינ		
	FOR FILING IN WESTCHESTER SUPREME	LB	0.20	25.00
08/22/05	DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT			
	TOTAL FEES SERVICES		.\$	63,979.50
				•
DTCR	URSEMENTS:			VALUE
D100	•		1	156.70
MEALS				150.70

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 09/16/05 INVOICE # 130947

TIOE	PROFESSIONAL	SERVICES	RENDERED	AS	OF	AUGUST	31,	2005	
------	--------------	----------	----------	----	----	--------	-----	------	--

DISBURSEMENTS:	VALUE
TRAVEL TELEPHONE/FACSIMILE DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION SERVICES MAIL MESSENGER OVERTIME SERVICE OF PROCESS FEES DATABASE SEARCH COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH	2,147.25 59.78 1,106.13 207.14 808.50 1,531.62 1,160.00 8,603.55 68.27
	•
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS\$	15,848.94
TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$	79,828.44

***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 10/31/05 INVOICE # 131946

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13-3205994

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF SEPTEMBER 30, 2005

DISBURSEMENTS:	VALUE
OVERTIME COURT REPORTER SERVICES SERVICE OF PROCESS FEES STORAGE COSTS DATABASE SEARCH COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH	86.56 38.25 135.00 57.75 327.56 49.73
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS\$	694.85
TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$	694.85

***** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 11/09/05 INVOICE # 132351

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIC NUMBER 13-3205994

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF OCTOBER 31, 2005

DISBURSEMENTS:	VALUE
MESSENGER COMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH	17.50 29.10
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS\$	46.60
TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIOD\$	46.60
***** TUTE DILL TE BOD CHERRYT SERVICES ONLY ****	

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIADCLIEF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 01/27/06: INVOICE: # 134419

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
725 FIFTH AVENUE
NEW YORK, NY 10022

AXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NIMBER 13=3205994

		marian and a mariant and the second		•						
or professi	ional:	BERVICES R	endered as	OF DECE	VBER	31, 2005 TOPNEY	ho <u>ur</u>		VALUE:	
ŗ «				Ťvři ŽNŤ).	4天正	LB.	Ó . 4	•	50,00	-, 4-6 -, 1
11/08/05.	CASE	ewed verdic Managemen	CALENDAL	DATES		ERH	. Ö., Ş	. <u>Ö</u> .	2 <u>2</u> 0.00	
11/08/05		ARCH (S	TONFEREI	NCE CALL	i	YDŠ	<u>1</u> .¢)·Q,	475.00	
		EW DECISION CLIENT AND YZE DECISION		FÖLLÖW: UE		MEH.	<u>1</u> , <u>9</u>	0	902.50	
11/08/05	ANA					* · · ; ,				
11/09/05	DE	ERW GORANESE	ONDANCE AND			ERE.	l.	20 90	330.00 522,50	
11/11/05		ZWARIE Z				<u>MEB</u>	<u> </u>	20	1,045.00	
11/11/05						KDS.	, : Ō.:	60	285 00	
11/11/05	2 77,713	EPHONE CAL EPHONE CAL TEW BILLIN	N WITH DOW.	I RUMP From the		ERE	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	. 50	687.50	
11/11/0	1 1 1 1 T KTT	// EW CORRES /OICES AND	RITUD TURKER	tenging the state of the state		LM wer:	(<u>)</u> (<u>)</u> () ()	. 50 	82.50 1.045.00	· · ·
11/14/0	5 T/(Z, W/E/ HOLI	Z.RE.			THE PARTY OF THE P				
		personal de la companya de la compan	<u>ir</u>				•		,* 68 65	
11/14/0)5				67 4 - 1 14 -	YDS.) <u>.</u> Z (0	95., 66.	
	75		THE REAL PROPERTY.		•				•	

016035

THE TRUME ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLE V. COLUMBUS

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERV	ices rendered as of decemb	ER 31, 2005 ATTORNEY	HOURS	VĄTUE,
11/14/05 RESEARCH		ERI	<u>8.26</u>	Z,255,00
11/15/05 11/15/05 TELEPHON CALL WIT	E CASE WEITH D CARBONE; E WOLF AND SAMPSON	ERE Viis	11:80 1:06	3,245,00 475,00
COUNSELL		YDS	<u> </u>	285.00
11/15/05/	PRINCE AND ADDRESS OF THE PRINCE AND ADDRESS	YDS	<u>0,60</u>	285.00
11/15/05	RETURNO CASE HISTORY	SPM:	0.20	24.00
11/16/05 FORWARD	KET AND CASE HISTORY, FOR ATTORNEY REVIEW:	ERI	9.30	2 ₁ 557:50
11/16/05 COMPILE	DATES OF MOTION PRACTICE OSITIONS, RE: ATTORNEYS		1.40	231-20
AND DEP FEES 11/05 T/C W/Y		MEE,	<u> </u>	95 _: 00.
	BILLS AND SEPARATE INTO		9.20: 2.10	2,530:00 345:50
11/17/05		VEC.	<i>6.</i> 90 :	3 ₇ 277.50
			·	et.
11/17/05	TING WITH D	YDS:	0 : 4 <u>0</u> . · · ·	190.00
CARBON CARBON MTG W/ FINAN	CUNSEL FOR COLUMBUS RE: CLAL CONDITION OF COLUMBUS; CUMENTS PROVIDED BY COLUMBU	ie Meb	<u>5</u> .60	2,65 5 .00

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

FOR PROFESSIONAL	SERVICES REN	DERED AS OF DECE	MBER 31, 2005	HOURS	VALUE
(FINZ	MCIAL STATEM WITH D. CARB J. WESTHAUER,	ONE; A NIGRO REVIEW SS. WITH M	YDŚ	1.50	712:50
FINAL FLYN 17LYN 11/18/05	No. of the second secon		ERH	9 . 20	2,695.00
11/18/05			LM	1.60 4,60	264:00 759:00
	ingstrations with	建设	MEF.	0.70	332.50
11/21/05 AUT	esan elloy/fironesis Drney/45, federas	DNY TO RETRIEVE	SEM	1;30 7:20 7:20	25, 145, 100 25, 145, 100 13, 33, 02, 100
11/22/05	F11/40	W/YDS: RE:	ERE	12,20	3.359.00
11/22/05 EEV 11/22/05 REV	EEWED CATEENDA	REDATES.	<u>fi</u>	0.750	62.50
1.4 /93./ (15%) COM	PERE DOGUMEN	IS FOR ATTORNEY	IM.	0, 60	29:00
95/03/05 N	HELIVE AND	SDNY TO, DELIVER	SPM	1,00	120.00
11/22/05 PAI	pers tio couns	ET FOR REVIEW	TOS	2,50	1,187:50
11/23/05 11/23/05			ERII LB	<u>2.90</u> 6.46	797 <u>, 50</u> 50.00
主 中心 一 中 于 小 公 · ·					

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR ILIC V. COLUMBUS

DOD1	THE BRIDE BRIDE			
TOR PROFESSION	NAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF DECEME	ER 31, 2005	en e	
		ATTORNEY	HOURS	VARUE
		LM	2.70	445.50
11/23/05				
11/23/03		MER	<u> 6. 90</u>	3,277.50
		 		•
	Con-Principle (Con-Principle Con-Principle C			
11/23/05		<u>YDS</u>	1.80	855:00
11/25/55				is .
	Transpersion with the season of the season o		0,10	12.50
11/28/05/1 11/29/05/1	DOGGETTENG AND CASH MANAGENTEN!	MEE	3.80	1,805.00
	ONEGOTEATENS SCHEDULE W.SZ; T/C	A Court of the Court	and the second s	
	W. COURSE & SZ			
11 / 29 / 10 5 / 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10	CALLS FROM S ZINNER AND D	YDS	5.2 0	95.200
	GOLDSTEIN	LB	0.20	25.00
TT/ 57/ 85/		LM:	0.80	152.00
11/30/05				
11/30/05/	MIGAWAYDSARE	MEF	2.20	1,045,00
	R		4 BA	712.50
11/30/05	THE WEIGH ME ELYNN, REV	1DS	# # # # # # # # # # # # # # # # # # #	
		ERH	0.80	220.00
11/30/05 12/01/05	T/G W/S ZINNER RE 1 POST VERDICT	ERH MER	0.8 <u>6</u> 3.6 <u>9</u>	22 0: 0 0 1,710: 00
	MOTIONS; LIBERTY LIABILITY			and the state of t
	CORRESP W/CARBONE RE: ADD		•	·
	T/C W/S ZINNER RE POST VERDICT MOTIONS LIBERTY LIABILITY ISSUES: T/C W/YDS RE: CORRESP W/CARBONE RE: ADD/ FINANCIAL DUE DILIGENCE: T/C W/E HOLTZ RE:			

016036 0001

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION.
TROME BRIARCLIFE MANOR LLG V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 01/27/06 INVOICE # 134419:

	TO SERVICES RENDERED AS OF DECEME	ER 31, 2005		
EOB BROLESPINA		ATTORNEY	HÖÜRÉ	VALUE
		·jŢM.	Ø.80	400.00
12/01/05 12/01/05	A second	ERH	5 : 5 d	1,512.50
12/104/03		•		
12/01/05 ARE	SEARCH REG	MDĪ	3.20	1,024,00
12/01/05		YDS	0.50	237,50
12/02/05 RE	SHARCHARD	MŪĿ	1.30	415.00
12/02/05		<u>M</u> W	1.20	204.00
12/02/05		· jīm	0 - 70	350.00
* 12/02/05*: 1/3	WATER THOLTER RE-	<u>Mer</u>	0.50	237.50
12/02/05		WS:	0.20	95.00
12/05/05		ERM	<u> </u>	1 ₁ 815.00
12/05/05/ 12/05/05/		LB ERH	0 <u>- 1 0</u> 2 : 60	12:50 770.00
12/07/05		YDS	. 0.20	95.00
12/07/05		ERI	2.50	687.50
12/08/05/ TI 12/12/05/ T/ 12/14/05/ AI	CEPHONE CALL CS W/S ZINNER RE RANGED TO OBTAIN COMPLAINT FROM EW YORK SUPREME	TE MEE MOS	0 <u>. 1.0</u> 0 <u>. 20</u> 0 <u>. 20</u>	47.50 95.00 25.00
12/14/05	EW YORK SUPREME	MEE	4.40	2 7090100
12/15/05		SPM	0.40	48.00
12/15/05 12/15/05		ERII LM	2.8 <u>0</u> 1.60	770,00 264,00
12/15/05	MTG W/YDS;	?. . <u>. MEE</u>	4.30	Ż;Ö4Ź.5Ö

WorrsonCohenu

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

		පර්ලිසි 		
or professio	nati services rendered as of Decem	SER 31, 2005 ATTORNEY	HÖÜRS:	VÄLUE
	ETTLEMENT MTG W/CARBONE, MIGEO,		· ·	
7	CCOUNTANT; I/C W/E HOLTE RE			n news. 2015.
12/15/05. 7	OOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT : CALENDAR DATES SEARCHED FOR LIENS	<u>LB</u>	<u>1</u> .00	125.00
19 Se	ONLINE PARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING THE COLUMBUS, CONSTRUCTION,	YDS	3.80 3.80	1,805.00
12/16/05		YDS #	Ţ. ⁶ .Q.Ø.	<u>475 :</u> 00
. 12/16/05®		ERH	<u>3</u> .30	907.50
12/16/05	/CALLS WITH	<u>IM</u>	<u> </u>	132,00
		LB	<u> </u>	25.00
12/16/05 12/19/05		LB	<u>©.40</u>	50:00
12/22/05	MEET WITH DESTRUMP RE	YDS	<u>© . 60</u>	285,00
12/22/05 12/28/05	DOCKETING AND CALENDAR RE JUDGMENT AND ATTORNEYS FEES	LB SEM	0 <u>20</u> 0 <u>20</u>	25 : 00 24 : 00
12/29/05	MOTIONS: COMPILE AND DISTRIBUTE DEFENDANTS! OPPOSITION PAPERS TO COUNSEL FOR REVIEW COMPILE CASE	<u>IM</u>	<u>1</u>	2 <u>9</u> 7.00.
12/29/05	CTTED IN DEFENDANT'S MEMORANDOMS OF LAW AND CALENDARING RE	SPM	Ō. 3 <u>\$</u>	3 . 6.00
12/29/05	POST-TRIAL MOTIONS OF DAIL AND TELEPHONE RE SAME	ERI	- 1.80	495.00
		ř.		

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRIME BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 01/27/05 INVOICE # 134415

	VICES RENDERED AS OF	DECEMBER 3	1, 2005	. :	
FOR PROFESSIONAL SPA		ATT	ORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
12/29/05			Mer'	4.50	2,137,50
12/29/03			ydš	1.50	712:50
			ĪM		<u>132.00</u>
12/30/05 REVIEW C	ASE FILE FOR RESPONS E UPCOMING DATES	ES.			•
12/30/05			MET	7.80	3,705.00
12/30/05 EMANUS 1	co-counsel al Maria		ŞPM:	Ō.3Ō	3: 6. 00
					•
			ż	·	73 _z 240 - 00
	notal fees services	EMPRESSES SE	144 P 1 2 3 5 - F	;	VALOE
DISBURSEMENTS		. F . 45		•	35.00
MĒĀLS : # Trāveli			•		2 00 25,53
TELEPHONE/FACSIM DOCUMENT REPRODU	ILE ICTION SERVICES	ų			1,838,10 156.88
MAIL	See				17,50
Messenger Overtine	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	n halfa			144,27 139,85
STORAGE COSTS DATABASE SEARCE		••			1,440,30
	TRT DOCKET SEARCH	. Ý			2.0.4.23.
The Control of the Co		.•	•		
				#	2 25 6 3 6
	total disbursement		* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *		3,800.26
	TOTAL BALANCE DUE	FOR THIS P	ERIOD	. ĝ.	77,040.36

THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
TRUMP BRIARCLIEF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 02/09/06 INVOICE # 134865

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION
725 FIFTH AVENUE
NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATIO NUMBER 13-8205954

			<u> </u>			
for professio	nal serveces ren	dered as of di	ANUARY	31, 2005		10 To
)			· <u>}</u>	attorney	HOURS	VĀĻDĒ
01/03/06 R 01/03/06 R	EVIEWED DOCKET E	NTRIES		LB MEF	0 <u>.1</u> 0 5.60	12,50 2,800.00
01/04/06				MEF	5.40	2,700.00
01/05/05:				MED	ē _{.:} 20	3,100.00
01/06/06				MEF.	6 : 70	3,350.00
01/55/05				SM	4.70	1,292-50
01/06/06 D 01/08/06	OCKEPT NE ZAND CAS	F MANAGEMENT		LB. MER	0 1 <u>10</u> . 5 20	12,56 2,650.00
01/09/05/		JRH.		MER	5.80	2,900.00
01/09/05 R	ESEARCE RES	WDS		<u>ŠM</u>	4.60	1,255.00
01/09/08 E		YNN: RE		YDS	1.00	475.00
01/10/05				YDŞ	2.10	997.50

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFE MANOR ILC V. COLUMB FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF CANCARY 31, 2006 CONTINUE RESEARCH RE: S 432.00 2.40ΪM T/C W/YDS; F 3,150:00 6.30 MEE 25.00 0.20 LB. CASE MANAGEMENT TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. TRUMP AND 1,472.50 3.10 YDS 01/11/06 M LOKEY RE FA REVISE AS PER YDS /06 CITE CHECK MEMORANDUM OF LAW 2.20 ĽΜ̈́ PREPARE TABLE OF AUTHORITIES I MEMORANDUMS OF LAW, COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR SERVICE AND FILING REVIEWED CASE INFO 0.10 01/12/06 FINALIZE MEMO, TO N. NELSON RE 0 : 20: 01/13/06 01/17/06 DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT OPDATED CALENDAR DATES 01/17/06 CASE MANAGEMENT RW REPLY PAPERS FROM LIBERTY AND 01/19/DB: 01/19/06 COLUMBUS: AND RW COLUMBUS: REVIEW REPLY PAPERS OF COLUMBUS: AND LIBERTY MUTUAL ON MOTIONS TO 01/20/06-CORRECT VERDICT AND FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES DOCKETING AND CASE MANAGEMENT 25.00 0.2001/23/0£ 108.00 ORGANIZE AND PREPARE CASE FILE. 0.60 01/23/06

WorrisonCohena

015538 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS DATE: 02/05/05 INVOICE # 134865

AGD OPOTESSIONAL SERVICES	RENDERED AS OF JANUAI	¥ 31, 2006		
ON PAST HERE		ATTORNEY	HÖURS	VALUE .
01/23/06 RW REPLV PAPE	RS) P	MEF	<u>i. 10</u>	550.00
01/21/06 Ar		MEF	<u> </u>	250.00
01/25/65 CASE MANAGEME 01/26/66 CASE MANAGEME	DE-MATE W/YDS	<u>Le</u> Le	` @: 10 @: 10	12.50 12.50
TOTZ	E FEES SERVICES	,是是李章的的第三人称: **	÷;	33,859,50
. Disbursements :	₹			<u> VALUE</u>
MEALS TRAVEL DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION MATL OVERTIME SERVICE OF PROCESS FE COURT FILING & MISC F DATABASE SEARCE COMPUTERIZED COURT DO	SERVICES ES EES * CKET SEARCH	eq - -		17.50 23.48 397.80 48.51.10 484.70 484.00 2,001.37
	AL DISEURSEMENTS". (AL BALANCE DUE FOR TE			3,460:05 37,319:56

**** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****

٠ نځ ،

WorrisonCo

016036 0001

DATE: 03/08/08: INVOICE # 135741

7.X ..

TRUME BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLG V. COLUMBUS
THE TRUME ORGANIZATION
725 FIFTE AVENUE
NEW YORK, NY 10022

4,570.50

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF FEBRUA	RY 28, 2006		
	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
02/06/06 T/C W/S/ ZINNER & COURT RE: SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE; MTC W/YDS	MEF .	Q: , 9 Q:	450.00
02/06/06 CASE MANAGEMENT 02/08/06 CALENDAR CONFERENCE DATE 02/08/06 MEET WITH M FLYNN RE 16	<u>l.B.</u> Le YDS	0 : 10 0 : 10 0 : 50	12,50 12,50 237:50
CALD WITH DE TRUMP RA			
02/15/06. RW.LTR FROM LIBERTY, E-MAIL YDS	MEF	<u> </u>	150.00
02/16/06 COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR HEARING 02/16/06	<u>im</u> Tos	0 <u>10</u> 0 <u>15</u>	18,00 237,50
02/17/06 CONFERENCE W/COURT	MEF .	3.20	1,600.00
02/17/06 IN COURT APPEARANCE FOR COURT ORDERED SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE.	<u>YD</u> S	2,50	1,187.50
02/21/06 PREPARE AND TRANSMIT MEMO TO CLIENT RE	YDS	<u>1.10</u>	522:50
FOLLOW UP CALE WITH DETRUMP AND M. LOKEY; CALL TO ME LOKEY; CALLS TO S. ZINNER; CALL WITH COURT RE			
SETTLEMENT POSTURE; 02/23/06 CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE; RUDOLF'S SECRETARY; CALL WITH S. ZINNER; CALL WITH COURT.	VDS	· 6:36	142 _: 56
		•	

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLG V. COLUMBUS DATE: 03/08/06 INVOICE # 135741

	•
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF FEBRUARY 28, 2006	
DISBURSEMENTS:	VALUE VALUE
TRAVEL TELEPHONE FACSINILE DECLINENT REPRODUCTION SERVICES MAIL SERVICE OF PROCESS FEES STORAGE COSTS DATABASE SEARCH GOMPUTERIZED COURT DOCKET SEARCH	42.00 24.20 5.00 5.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 5.10 5.20 5.20 5.20
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	5,929.04
TOTAL BALANCE DUE FOR THIS PERIODS ****** THIS BILL IS FOR CURRENT SERVICES ONLY *****	10,499,54

016036

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLG V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 04/14/06: INVOICE # 126753

THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK: NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13 = 3265994

	*** ** ******* ** *** *** *************	
11, 2006		
ATTORNEY	HCURS	VALUE .
YDS	Ø.10	47.50
YDS	Q : 2Q	95.00
MER	Q. <u>.</u> 4. Q.	<u> </u>
LB	<u>0</u> . <u>1</u> 0	12.50
१. १.२६६२ <i>१</i> ६६५५		355.00
	· ,	VALUE
•		21.0 <u>0</u>
		4,01 55,55 29,89
	· .	
FREERFEFF		110.45
PERIOD: : . ;		465,45
	YDS YDS MEF	ATTORNEY HOURS YDS 0.10 YDS 0.20 MEF 0.40 LB 0.10

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS DATE: 05/05/06 INVOICE # 157426

THE TRUME ORGANIZATION 725 FIFTH AVENUE NEW YORK, NY 10022

TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13-3205994

and the state of t			** ** *** *** *** *** *** * * * * * * *
or professional services rendered as of Abr	IL 30, 2006		
	ATTORNEY	HOURS	Valije
04/07/06 RW LIB TO COURT BER YDS ***	vds	ğ.1ğ.	50 200 47:50
	•		
TOTAL FEES SERVICES	B-646666666666666		97.50
disedrsements: Thirphone/facsimile		Maria de	V XI.UE g. 60
DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION SERVICES SEARCH FEED COURT DOCKET SEARCH			30:25 253:77
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: : : :	TREFFERENCES		326 D5
total balance due for t	HIS PERIOD		423:55
***** TPTE BITA TO ROR CURB	rent services o	NLV exere	

MORRISON COHEN SINGER & WEINSTEIN, LLP

016036 0001 THE TRUMP ORGANIZATION TRUMP BRIARCLIFF MANOR LLC V. COLUMBUS

DATE: 01/22/03 INVOICE # 106251

	ONAL SERVICES RENDERED AS OF DECEMBI	ATTORNEY	HOURS	VALUE
		•		
	FOR PICKETT DEPOSITION.			
11/27/02	DOCKET AND CALENDAR - E-MAIL OF	NF	0.10	10.00
	MB RE:			
[MD	3.10	930.00
	RECEIPT OF SUBSTITUTION OF	. MB	2.10	220.00
	COUNSEL; REVIEW OF DEPOSITION			
8	DOCUMENTS MARKED: FOLLOW IIP RE:			
E	FOLLOW UP RE;			•
!	OCS YDS AND TELEPHONE		·,	••
	CONFERENCE WITH INTECAP RE:			•
	TCS NEW ATTORNEY FOR COLUMBUS, TC			
	WITH COURT RE:			
8				
	REVIEWED ALL DOCUMENTS		•	•
_	SENT BY S. DIAZ FOR PRIVILEGED			
	AND UNRESPONSIVE DOCUMENTATION,			
	ARRANGED FOR BATES STAMPING &		•	
	ECXHANGE OF DOCUMENTS, EXCLUDED			
	UNRESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS DOCKET AND CALENDAR - E-MAIL OF	NF	0.10	10.00
12/02/02		212		
	MB RE:			
12/02/02	CONFERENCE CALL WITH INTECAP RE:	MB	1.00	300.00
12/02/02	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH			•
•	ATTORNEY ZINNER & COURT.			
12/02/02	WORK ON BOND APPLICATION MOTION:	YDS	0.20	80.00
	E-MAIL RE		2.00	000 00
12/03/02	MEETING WITH EXPERT AND FOLLOW UP	MB	3.00	900.00
•	WITH DOCUMENTS RE:			
	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH ATTORNEY AND	•		•
•	DRAFTED CORRESPONDENCE TO			
	ATTORNEY ZINNER RE: COUNTERCLAIMS. MEETING WITH POTENTIAL DELAY	YDS	1.00	400.00
12/03/02	DAMAGES EXPERTS.	100		
70/05/00	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES ;	MB	1.00	300.00
12/05/02	WITH INTECAP AND REVIEW OF	, .	×	
	PRELIMINARY PROPOSAL; REVIEW		•	
	ANALYSIS OF FURTHER	•	•	
	CORRESPONDENCE INTECAP.			
12/06/02	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES	MB	1.90	570.00
	WITH C. HANZLIK; TELEPHONE			
	CONFERENCE WITH INTECAP; REVIEW			
	ANALYSIS OF DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT			
	OF S. PICKETT; REVIEW INTECAP			
	PROPOSAL.	አለገን	0.50	150.00
12/09/02	REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF EXPERT	MB	0.50	250.00
	PROPOSAL AND TELEPHONE CALLS WITH	1		

....

4/9/2008 NYLJ 1, (col. 5) 4/9/2008 N.Y.L.J. 1, (col. 5) Page 1

New York Law Journal Volume 239 Copyright 2008 ALM Properties, Inc. All rights reserved. Wednesday, April 9, 2008 TRUMP COMPLAINS ABOUT FIRM'S FEES Anthony Lin

Real estate developer Donald J. Trump is claiming the Manhattan law firm that represented him in a lawsuit against an overcharging golf course contractor overcharged him.

Mr. Trump filed a legal malpractice suit against New York's Morrison Cohen last year in Westchester County Supreme Court, claiming the firm treated him like a 'cash cow' and performed unnecessary work to generate higher bills. Justice Kenneth W. Rudolph permitted the case to move forward last month.

'I have dealt with a lot of lawyers and paid a lot of legal fees,' Mr. Trump said in an interview Monday. 'I have a Ph.D. in legal fees. I know when fees are fair and when they are not.'

But Morrison Cohen chairman David Scherl said Mr. Trump believes he is entitled to a discount on a fair bill in a successful case because of who he is.

'That may be significant to some firms,' said Mr. Scherl, 'but not to us.'

The firm has counterclaimed for \$470,000 in legal fees it says remain unpaid. Mr. Trump, who said he has already paid Morrison Cohen \$1 million in fees, is asking for \$3 million in damages in his malpractice suit.

Morrison Cohen partner Y. David Scharf represented the Trump Briarcliff Manor Development company in a suit filed against a contractor hired to work on the Trump National Golf Club in Briarcliff Manor, N.Y. The suit claimed the contractor overcharged on a contract for earth-moving work and also walked off a separate contract for infrastructure work, causing the project to suffer a year's delay.

Justice Rudolph, who also oversaw that case, awarded Trump around \$2 million in damages for breach of the earth-moving contract, but only around \$40,000 for the infrastructure contract. The judge also awarded Trump around \$1.3 million in attorney's fees.

In his malpractice suit, Mr. Trump maintains that Morrison Cohen should have advised against pursuing the infrastructure contract claims because it was foresee-

Copyright © 2008 The New York Law Pub. Co.

4/9/2008 NYLJ 1, (col. 5) 4/9/2008 N.Y.L.J. 1, (col. 5) Page 2

able the legal costs incurred would far outstrip any recovery.

Mr. Trump said Monday the law firm was preoccupied with fees throughout the case.

'Ninety percent of the conversations I had with David Scharf were about legal fees, not the case,' he said.

Mr. Trump also downplayed Mr. Scharf's contributions in the courtroom.

'We won the case because I'm a great witness,' he said.

Mr. Scharf yesterday said he stood by his work. It was necessary to address the infrastructure issues because they had been raised by the opposing side, he said. Mr. Scharf added that he was 'disappointed and disheartened' to be in a collection dispute with Mr. Trump after the firm achieved 'a great result.' He said that Mr. Trump was aware from past representation of the firm's business model.

Mr. Scherl said Morrison Cohen aggressively goes after clients for unpaid legal fees, and the dispute with Mr. **Trump** is not the first to have landed in court. But he said the firm has an unusually high 95 percent realization rate on its bills, a fact which he said allows the firm to remain highly profitable while charging hourly rates substantially lower than those of large firms.

Mr. Scharf's work for Mr. Trump has brought the lawyer a measure of publicity in recent years. A 2004 profile in Crain's magazine described him as a confidente whom Mr. Trump frequently called at five in the morning. Mr. Trump said he thought Mr. Scharf had used his name to drum up business, adding that he would not recommend the firm.

But Mr. Scherl said Morrison Cohen could get along without Mr. **Trump** as a client, noting that investment banks that hired the firm to handle middle-market deal work found the firms' fees reasonable and paid '100 percent of their bills.'

The suit is not the first time Mr. **Trump** has tangled with Morrison Cohen. The firm's co-founder, Robert S. Cohen, who left to start his own firm in 2003, represented Ivana **Trump** in her divorce from Mr. **Trump**.

'I beat him too,' said Mr. **Trump**, referring to Ivana's unsuccessful attempt to circumvent a prenuptial agreement.

Mr. Trump is represented in his malpractice suit by Alfred Donnellan of Delbello Donnellan Weingarten & Wiederkehr in White Plains. The situation is in flux, however, as Kevin J. Plunkett, who represented Morrison Cohen, recently joined the Delbello firm from the Westchester office of New York's Thacher Proffitt & Wood.

Anthony Lin can be reached at alin@alm.com.

4/9/2008 NYLJ 1, (col. 5)

Copyright © 2008 The New York Law Pub. Co.

At a Term of the Appellate Division of the Supreme Court held in and for the First Judicial Department in the County of New York on September 25, 2007.

Present - Hon. Peter Tom,

Justice Presiding,

David B. Saxe
David Friedman
Luis A. Gonzalez
James M. McGuire,

____X

Justices.

Town House Stock, LLC, et al., Plaintiffs-Respondents,

-against-

Coby Housing Corp., et al., Defendants-Appellants,

M-4567 Index No. 602514/06

Portofino Biscayne LLC, Defendant-Appellant,

-and-

Leslie M. Westreich and SS Sontag QI LLC, Defendants.

Appeals having been taken to this Court from the judgment of the Supreme Court, New York County, entered on or about April 6, 2007,

And plaintiffs-respondents having moved, pursuant to Judiciary Law §1200.24, for an order disqualifying Morrison Cohen LLP from representing Coby Housing Corp., et al., collectively the New York property-owning appellants, and dismissing the appeal with respect to those defendants,

Now, upon reading and filing the papers with respect to the motion, and due deliberation having been had thereon,

It is ordered that the motion, to the extent that it seeks disqualification of counsel is denied, with leave to seeks said relief in Supreme Court, if so advised. The motion, to the extent that it seeks dismissal of the appeal, is denied.

ENTER:

Dhrus Clerk