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In 1898, the American Federation of Labor feared that colonial expansion would 
militarize the republic and undermine the living standards of American workers. 
Subsequent expansion of industrial production and of trade union membership soon 
replaced the fear of imperial expansion with an eagerness to enlarge the domain of 
American unions internationally alongside that of American business. In both Puerto 
Rico and Canada important groups of workers joined AFL unions on their own 
initiative. In Mexico, where major U.S. investments shaped the economy, anarcho-
syndicalists enjoyed strong support on both sides of the border, and the path to 
union growth was opened by revolution. Consequently the AFL forged links there 
with a labor movement very different from itself. Unions in Mexico became tightly 
linked to their new government, while World War I drove the AFL's leaders into 
close collaboration with their own. The Pan-American Federation of Labor was 
more a product of diplomatic maneuvering than of class solidarity. 
  

      During the last forty years, historians of the labor movement in the United States 
have focused their attention on the local places of work and residence. Rightly so. We 
have learned much about our social and political life from such studies. Nevertheless, 
at no point during the twentieth century could union or socialist movements ignore 
the global economic networks that shaped workers' lives. By 1900, the handful of 
countries in North America and Europe that accounted for more than 85 percent of 
the world's manufacturing output had effectively divided the rest of humanity into 
their respective spheres of influence and colonies. Moreover, some 55 million 
Europeans and more than 30 million people from India, China, and Java had migrated 
overseas between 1820 and 1920. Most of them traveled on shipping lines built by 
countries competing for world power, and most of them went, temporarily or 
permanently, to destinations where the Great Powers needed their labor.2 
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      When leaders of trade unions and socialist parties in Europe and North America 
discussed the economic transformation of the globe taking place around 1900 before 
their very eyes, they couched issues in terms of the impact on domestic affairs: the 
use of soldiers from the ranks of the poor (especially conscripts) in colonial wars, 
naval construction, the rising tax burden, and migration (or the perceived threat of 
migration) from and to the colonies. The wars and rumors of war in Asia, Africa, and 
the Middle East from 1894 to 1904 greatly intensified these concerns and produced 
innumerable cartoons of workers staggering under the burden of cannons and 
warships.3 The 1900 May Day Manifesto of the International Socialist Bureau 
highlighted these issues: "It is war all over the globe. War budgets rise and rise.... 
More is spent on rifles, cannons, barracks, ships than is paid in wages to millions of 
workers; millions of men are put under arms, to massacre, to destroy, to burn, to steal, 
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to kill."4 
      The purpose of this essay is to consider how the questions of war and empire 
looked to activists in U.S. labor organizations. Although the press and individual 
members of the Socialist Party and the Industrial Workers of the World (IWW) 
frequently devoted attention to workers' struggles in other lands, it was the American 
Federation of Labor (AFL) that most actively acquired members outside the 
boundaries of the United States and involved itself directly in the country's foreign 
affairs (at least until the antiwar campaigns of the Socialist Party after 1914).5 Around 
1900, the AFL was highly critical of the expansionist policies of the U.S. 
government. Fewer than twenty years later it had come not only to support those 
policies, but also even to participate actively in their execution—though in the case of 
Mexico often also urging Woodrow Wilson's administration to pursue particular 
courses of action. In very important ways, actions taken by AFL leaders were 
responding to those of the socialists and the IWW as well as to the domestic and 
international upsurge in worker support for direct action, sympathetic strikes, and all-
inclusive organization, of which the IWW was but the highly visible tip of the 
iceberg. Moreover, not all these initiatives and developments originated in the United 
States by any means. We must also consider the actions of workers in countries that 
were targets of U.S. investment and colonization. I will devote special attention to the 
influence on the AFL of workers in Canada, Puerto Rico, and Mexico. 
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      The American Federation of Labor had been more categorically opposed to the 
annexation of colonies in 1900 than were most European socialist and labor parties 
and the International Socialist Bureau. To be sure, AFL convention delegates had 
resolved their "hearty sympathy" with Cubans fighting for "the right of self-
government" in 1896.6 Going to war against Spain was another matter, however: In 
1898, most of the labor and socialist press warned against a resort to arms.7 

4  

      Labor's sympathy for Cubans was tempered by fear of war and militarism, 
echoing that often expressed by the Socialist International. Both the regular army and 
state national guards had been called out to break strikes again and again during the 
1890s. Troops suppressing the Coeur d'Alene, Homestead, and Pullman strikes had 
attracted national attention, while the 1897 massacre of Slavic strikers at Lattimer 
Mines, Pennsylvania, and the 1898 confrontations at Virden and Pana, Illinois, 
coincided with the Federation's convention debates about war and imperialism. AFL 
president Samuel Gompers had declared back in 1892 that "membership in a labor 
organization and the militia at one and the same time is inconsistent and 
incompatible."8 
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      Early in 1899, Gompers went so far as to "look forward to the time" when 
workers would enforce peace, if diplomats failed to do so, "by the dock laborers 
refusing to handle goods that are to be used to destroy their fellow men, and by the 
seamen of the world, united in one organization, while willing to risk their lives in 
conducting the commerce of nations, absolutely refusing to strike down their fellow 
men." In 1916 he would explicitly repudiate those words.9 
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      The end of the short war of 1898 and the prospect of annexing the Philippines and 
Puerto Rico reopened the whole discussion. Gompers made a widely publicized 
speech to the Chicago Peace Jubilee, in which he warned:  
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There is even now a strife going on among the nations of the earth for the partition and possession of 
Eastern countries. Let us take the Philippines, and we shall be in the midst of the conflicts. We shall 
have to follow the monarchical policy of large standing armies, with immense navies ... [and] we will 
come to that point against which the genius of our institutions revolts—compulsory military duty.10 
      Within days of the signing of the Treaty of Paris ending the Spanish-American 
War in December 1898, delegates to the AFL convention adopted a resolution 
ardently opposing the "new and far-reaching policy, commonly known as 
'imperialism' or 'expansion,'" which "if ratified by the United States Senate will ... 
seriously threaten the perpetuity of our Republic."11 
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      Three features of the AFL's 1898 debate are worth noting. First, the only negative 
interventions came from delegates who were social democrats. The socialist leader 
from Cleveland, Max Hayes, argued that the controversy over imperial expansion had 
been invented by politicians and plutocrats, and that trade unionists should have 
"nothing to do with it." They should instead concentrate their efforts on creating a 
cooperative commowealth. Despite their objections, however, the socialists did not 
vote against the resolution.12 
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      Second, both Gompers, in an earlier address a National Conference on Foreign 
Policy, and most delegates who took the floor during the convention debate 
emphasized the danger of annexing lands populated by "servile races" and "a semi-
barbaric population." The prospects of massive migrations of Filipinos and Chinese 
into the continental United States as well as the competition from goods produced in 
colonies haunted the discussion. Delegate John Kirby of a federal labor union in 
Ouray, Colorado, expressed his opposition to the recent annexation of Hawaii: "We 
cannot elevate the inhabitants to our standard, but will drag our people down to their 
level. If the products of those countries are brought in, it will remove our products 
from competition." Stuart Reid of the International Association of Machinists drew 
on the experience of his native British Isles: "The people of India did interfere with 
our movement: machinery was shipped to that country and coolies were put to work, 
and as a result reduced the wages below a living standard."13 
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      More than one historian has argued that racist hostility toward immigrants and 
peoples of color explains the unions' foreign policy stance.14 That explanation 
contains an important element of truth, but it is inadequate to account for the evolving 
policies of the labor movement. Racism flourished on both sides of the debates about 
imperialism and trade unionism. Consider Harrison Gray Otis, editor of the Los 
Angeles Times, who had invested heavily in land and development in both Southern 
California and Mexico. He crusaded relentlessly in his highly influential newspaper 
against both Chinese immigrants and labor unions. Otis had proudly served as a 
brigadier-general in charge of volunteers who battled the independence fighters of the 
Philippines, and he subsequently cultivated in print the ominous image of Chinese, 
Japanese, and Mexicans blended into the "Bronze Menace," against which white 
Americans had to stand guard. While keeping ever in mind the formidable influence 
of white racism in the labor movements of the United States, Canada, and Europe, we 
must look elsewhere for an adequate explanation of AFL policies regarding empire. 
As Barbara Fields has pointed out, racist arguments have often been marshaled on all 
conflicting sides of debates over economic and political policies.15 
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      Third, the National Business League had sponsored the Peace Jubilee where 
Gompers had made his famous speech.16 When Gompers joined the newly formed 
Anti-Imperialist League late in 1898, so did Andrew Carnegie, Edward Atkinson, 
Henry Villard, George F. Peabody, and former president Benjamin Harrison.17 
Moreover, as will be argued below, the National Civic Federation, which brought 
business and union leaders together in quest of common interests, became an 
important theater for discussion of overseas colonies and commerce. 
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      Indeed, both the arguments advanced against the annexation of colonies and those 
in favor of the policy have a familiar ring in the twenty-first century. Opponents 
contended that capital would flow to the colonies, where it would be possible to 
fabricate products so cheaply that they would undercut jobs and wages in the United 
States. As Gompers often put it, living standards could be raised only by 
manufacturing goods at home for consumption by workers who were motivated by 
the expectations of "civilized" men and women and paid union wages.18 Joining the 
battle for empire would bring no benefits for American workers, but only burden 
them with taxes, oligarchic rule, resurgent immigrant contract labor, and incessant 
calls to arms. 
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      Champions of imperialism replied that colonies would provide markets to absorb 
the domestic overproduction. Colonies would also increase the United States' access 
to raw materials and food products and lower the cost of living. All the while, racially 
defined immigration policies and enforcement of laws against contract labor could 
make it possible to restrain residents of the colonies from moving to the United 
States. And indeed, the Supreme Court ruled in 1901 in the so-called Insular Cases 
that the constitution does not follow the flag.19 Moreover, William Randolph Hearst, 
whose newspapers were read avidly by many workers, vigorously opposed Gompers 
on the question of colonies. Hearst argued that the troops needed to hold colonies 
would probably be provided mainly by "natives of the islands," while imperial 
expansion would create career opportunities for American workers who "have brains, 
energy and a determination to be something more prosperous than a day laborer."20 
The famous naval theoretician A. T. Mahan added that no country that wished to 
survive as a great power in the modern world could stay out of the race for colonies. 
He warned that continued adherence to the ideals of Jeffersonian democracy would 
prove fatal to America in an age when the Great Powers were redrawing the political 
and economic map of the world.21 
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      During the opening years of the twentieth century, it seemed that these conflicting 
arguments were being reconciled. The diplomatic historian William Appleman 
Williams and his followers have persuasively singled out two defining features of an 
emerging consensus on foreign policy. First, as a review of the world's commerce, 
published by the U.S. State Department in 1899, argued: "The enlargement of foreign 
consumption of the products of our mills and workshops has ... become a serious 
problem of statesmanship."22 
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      Moreover, the attention of American business and the U.S. government then 
focused on the Western Hemisphere. Consequently it was easy to understand why 
Secretary of State Richard Olney had proclaimed in 1895, in regard to the Americas: 
"To-day the United States is practically sovereign on this continent, and its fiat is law 
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upon the subjects to which it confines its interposition."23 Around 1900, 50 percent of 
this country's direct investments abroad were placed in Latin America—
overwhelmingly in Mexico—and another 33 percent were in Canada.24 Although the 
investments in Mexico were concentrated in ranch lands, railroads, petroleum, and 
minerals, the $175 million of U.S. capital invested in Canada at the time went not 
only into timber and minerals, but also heavily into manufacturing. General Electric, 
Westinghouse, National Cash Register, and American Asbestos were among those 
who had established branch plants north of the border.25 As Gregory S. Kealey has 
argued, the industrial upsurge at the turn of the century "combined with Canada's high 
tariff wall and preferential access to British empire markets to create the world's first 
major branch plant economy."26 Small wonder some of the same business leaders 
who had joined Gompers in the Anti-Imperialist League simultaneously promoted the 
cause of closer ties between what they called the Anglo-Saxon nations of North 
America.27 
      As if to quiet Gompers' fears for the home economy, the United States enjoyed 
spectacular industrial growth, as did Western Europe and Russia. The French 
economist Leon Dupriez has calculated that the average annual increase in physical 
output per capita for the advanced industrial countries as a group between 1895 and 
1913 was double what it had been from 1880 to 1894. The United States, which had 
already emerged during the 1880s as the world's leading producer of manufactured 
goods, increased its output even more rapidly than its leading rivals, England, 
Germany, and France. Not only was immigration increasing America's labor force 
rapidly, output per worker was growing even faster.28 

17  

      Even more important for the AFL, between 1897 and 1904 trade union 
membership in the United States had more than quadrupled, growing from 440,000 to 
2,067,000—in percentage terms the greatest upward leap in U.S. history. The 
proportion of workers in private industry who belonged to unions in early 1904 was 
greater than it is today. And the AFL had for the first time consolidated its position as 
the country's dominant labor organization—encompassing 81 percent of all union 
members.29 
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      Trade union resurgence after 1897 also stimulated widespread public discussion 
of possible ways to make America's industrial relations less bloody. Among many 
related developments was the formation of the National Civic Federation, through 
which prominent corporate leaders met with AFL officials in quest of possible terms 
of peaceful contractual coexistence between labor and capital. In my opinion, these 
discussions had precious little effect on actual industrial practice.30 But they did 
provide an important forum in which business and union leaders discussed foreign 
and colonial policy. 
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      There were also thousands of workers who rejected both the Civic Federation's 
pursuit of harmony between the classes and the AFL's vision of gradually improving 
workers' lives by means of union contracts. The founding convention of the IWW in 
1905 brought together delegates with many different political views, but all of them 
were determined to rid the world of capitalism, not to polish its rough edges. As the 
preamble to the IWW's constitution said, its goal was to organize "the workers of the 
world ... as a class, take possession of the earth and the machinery of production, and 
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abolish the wage system."31 
      The Wobblies held militarism and all forms of nationalism in contempt. They 
argued that craft unions could do no more than improve life for a fortunate few 
among the workers, and in fact were not very good even at that. Only the 
mobilization of all workers, regardless of occupation, race, or gender, could be 
effective in improving the conditions of life. Both short-term objectives and the 
ultimate overthrow of capitalism, they proclaimed after their 1908 convention, could 
be achieved only by direct action: "industrial action directly by, for, and of the 
workers themselves, without the treacherous aid of labor misleaders or scheming 
politicians."32 
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      The IWW took shape under distinctly North American conditions, but it reflected 
a widespread belief, inspired in workers' movements especially by the Russian 
Revolution of 1905, that exploitation and tyranny could be brought down by mass 
strikes. That faith was incorporated in the basic principles of the anarcho-syndicalist 
unions of France, Italy, and Spain (all of which had more members than the IWW) 
and of smaller unions elsewhere in Europe. It also inspired new labor organizations 
and mass strikes in Argentina, Brazil, Uruguay, and Chile, as well as the strikes of 
1906 in the Mexican copper mining, textile, and railroad industries.33 
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      To be sure, demands for social reform in the United States and elsewhere came 
from many directions, some of which pointed toward political action, rather than 
away from it. For example, working people gave widespread support to "municipal 
socialism"—intervention by city governments to improve housing, provide services, 
and hold down streetcar fares (a burning issue in the United States). Both locally 
oriented movements such as Britain's Independent Labour Party and "impossiblist" 
socialists who scoffed at entitlement programs emanating from national governments, 
such as the Guesdeists in France, sought control of city governments. In the United 
States, Progressive Era struggles for municipal services were powerfully supported 
and often led by recent immigrants and by socialists.34 

23  

      At the same time, the mobilization of state power for formal and informal empire 
also encouraged an expansion of government's role in the domestic economy. Let one 
example suffice. Building the Panama Canal was a vast government undertaking. The 
Socialist editor of the Machinists' Monthly Journal could scarcely contain his 
enthusiasm. The creation of the canal, the reconstruction of two cities, the erection of 
ports and quays, and the containment of contagious diseases and mosquitoes provided 
a model of what state enterprise had "done for the nation at large ... far superior to 
work done under private contract." Moreover, the wages, hours, housing, recreation 
facilities, and health services supplied by the federal government's Isthmian Canal 
Commission provided a model for proper treatment of workers—at least for the five 
to six thousand white citizens of the United States who were engaged in the operation 
(workers on the "gold roll"). The 45,000 workers on the "silver roll," primarily black 
men and women from the Caribbean, but also East Indians, Italians, Venezuelans, and 
even Spaniards, were not only paid much less but were also left to fend for 
themselves and were barred from entering facilities reserved for "whites."35 
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      The example of the canal influenced others in addition to white socialist 
machinists. It aroused enthusiasm for municipal ownership among businessmen. 
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Nowhere was this more evident than in Seattle, a city catapulted to importance 
because of its location on the great circle routes from Panama City to Asia. The city 
expanded and modernized its port facilities as a public project, while powerful reform 
coalitions broke railroad control of local politics and floated bond issues to improve 
the physical environment and shut down "vice." Its University of Washington became 
the pinnacle of the Philippine's educational system.36 Such developments around the 
imperialist world led socialists such as William English Walling and Emile 
Vandervelde, secretary of the International Socialist Bureau, to warn that public 
enterprise and state ownership did not constitute socialism. On the contrary, they 
argued, modern capitalism's expansion of the state had to be overcome by socialist 
revolution.37 
      As political philosopher Herbert Croly argued in 1909, the Spanish-American 
War "and its resulting policy of extra-territorial expansion ... availed, from the sheer 
force of the national aspirations it aroused, to give a tremendous impulse to the work 
of national reform ... and it indirectly helped to place in the Presidential chair 
[Theodore Roosevelt] who ... represented both the national idea and the spirit of 
reform."38 
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      In this new political environment, both Gompers and Carnegie quietly quit the 
Anti-Imperialist League, and protests against annexing colonies simply disappeared 
from AFL proceedings.39 Instead, AFL leaders reoriented their efforts toward 
spreading their style of unionism throughout North America. 
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The AFL and Canada 
   

      Major American international unions grew in Canada, cheek-by-jowl with the 
expansion of branch plants of American corporations. Their growth was assisted by 
the nature of the border between the United States and Canada, the most permeable in 
the world. Especially since the 1870s, both English-speaking and French-speaking 
Canadians had migrated south in such numbers as to repopulate the textile and shoe 
factories of New England and to constitute more than a quarter of Detroit's foreign-
born population. Thousands of British, Italian, and Finnish immigrants who came 
through Montreal subsequently moved southward, while seasonal Italian railroad 
workers traveled through the Port of New York to Montreal and then to jobs in the 
Canada's western provinces. It was commonplace for immigrants to return to Canada 
when work became slack in the United States, so that personal and economic contacts 
across the border assumed a continuing importance in family life. Moreover, from the 
1890s to 1914, more people entered the rapidly growing far western provinces of 
Canada from the United States than moved the other way.40 
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      Both the Knights of Labor and AFL craft unions had recruited many members in 
Ontario, Quebec, and Atlantic Canada since the 1880s. It was commonplace for labor 
activists and elected leaders on one side of the border to have been born on the other 
side. Labor organizations in the two countries also shared a venomous hostility 
toward Chinese immigrants (supplemented in the Canadian case by opposition to 
immigrants from India). Immigrants from the British Isles had often brought with 
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them important trade union experience and sometimes even British unions, such as 
the Amalgamated Society of Engineers, a bitter rival to the International Association 
of Machinists, which had important branches in Ontario, Michigan, and Illinois (and 
which participated in the founding convention of the IWW in 1905). Many recent 
immigrants from Britain came with a strong commitment to industrial unionism and 
to socialist politics. Their influence was to be especially evident in the strike wave of 
1919 and in particular in the Montreal shipyards strike and the general sympathetic 
strikes of Seattle, Toronto, Amherst, and Winnipeg.41 
      The Knights of Labor survived the depression of the 1890s somewhat better in 
Canada than it did in the United States. Three-fourths of its remaining local 
assemblies were found in Quebec. There were also numerous autonomous Canadian 
trade unions. But the most spectacular union growth in Canada at the opening of the 
twentieth century was to be found in the local membership of international unions, 
such as the carpenters, bricklayers, printers, shoe workers, iron molders, and mine 
workers, with headquarters in U.S. cities such as Indianapolis, Chicago, and New 
York and which were affiliated with the American Federation of Labor. Although 
those international unions often had some Canadian officers, their most effective 
support came from rank-and-file craftsmen in more than 1,000 local unions (in 1902), 
who felt strengthened by the financial resources, benevolent funds, and traveling 
cards provided by the internationals. Locals of the internationals, together with 
assemblies of the Knights and purely Canadian unions were represented in the Trades 
and Labor Congress of Canada, which had been created in 1883 and acquired the 
name TLCC in 1892. All groups agreed that the parliamentary system and 
confederation structure of the Canadian state required a Canadian institution distinct 
from but not necessarily in conflict with the AFL.42 
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      Consensus did not extend beyond that point. AFL leaders were determined to 
drive the remaining Knights of Labor assemblies out of Canadian city assemblies and 
to bring the many independent unions under the wing of the Federation. That effort 
faced ardent hostility not only from the powerful and pro-British Conservative Party 
and from Quebec's Catholic hierarchy, which denounced AFL leaders as foreigners 
and Masons, but also from many Canadian unionists who thought they should be 
allowed to run their own affairs. Ralph Smith, a coal miner born in England who had 
close ties to the governing Liberal Party in British Columbia and was president of the 
TLCC from 1898 to 1902, argued that Canadian labor could wield a strong influence 
only if all components of the nation's movement worked together. He enjoyed 
especially strong support in the bilingual area around Ottawa and Hull. Smith's 
outspoken opponent was John Flett, a carpenter from Hamilton, Ontario, whom 
Gompers had appointed salaried organizer for Canada and who helped bring 140 new 
local unions into the AFL in 1900 alone.43 
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      Their dispute was brought to a head by the AFL's growing reliance on union 
labels as an organizing device. The use of union labels was especially contentious in 
the important shoe industry of Quebec, where workers were involved in a wave of 
strikes and lockouts during 1900 and 1901 while adhering to a variety of different 
unions. The New England–based Boot and Shoe Workers International Union, led by 
the former socialist John F. Tobin (himself born in Guelph, Ontario), sought to bring 
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all the manufacturers involved in the conflicts under his union's label. His effort failed 
to impress the province's shoe workers, who knew that their industry was protected 
from American competitors by a high tariff, and he enraged the militant shoe lasters 
of Montreal by undermining support for their craft strike.44 
      The stage was thus set for the decisive September 1902 convention of the TLCC 
in Berlin, Ontario (renamed Kitchener during World War I). It was the largest labor 
convention Canada had yet produced, and floor battles were furious from the start. 
The AFL's advocates carried the crucial votes with better than two to one margins. 
Flett replaced Smith as president. The constitution was changed to bar from affiliation 
with the TLCC not only the Knights of Labor but also all unions with possible 
jurisdictional conflicts with the AFL internationals. Gompers wrote in triumph that 
the interests of the labor movement were "identical" regardless of "arbitrary 
geographic lines."45 
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      Gompers' foes in Canada reacted swiftly, but they proved unable to reverse the 
fateful work of the Berlin Congress. The upper house of the Canadian parliament 
passed a bill making it a criminal offense for foreigners to encourage or provoke a 
strike in Canada, but TLCC leaders mobilized Liberal Party votes in the lower house 
and defeated the bill. Union leaders who had unsuccessfully advocated allowing all 
Canadian labor organizations into the TLCC quickly formed a rival National Trades 
and Labor Congress (soon renamed the Canadian Federation of Labor). Despite the 
widespread reluctance of many city trades councils to expel unions not chartered by 
the AFL, however, the international unions encompassed more than 88 percent of all 
Canadian union locals by 1914. The most effective alternatives then clustered around 
two poles. One was revolutionary syndicalism, represented first by the Industrial 
Workers of the World and after 1919 by the One Big Union. The other was found in 
the largest center of nationalist unions: Quebec. There, unions that rejected the AFL 
were gradually but systematically gathered, under the guidance of the Catholic 
Church and in a political context of increasingly intense Catholic nationalism, into a 
movement guided by Papal encyclicals and a chaplain in each local, the 
Confédération des Travailleurs Catholiques du Canada.46 
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      In short, the Canadian experience suggests that while their resolutions against 
annexing colonies remained on the books, AFL unions, like important business 
leaders, were expanding their own economic reach beyond this country's borders. By 
the 1905 convention of the AFL, Gompers could assert his contempt for the newly 
founded IWW and proudly declare:  
Our limits are no longer from Maine to California, from the Lakes to the Gulf, but we include the 
whole of the United States, Canada, Hawaii, Cuba, Porto Rico, Mexico, the Philippines, and British 
Columbia. Our international unions deserve support in this growth and in bringing ... an example to the 
rest of the world.47 
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      And what was that example? Autonomous craft unions engaged in a carefully 
guided quest for contractual relations with employers or groups of employers, 
symbolized, where possible, by the union label on the employers' wares. Strong trade 
unions, able to carry out effective, coordinated strikes but restraining spontaneous 
strikes and sympathetic strikes, were the necessary precondition of cooperation with 
"the more intelligent among the employers," Gompers continued.48 
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      Moreover, it was not only industrial peace that was nurtured by the strength of 
organized labor, but also the peace of the world. Since 1900, AFL convention 
resolutions had insisted that the "preservation of peace in the world devolves more 
and more upon organized labor, whose voice is ever becoming more potent in the 
formation of public opinion, that supreme tribunal before which both monarch and 
merchant must inevitably bow." But in contrast to the resolutions of the Socialist 
International, which continued to link the danger of war explicitly to the clash of 
imperial ambitions, the warnings against annexations and militarism, spoken so 
loudly by the AFL in 1898, simply faded away. In their place was a celebration that 
"the labor movement of the United States and Canada is one," as Gompers put it in 
his 1904 report to the convention, "that the labor movement of the United States and 
Porto Rico is one," and that collaboration with the unions of Britain and the British 
Empire was on the rise and providing an example that might spread to continental 
Europe. "We have heard a great deal about peace, about international peace," 
Gompers continued, "but I can conceive of no peace that will be lasting unless it is 
based upon the federation of the working men of the civilized world."49 
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      Lurking behind these bold claims were two unspoken questions. First, in its 
relations with European unions, international labor secretariats, and the International 
Federation of Trade Unions, AFL leaders insisted adamantly on the autonomy of 
every national labor movement. How was that insistence to be reconciled with the 
decisions of the Berlin Congress and with the new claim that wherever American 
business went, U.S.-based unions would also go?50 The second question was what 
role labor movements within the economic spheres and colonies of the Great Powers 
(or what Gompers called the "civilized world") should play in shaping global 
struggles for social reform and peace. Workers in Puerto Rico and Mexico brought 
both of those questions sharply to the attention of the AFL. In both those countries, 
though each in a different way, nationalist struggles against foreign domination 
powerfully shaped workers' mobilizations for social reform at home. 
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The AFL and Puerto Rico 
   

      In Puerto Rico, urban artisans had created their own movement during the last 
years of Spanish rule. Among the immigrant craftsmen who had launched the 
periodical Ensayo Obrero on May 1, 1897, were the men who would lead the union 
movement until the 1930s: Santiago Iglesias, Eduardo Conde, and Ramón Romero 
Rosa.51 Like the anarchists in Europe, they castigated organized religion for numbing 
workers' minds, and they placed universal secular education high on their agenda of 
demands. The autonomous island government, which Spain had authorized early in 
1897, soon punished the journal with fines and jailed Iglesias for disrespect toward 
Catholic education.52 
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      The hacienda owners and creole professionals who led the autonomous 
government under Spain continued to dominate the island's politics under early U.S. 
rule. Prominent among them was Luis Muñoz Rivera. He aspired on one front to 
remove Spanish-born merchants and civil officials from control and to replace them 
with native Puerto Rican leaders. He also hoped, as he wrote in 1891, to arouse the 

40  



masses, "breaking the ice of their indifference and lighting the sacred fire of 
patriotism in their hearts." Like other patriotic leaders he despised the workers' 
movement as inimical to "the great Puerto Rican family."53 
      The U.S. law that instituted limited self-government in 1901 was the product of 
expert investigations and lengthy Congressional hearings, in true Progressive Era 
style.54 Scholarly advisors in Washington depicted Puerto Ricans as people retarded 
by centuries of Catholic monarchism, which had left their gentry arrogant patriarchs, 
their poor women subject to male tyranny but often without husbands, and their male 
laborers dissolute and undisciplined. Consequently military authorities had instituted 
civil marriage in 1899, and three years later one of the first acts of the new legislature 
permitted women to divorce abusive husbands—a right which women quickly put to 
widespread use.55 
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      The new regime took power amid economic desolation, caused by a worldwide 
collapse of the price of coffee—then the island's most valuable export. A large, 
mobile wage-earning class had already been generated by the abolition of slavery, 
completed in 1873, and by the subsequent spread of coffee and sugar plantations. 
Now those workers and their families could welcome abolition of the hated "regimen 
de la libreta" (obligatory pass books which certified workers' places of employment 
and employers' permission to travel), while they also faced ruinous unemployment 
and slashed wages. Thousands emigrated to seek work—to Hawaii, Cuba, Panama, 
and the continental United States.56 
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      Between 1898 and 1901, the island had erupted in strikes, and workers created a 
federation of unions, whose most prominent leader was Santiago Iglesias.57 His 
personal story reveals as much about the workings of imperial government as it does 
about the difficult relationship between workers' struggles and national independence 
movements. 
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      Born in Spain, Iglesias apprenticed as a cabinetmaker and migrated at the age of 
fourteen to Havana, where he became involved in workers' study circles and in the 
Cuban struggle for independence until military authorities forced him to flee to Puerto 
Rico. There, Muñoz Rivera's autonomous government put him in jail, as we have 
seen, but he escaped when U.S. troops landed.58 Subsequently, Iglesias participated 
prominently not only in the founding conventions of the union federation and of the 
new Partido Obrero Socialista—he called himself a socialist all his life—but in a San 
Juan reform rally, he also came out in favor of annexation: ¿Somos anexionistas? 
Si.59 
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      Iglesias traveled north and made personal contact with both the new Socialist 
Party of America and La Resistencia, the militant union of Cuban and Puerto Rican 
cigar makers in New York.60 Those connections helped him bring moral and financial 
support to strikers in Puerto Rico. The island's government responded by arresting 
Iglesias and seven other strike leaders, charging them under an old Spanish law with 
"conspiracy to raise the price of labor." Iglesias jumped bail, came again to the United 
States, and appealed for help to the 1900 convention of the AFL. Trade unionists at 
the convention were infuriated by the reappearance of the hated labor conspiracy 
doctrine, which they thought America had buried.61 A reporter from the Louisville 
Courier Journal wrote that "the most heated and most interesting debate of the 
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convention" developed around a motion to organize the workers of Puerto Rico 
"before American capitalists go in there and attempt to control native labor at the 
prices now paid for it." They appropriated money to help organize the island's 
workers and persuaded the unions of cigar makers, tobacco workers, longshoremen, 
and carpenters to take part in the struggle and to translate their constitutions into 
Spanish. Gompers then commissioned Iglesias as a general organizer for the AFL.62 
      More intriguing, Gompers appealed on behalf of Iglesias to President Theodore 
Roosevelt. The president's personal secretary, George Cortelyou, was a leader of the 
National Civic Federation, which was then seeking to harmonize relations between 
labor and capital in the United States. Cortelyou wrote to the colonial governor 
assuring him that Iglesias was "endorsed by Mr. Gompers," who had requested 
Iglesias be "left free to carry out the objects of his mission." U.S. attorney general 
Philander C. Knox then persuaded the Supreme Court of Puerto Rico to overturn the 
workers' sentences and to rule that "any Spanish law in Porto Rico, [which impairs 
the right of free assembly] has lost its force and become a nullity with the change of 
sovereignty."63 
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      Workers' rights to organize and strike had been vindicated by intervention from 
the North in defiance of Muñoz Rivera and his fellow hacendados and in the context 
of popular misery and upheaval. For the next decade, the labor federation continued 
to denounce the "statements made in favor of independence of Puerto Rico" by 
Muñoz Rivera's party as "only the aspiration and thirst for dominion over the 
producing masses, to secure places and to strangle in the throat of the people the 
blessed freedom that now exists in Puerto Rico"64 
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      The AFL's activity in Puerto Rico reflected its general move away from the 
opposition to colonial expansion expressed in 1898. In 1902, the year of the Berlin 
Congress's decisions reigning in the autonomy of Canadian unions, Gompers 
appointed Ed Rosenberg, a Norwegian-born officer of the Sailors Union of the 
Pacific, as salaried organizer for Hawaii and the Philippines with authority to 
organize workers there into unions affiliated with the AFL.65 When U.S. forces 
invaded Haiti in 1915 and rewrote Haiti's constitution and land laws, took control of 
revenue collection, and established a new police force with American officers, 
making Haiti a colony in all but name for nineteen years, the AFL uttered not a word 
of protest.66 
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      It is crucial to understanding Puerto Rico, however, to recall that its major 
employers in 1900 were not foreigners. For a time, Spanish-born merchants continued 
to dominate much of the island's commerce and money lending. But that condition 
changed rapidly under American rule, and correspondingly dissent from Iglesias's 
views on U.S. annexation grew in labor's ranks. As early as 1905, the primary 
participants in strikes were no longer the artisans and port workers of San Juan, but 
the largely seasonal workers in tobacco and sugar, where many of the largest 
enterprises had recently been created by investors from the North. Among them were 
James B. Duke's American Tobacco Company and the Porto Rico Sugar Company, 
owner of five plantations with 7,000 acres of cane. When nearly 14,000 workers 
struck that company and other sugar centrals of the Ponce region demanding 75 cents 
a day, the U.S. district court of Puerto Rico imposed on Iglesias not an archaic 
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Spanish conspiracy indictment but a modern American injunction.67 As tensions 
continued to mount in the sugar regions, the island's appointed executive council and 
the elected House of Delegates agreed in 1910 to create a special police force 
empowered by the government but paid and directed by companies and hacendados 
who requested them, along the lines of Pennsylvania's infamous Coal and Iron 
Police.68 
      Trade union activists in the sugar regions, who were involved in yet another surge 
of strikes in 1915, persuaded the labor federation to establish a new socialist party. 
Although Iglesias was elected the party's president, local party sections often 
denounced their country's domination by U.S. capital. Their denunciations grew 
louder early the next year, when police dispatched to the Arecibo region by Governor 
Arthur Yager arrested many strikers and killed several. When Gompers protested to 
President Woodrow Wilson that the workers' constitutional rights had been violated, 
Wilson defended Yager as just and patriotic. The convergence between socialist and 
nationalist aspirations was clearly evident at the new party's 1919 convention, when 
delegates openly and ardently debated whether to fight for national independence or 
to appeal to the democratic pretensions of the United States against the domination of 
Puerto Rican elites. In the end, Iglesias's position prevailed: that independence should 
come, if at all, only after social democracy had been won at home. What is truly 
remarkable about the 1919 debate, however, is that speakers on both sides of the 
question (including Iglesias) referred to the example of revolutionary Russia to 
support their positions.69 
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      It is noteworthy that the trade union body headed by Iglesias, the Federación 
Libre de los Trabajadores (FLT), while affiliated with the AFL, exercised sufficient 
autonomy to create its own political party. More important, the desolate condition of 
the island's agriculture between the world wars undermined trade union power, 
making the Socialist Party the tail that wagged the trade-union dog. Seeking to secure 
some legislative benefits for workers, not to mention appointments to government 
office, the party joined in coalition with the Republican Party, which was committed 
to the quest for statehood. This alliance made the Socialists partners in governing the 
colony from 1924 to 1940. A party with a platform devoted to organizing workers' 
own collective power on the job against "the plutocracy" and "under the banner of the 
socialist ideal" governed in coalition with representatives of some of the island's most 
powerful business interests.70 
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      As if the Great Depression had not brought enough misery to Puerto Rico, as it 
did throughout the Caribbean, a furious hurricane swept the island in 1932. The 
haunting refrains of Rafael Hernández famous song "Lamento Borincano" evoked 
both the people's distress and a growing animosity toward Yankee companies that had 
devoured their land. Strikes by women in tobacco and clothing in 1933 met both 
police violence and student support. The Nationalist Party, under the charismatic 
leadership of Pedro Albizu Campos, shook the political landscape not only by 
vigorous electoral activity but also by turbulent street demonstrations as well as the 
murder of the island's chief of police. 
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      Iglesias's labor federation sought to stabilize working conditions through master 
collective bargaining agreements for each of the island's major industries. The sugar 
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workers' contract evoked furious protests from union members because it provided no 
wage increase and ignored local struggles over the task system of payment and hours 
of work. Their strike spread from plantation to plantation, while Iglesias and other 
FLT leaders tried to cajole or command workers to return to their jobs. In response, 
strikers called on Albizu Campos for help, and his oratory made strike meetings 
resound with demands for independence. As the next elections revealed in 1936, 
however, the discourse of national sovereignty had not won many adherents among 
those mobilized in the name of wages, hours, and local control ("un peso y ocho 
horas" were words sung across the sugar fields), but workers were to desert the 
Socialist Party and the FLT in ever growing numbers. After Iglesias died in 1939, the 
party fell apart.71 
      Nevertheless, nationalist agitation did contribute heavily to a basic realignment of 
Puerto Rican politics. In 1936, Albizu Campos and six colleagues were sentenced to 
the Atlanta penitentiary for conspiracy to murder the police commandant. The 
following March, a nationalist parade in Ponce was met with police gunfire, leaving 
nineteen people dead (including two police) and at least 100 wounded. While the 
main opposition party, long committed to island autonomy, disintegrated in the 
aftermath of the massacre, up in New York City, Congressman Vito Marcantonio, 
representing the eastside Italian-Puerto Rican community, became a vocal champion 
of Puerto Rican independence and of the imprisoned Albizu Campos, in addition to 
social reform.72 
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      A new party headed by Luis Muñoz Marín (son of Luis Muñoz Rivera) rose out 
of the crisis to dominate the island's political life. After initially calling for 
independence with social justice, he had by 1940 proclaimed that social justice was 
the issue, not the island's legal status. As war mobilization reinvigorated the 
economy, Muñoz Marín worked, often in tandem with the new U.S. governor 
Rexford Tugwell, to strip sugar companies of their massive holdings, distribute land 
to smallholders, erect state factories, and ultimately to negotiate self-government in 
most domestic affairs, while still under U.S. rule, in the form of the Estado Libre 
Asociado (Commonwealth). 
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      In the new imperial relationship, Puerto Rico remained firmly annexed to the 
United States while it was rapidly transformed into a branch plant economy in the 
name of Operation Bootstrap. The labor movement envisaged by Gompers and 
Iglesias had been marginalized. The Confederación General de los Trabajadores, 
established in 1940, shaped a new militancy, first among sugar workers then in other 
domains. Its president was a member of the inner circle of Muñoz Marín's party.73 
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The AFL and Mexico 
   

      By that time, however, the focal point of entanglement with imperialism for the 
American labor movement had clearly become Mexico. In stark contrast to Canada 
and Puerto Rico, there was no popular support among workers in Mexico for joining 
the international unions of the AFL. Moreover, under the regime of Porfirio Díaz any 
union or strike activity faced brutal repression, though railroad brotherhoods (not 
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affiliated with the AFL) did wield some power on the railroads of northern Mexico, 
as preserves of locomotive engineers and dispatchers who had come from the United 
States along with the railroad companies. After 1905, there was some IWW activity 
involving both Mexicans and Anglo immigrants in the Tampico oil fields, but the 
crucial links of Mexico's workers' movement to the IWW were not organizational, but 
ideological. The most influential organization involved in the strikes that shook the 
Díaz regime in 1906 was the Partido Liberal Mexicano (PLM), whose commitment to 
revolutionary workers' action aimed at bringing down capitalism had much in 
common with the Wobblies' beliefs. 
      Nevertheless, the labor movement that took shape during Mexico's revolutionary 
struggles ultimately did so under the wing of the victorious General Venustiano 
Carranza. Correspondingly, the resurgent American Federation of Labor allied itself 
ever more closely with the Wilson administration in Washington and with its foreign 
policies. Consequently, the links formed between officers of the two national labor 
movements between 1916 and 1924 were shaped as much by international diplomacy 
as they were by questions of trade union strategies and affiliations. 
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      The United States had annexed half the former area of Mexico by 1848, and at the 
turn of the century, modern capitalist development—especially railroads—had 
transformed the border region. In Texas, it had brought a flood of white farmers to the 
region north of the Rio Grande, where they had displaced the surviving Mexicano 
ranchero elite from both its economic and its political dominance of the borderland. 
Anglo political reformers for the first time imposed legal segregation on neighbors of 
Mexican ancestry. 
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      South of the Rio Grande, the major railroads, built rapidly after 1880, were 
extensions of U.S. lines. Between 1900 and 1911, almost 40 percent of all foreign 
investment from the United States went into Mexico—into its railroads, mines, and 
oil. Throughout Mexico, foreigners owned virtually all industry, except the brewery 
and steel mill in Monterrey, while Spaniards, Turks, and Chinese dominated 
wholesale and retail commerce. The ruthless military forces of Porfirio Díaz 
safeguarded all these enterprises. Consequently, as the Revolution made evident, even 
the Mexican bourgeoisie had few qualms about expropriating capitalists whom they 
hoped to replace.74 
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      Moreover, there was virtually a free-trade zone linking the United States with the 
northern states of Mexico—Sonora, Chihuahua, Coahuila, and Durango. 
Revolutionary leaders Madero, Obregon, Villa, Orozco, and Carranza stemmed from 
that region. The workers of those northern states tended to be very mobile, many 
alternating between farm labor and mines and between one side of the border and the 
other. As Emilio Zamora has argued, before 1915, the largest number of Mexicans 
entering the United States went to Texas, and somewhere between 50 percent and 75 
percent of the new arrivals returned to Mexico each year. This regional society and its 
revolution were very different from the cohesive villages found in Morelos to the 
south, which produced Zapata and the agrarian revolt, and also from San Luis Potosí, 
which had nurtured the earliest intellectual opposition to the Díaz regime.75 
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      Working-class activists also crossed the border constantly, salting Mexico with 
people familiar with the American Federation of Labor, Industrial Workers of the 
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World, and Socialist Party of America. Locomotive engineers, dispatchers, and 
conductors were overwhelmingly Yankees. Job examinations were given in English! 
Many of them belonged to U.S. railroad brotherhoods until President Francisco 
Madero broke their grip in 1912 by requiring workers running Mexican trains to 
speak Spanish.76 
      Many Mexican political groups had officers or even headquarters in Texas, 
Missouri, and California. Foremost among those groups was the Partido Liberal 
Mexicáno (PLM) led by Ricardo Flores Magón. Although this party and its 
newspaper Regeneración ardently advocated land reform and civil liberties, it also 
discretely encouraged anarcho-syndicalism.77 Members of the PLM played prominent 
roles organizing strikes by copper miners in Cananea, Sonora, and Clifton-Morenci, 
Arizona, and in the 1905 to 1907 effort to reshape an AFL federal labor union in 
Laredo, Texas, into a citywide organization of all Mexican workers. PLM members 
later helped initiate the futile IWW invasion of Baja California and provided at least 
inspiration for the Sediciocos who raided three Texas border towns during the 
summer of 1915 in support of the Plan de San Diego. That proclamation called for 
"Social Revolution" and the transfer of arable land to "the proletarians." In response 
to those attacks, the Texas Rangers and white vigilante groups unleashed a reign of 
terror against local Mexicans, which in turn inspired many to flee for safety into war-
torn Mexico itself.78 
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      As historian James Cockcroft has persuasively argued, major strikes of miners, 
textile workers, and railroad workers in 1906 marked the beginning of open revolt 
against the Díaz regime. The PLM had been founded in San Luis Potosí in 1901 and 
as its name suggests originally favored political liberties, competitive capitalism, and 
removal of the Church from public life. Repression radicalized the party, and by the 
time Magón and his comrades had been released from prison and had established 
headquarters in Laredo, they had committed the movement to armed insurrection, 
libertarian socialism, and return of the land to the despoiled peasants. The famous 
strike at the complex of copper, gold, and silver mines in Cananea, owned by the 
well-connected American William C. Greene, was organized out of Douglas, 
Arizona, by PLM activists and was subsequently crushed by the Arizona Rangers, 
who crossed the border under the command of a former officer of Roosevelt's Rough 
Riders. The strikers enjoyed strong support from the Western Federation of Miners 
and the newly formed IWW, though they actually organized on a community basis, 
not as an industrial union (similar to Canada's One Big Union rather than the IWW).79 
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      Magón and his compatriots were harassed constantly by the William Howard Taft 
administration as well as by Mexican authorities, and they were forced to move 
headquarters several times. Ricardo Flores Magón was imprisoned nine times in 
Mexico and the United States, and he died in Fort Leavenworth in 1923, despite 
efforts of the new Mexican government to secure his release. But his legal battles 
enjoyed the support of Missouri's progressive governor, Joseph W. Folk, as well as 
Samuel Gompers, prominent Socialist Party members such as Mother Jones and 
Eugene V. Debs, and Magón's attorney, Job Harriman of Los Angeles. By 1910, 
Socialist magazines and newspapers published a steady diet of articles linking the 
oppression of Mexican workers and peasants to American business interests. John K. 
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Turner's exposéBarbarous Mexico (1910), first published in serial form, had become 
basic reading for the American left.80 Earlier, in 1908, when President Theodore 
Roosevelt sought to clamp down on Mexican revolutionaries by proposing legislation 
to allow censorship of mail and to expand the secret service, Congress voted his 
proposals down.81 
      Francisco I. Madero's military uprising against Díaz in 1911 drew much support 
away from the Magónistas. Although much of the business and agricultural elite had 
benefited from Díaz's solicitation of capital from the United States, a deep and 
prolonged Mexican economic crisis, triggered in 1907 by a financial crisis in the 
United States, had undermined the middle class and roused even wealthy men like 
Madero to battle for political liberties and constitutional government. When Magón 
denounced Madero's lack of a social program, reminding his readers that 
"governments are protectors of the rich," and encouraged an armed incursion into 
Baja California by his followers and hundreds of Wobblies (among them, briefly, Joe 
Hill), Gompers and other AFL leaders proclaimed their support for Madero—most 
assertively after the new Mexican president had legalized free speech, strikes, and 
trade unions (measures the Taft administration greeted with hostility). Eugene Debs, 
Mother Jones, and the socialist New York Call joined in that support, all of them 
arguing that Mexico had to pass through bourgeois democracy before it could be 
ready for socialism.82 
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      After the armies of Venustiano Carranza won control of much of the country in 
1914, with no clear ideology other than nationalism, their commanders turned local 
buildings over to workers' unions in the towns they occupied. Foreign-owned 
companies employed most of the unions' members. The Casa del Obrero Mundial 
(House of the World Worker) soon attracted the active support of many PLM 
veterans and declared its major weapon to be the "direct action of worker against 
capitalist." The Casa was founded in 1912, and it briefly became the pilot of 
widespread strikes, only to be fiercely repressed by the regime of General Victoriano 
Huerta (1913–14). Nevertheless, the failure of PLM-led military efforts, including 
those in Baja California, coupled with the brutal suppression inflicted on workers by 
the Huerta government, left the Casa susceptible to enticements to organize some 
7,000 workers in 1915 into six Red Battalions fighting under Carranza's command. 
The general's adamant opposition to the occupation of Vera Cruz by U.S. military and 
naval forces had already won many workers to his banner.83 
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      The price the Red Battalions had to pay for Carranza's material assistance was to 
join Carranza's assault on Emiliano Zapata, in the name of the "struggle against 
reaction." This was a fateful development: The workers' movement and the agrarian 
revolution had become enemies. Dissident members of the Casa fled to Morelos, 
among them their most eminent public intellectual, Antonio Díaz Soto y Gama, who 
became Zapata's chief theoretician and a bitter enemy of the urban working class.84 
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      When desperate conditions of life provoked a new wave of strikes in 1916, 
Carranza dissolved the Red Battalions, turned on the Casa, commandeered many of 
the new union headquarters, and ordered military courts to imprison arrested strike 
leaders—something many of his army commanders refused to do. He also unleashed 
what he intended to be an annihilation campaign against Zapata.85 
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      At almost the same time, the constitutional assembly meeting at Aguascalientes 
finished work on its labor code, article 123. It was the most comprehensive 
governmental declaration of workers' rights the world had ever seen. In addition to 
guaranteeing the eight-hour day and rights to organize and strike, it specified equal 
pay for both sexes and rest periods for working mothers, guarantees of housing, old 
age and sickness care, government supervision of contracts to work in foreign 
countries, prohibition of peonage, and more. All this from a convention where there 
were only two trade unionists.86 
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      As the new constitution revealed, this was revolution from above. The new 
Confederación Regional Obrera Mexicana (CROM), which arose out of the rubble of 
the 1916 repression and the hopes inspired by the new constitution, was closely allied 
to the Carranza government. Many of its officers had worked in the United States and 
had been members there of trade unions or the IWW or both. In 1918, the anarcho-
syndicalists of Mexico City (Federación de Sindicatos Obreros del Distrito Féderal) 
also affiliated with the CROM, bringing with them many admirers of the IWW. 
Although the CROM continued to employ the discourse of syndicalism, modified to 
advocate "multiple action" rather than direct action, its success, if not its survival, 
depended on its support from the government.87 
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      Luis Morones and other officers of Mexican labor organizations persuaded the 
AFL Executive Council to petition President Wilson to recognize Carranza's regime 
and later to join the CROM in joint efforts to prevent war between their two countries 
after General John J. Pershing had led U.S. troops into northern Mexico in futile 
pursuit of Francisco Villa. Gompers wrote to AFL officers in California of the need to 
establish "closer fraternal relations between the labor movements of our two countries 
that are necessary to protect the wage-earners in our future commercial and industrial 
developments."88 
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      Gompers' letter referred specifically to the 1915 Pan-American Financial 
Conference, which had been promoted by President Wilson. Gompers had urged the 
administration in vain to include trade unionists as representatives of "human 
welfare" in the commissions authorized by that conference to promote economic 
integration in the Americas. He had argued specifically that union labels constituted 
one of the instruments of modern commerce. At that year's AFL convention in San 
Francisco, Santiago Iglesias presented a report calling for solidarity among the trade 
unions of the Americas in response to the reorganization of business that had been 
made possible by the opening of the Panama Canal and encouraged by the recent 
financial conference. The AFL convention, which had been marked by bitter 
divisions over war preparedness, accepted his report unanimously.89 
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      Socialists, who later supported Wilson's war against Germany, heavily influenced 
Gompers' policies and his links to Mexican unions. Among them were John Murray, 
former correspondent in Mexico for the New York Call, James Lord of the AFL's 
Mining Department, Santiago Iglesias, and the Romanian-born Roberto Haberman, 
who managed to hold membership simultaneously in the International Association of 
Machinists, the Drug Clerks Union of Mexico City, and the cooperative movement of 
Yucatan.90 
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      Moreover, just as the CROM was tied to Carranza's government, so the AFL 75  



increasingly linked itself to that of Wilson in both domestic and foreign affairs. 
Wilson had enjoyed some labor support during his first presidential campaign, but by 
the election of 1916, he enjoyed a margin of support among working-class votes 
without precedent in the history of presidential elections. Secretary of Labor William 
B. Wilson had come from the AFL's largest union, the United Mine Workers of 
America. Under his guidance, the new U.S. Conciliation Service mediated 1,780 
labor disputes between 1915 and 1919 and encouraged employers to negotiate with 
unions chartered by the AFL and to shun the IWW and other groups which he and the 
Federation deemed "outlaw." As preparedness for war took center stage in 1916, he 
sponsored a series of joint meetings between cabinet members and the AFL's 
executive council, and then successfully proposed Gompers' appointment to the 
Council of National Defense. Major strikes for the eight-hour day in the spring of 
1916 and the threat of a nationwide railroad strike on the eve of a presidential election 
had yielded a statutory eight-hour day on the railroads (the Adamson Act). After 
Congress declared war on Germany, the Wilson administration appointed many union 
officials to agencies created to mobilize the economy and muster public support for a 
war that initially faced widespread public opposition.91 
      Nevertheless, wartime industrial conditions triggered huge strikes during 1917, 
especially in mining and lumbering, as if to mock the no-strike pledge Gompers had 
pronounced on his own initiative. Worse yet, the IWW not only provided leadership 
to many of those strikes, but in the Arizona mining region especially, also organized 
stable locals of thousands of workers. Among the members in Bisbee, Jerome, 
Morenci, and elsewhere were many Mexicans. Nevertheless, as IWW activist and 
future Communist leader Ludwig Lore wrote: "It is not the 'outlaw' worker any 
longer, the migratory nomad, but the stationary worker with a permanent home and 
family who constitutes a goodly part of the I.W.W. membership." When Bisbee 
vigilantes rounded up more than 1,200 strikers and deported them to the desert in 
July, an army census of the victims found almost half of them to be U.S. citizens, 
even though most of them were foreign born.92 
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      Brutal treatment of strikers by enraged and armed local residents was by no 
means restricted to Arizona. It was precisely the resurgent strength of the IWW in 
1917, colliding with appeals by local businessmen and editors to patriotic fury, that 
unleashed violent assaults and murders inflicted on Wobblies across the West. State 
and federal governments followed suit with indictments and deportations, culminating 
in the mass trial of 133 actual and alleged IWW leaders. Meanwhile, many well-
known AFL unions, as well as unaffiliated newcomers like the Amalgamated 
Clothing Workers, increased their memberships dramatically. Wartime full 
employment overcame workers' fear of dismissal, and participation in strikes soared 
to all-time record highs—war or no war—while new government agencies often 
resolved major disputes in favor of the workers, who could now couch their demands 
in the vocabulary of wartime.93 The AFL's collaboration with the federal government 
may have violated its proclaimed self-reliance and "voluntarism," but its reward was 
vigorous growth in membership and in influence. 
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      These pressures and opportunities provided the context for the AFL's 
controversial alignment with President Wilson's foreign policy, including his moves 
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towards intervention in World War I. Although Gompers had joined Mexican union 
leaders and many socialists and progressives at home in urging the President to curb 
his military ventures of 1914 and 1916 inside revolutionary Mexico, he had shared 
Wilson's hopes that Madero and later Carranza would bring constitutional 
government to their country. Moreover, by April 1917, Wilson had stationed marines 
in Haiti, Santo Domingo, and Nicaragua, and annexed the Virgin Islands—all with no 
protest from the AFL. It was, however, the approaching war with Germany that drew 
AFL leaders into active participation in war mobilization. By the time of the turbulent 
AFL convention of 1915 in San Francisco, Executive Council members in control of 
the platform gaveled down vociferous opponents of military preparedness and their 
hooting supporters in the balcony, while Gompers took the floor to declare:  
I am a pacifist ... and I had hoped that we would get away from the war idea. But when I saw the way 
the trade unionists of each European nation rallied to their colors in this war, I had to agree the old 
Biblical sentiment, "Love thy neighbor as thyself ["], had been shot to pieces. We want to see the 
people of the United States thoroughly trained so that they may control their military and naval forces 
in the interests of peace, democracy and humanity.94 

      Gompers lent unstinting support to Wilson's war effort and then to the League of 
Nations.95 As the invectives that convention delegates hurled at each other in San 
Francisco made evident, however, many workers sharply opposed his policies. Just as 
the war had increased union membership by 1920 to levels not to be reached again 
until 1940, so it had stimulated the aspirations, discontent, and sense of power among 
those members. Gompers remarked to his colleague and confidant James Duncan of 
the Granite Cutters: "Our movement is passing through a critical stage.... The 
struggles, the sacrifices, the enthusiasm, the highly nervous strain induced by the 
World War, have brought about a state of almost mental hysteria."96 
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      The rebellious mood Lore had praised and Gompers feared manifested itself in 
political as well as economic life. Versailles and the other treaties ending the war had 
left the British, French, and Japanese empires not only intact but enlarged, with Italy 
the only empty-handed ally, and had left Eastern Europe ablaze with nationalist 
conflicts and social revolution. One immigrant group after another protested what 
seemed to its members a mockery of the Fourteen Points. Labor's dissidents 
demanded direct intervention by working people in foreign affairs—"democratic 
diplomacy." A workers' convention, which drafted demands for a pending strike at 
five General Electric plants shortly after the armistice, included in its demands the 
release of all imprisoned antiwar dissidents and radicals in the United States and the 
inclusion of labor representatives as half their country's delegates to the Versailles 
peace conference. Critics of President Wilson and of Gompers found their most 
articulate voice in the Chicago Federation of Labor and its newspaper, the New 
Majority. Just as that journal advocated industrial democracy at home, so it demanded 
direct participation in foreign policy by working people. A famous New Majority 
cartoon of 1919 depicted working men and women approaching the door of the peace 
conference and captioned: "You could not make War without us—you cannot make 
Peace without us."97 
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      As was the case with Winnipeg's Western Labour News and the Seattle Union 
Record, the New Majority depicted "nationalist rebellions" as "part of the class 
struggle, not a distraction from it." The Chicagoans resolved that they would not "be 
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satisfied with a League of Imperialist governments dominated by an international 
League of money bosses."98 They applauded the self-determination accorded to Poles, 
Yugoslavs, and other peoples in Europe, but they insisted that Ireland, India, Egypt, 
and Mexico be accorded the same right. They found a champion in Frank Walsh of 
Missouri, who not only quit the National War Labor Board, but also threw his efforts 
into a League of Oppressed Peoples. As Alan Dawley has argued, "The immediate 
postwar period deserves to be remembered as the most significant moment of anti-
imperialism since the beginning of the century."99 
      In the elections of 1918 and 1920, it was the Republicans who capitalized most 
effectively on popular discontent with Wilson's government. Business leaders and 
Republicans rallied voters against immigrants, radicals, and trade unions, while 
labor's wartime influence in the government faded quickly into memory. AFL 
delegates walked out of the 1919 President's Industrial Conference after they could 
not even get adopted a resolution favoring labor's right to organize. The embattled 
Wilson administration did not invite them back to the second industrial conference.100 
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      Revolutionary upheavals around the world had also induced the diplomats 
assembled in Paris to enshrine the eight-hour day and other labor standards in the 
peace treaties and to create the International Labor Organization to oversee their 
enforcement. Those same upheavals, however, had by 1923 produced not one 
international union congress, but four. The social-democratic International Federation 
of Trade Unions dating from 1900 had survived, but it was now confronted by a 
Communist-led Red International of Labor Unions, an anarcho-syndicalist 
International Workingmen's Association, and an International Federation of Working 
Women.101 

83  

    
Labor Solidarity in the Americas? 
   

      It was in this turbulent context that the AFL and the CROM took the initiative to 
create a Pan-American Federation of Labor. Pursuant to the decision of its 1915 
convention, Gompers and other AFL officials met in Washington with Luis Morones 
and others of the CROM and a separate group from Yucatan. After that meeting, two 
of the delegates from Yucatan set out to enlist support from other countries in Latin 
America, but the only favorable response came from one union in Cuba. That was 
hardly surprising. The labor organizations formed in Argentina, Brazil, Uruguay, and 
Chile starting in 1905 were more akin to the IWW than to the AFL or the CROM. In 
fact, the maritime workers and artisans who created the first nationwide labor 
organization in Chile (1919) actually named themselves a branch of the Industrial 
Workers of the World. For international solidarity, the Chileans sent their delegates to 
the 1922 congress of the anarcho-syndicalist International Workingmen's Association 
in Berlin, Germany, as did unions in Argentina, Brazil, and Uruguay. One union in 
Yucatan even replied to the AFL's invitation by stating that a mutual assistance 
organization should be worldwide, not Pan-American.102 
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      Consequently, only two national movements took part in the founding convention 
held in the important Texas border railroad junction of Laredo just days after the 
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armistice had taken effect in Europe, both of them operating in close collaboration 
with their respective governments. In fact, the official call for the meeting had been 
issued only after the United States had formally recognized Carranza's government, 
while President Wilson and his Committee on Public Information had secretly 
provided the funding.103 Even so, there was plenty of tension in the air. The Tampico 
section of the IWW had withdrawn from the CROM in protest against meeting with 
the AFL, and president Frank Duffy of the powerful Carpenters Union had ardently 
objected on behalf of the AFL's Catholic members to Gompers' dealings with 
Mexico's anticlerical revolutionaries.104 
      The opening statement from Morones called on the AFL to open all of its unions 
to membership for workers of Mexican origin and to come to the aid of the many 
IWW and other political prisoners in the United States. But AFL unions were then 
collaborating closely with President Wilson's government to exclude the IWW from 
the copper mines and the maritime world and also with the Canadian government to 
fight the One Big Union in Nova Scotia and in the western provinces.105 
Consequently, Gompers responded with a ringing denunciation of the IWW as an 
opponent of the Allied war effort and an enemy of trade unionism. He also defended 
the authority of every constituent AFL union to make its own membership rules, and 
he proposed that both federations collaborate to limit immigration into the United 
States.106 
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      The sticking point was Texas. The Texas Federation of Labor was dominated by 
trade unionists who shared the virulent racism that flourished in their state during the 
war years and the early 1920s. Fort Worth was a storm center of hostility. There, 
Anglo and black workers had marched together on city hall to demand that civic 
leaders "rid the city of cheap Mexican labor."107 The heartland of Mexican 
participation in the AFL was Laredo itself, where unions of Mexican track workers 
thrived. Clemente Idar, son of a pioneering organizer on the Mexican National 
Railway, was a prominent advocate of both racial integration and trade unionism 
along strict craft lines. Idar did succeed over the years in integrating some Mexican 
workers into the Texas Federation, and he succeeded most notably in working 
together with the Mexican government to keep Mexican workers on both sides of the 
border from crossing picket lines during the historic nationwide 1922 strike of the 
railroad shopcraft unions.108 
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      Gompers in turn lobbied Washington to resume full diplomatic relations with 
Mexico and to cede to that country the control that its new constitution asserted over 
its own natural resources. Gompers and his successor as AFL president, William 
Green, consistently opposed the efforts of American oil and mining interests to 
persuade the administrations of Warren Harding and Calvin Coolidge to intervene 
militarily in Mexico on their behalf. In return, Gompers persuaded the CROM not to 
affiliate with the Amsterdam-based International Federation of Trade Unions. At a 
joint conference of the AFL and CROM in El Paso in the fall of 1923, the Mexican 
and American federations jointly proclaimed the "Monroe Doctrine of Labor." It 
declared their shared hostility to any efforts by either "the Red Internationale of 
autocratic Moscow [or] any other internationale" to violate the "sovereignty" of labor 
in the Western Hemisphere.109 
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      In less than a quarter of a century, the AFL had been transformed from a 
vehement foe of imperial expansion into an active promoter of alliances with those 
unions in Mexico, Canada, and Puerto Rico that were not committed to social 
revolution. The change began with efforts by the AFL to extend its reach beyond the 
boundaries of the United States, wherever American business went. A second phase 
emerged during the First World War. For a few years, the Federation also participated 
in formulating government policy and enjoyed the shelter that federal agencies 
provided for trade union growth. At the same time, Mexico had changed from a 
country where unions had been forbidden into one with a labor congress (the CROM) 
that supported the government and was in turn nurtured and restrained by that 
government—though in some places, union activity independent of the CROM 
actually increased during the 1920s. The AFL in turn lent its support to the rise to 
power of Plutarco Elías Calles, solicited the aid of the International Federation of 
Trade Unions as well as the U.S. Navy in blocking shipments of arms to Calles's 
enemies in 1923, and arranged the following year's convention of the Pan-American 
Federation to meet in Mexico City at the time of his inauguration. Gompers died in El 
Paso upon his return from that gathering.110 
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      To sum up, at the end of the 1890s, the labor movement of the United States 
expressed profound anxiety that the division of the world into colonial spheres 
dominated by the Great Powers threatened world peace as well as the ability of trade 
unions to improve the lot of working people within the domestic economy. During the 
next twenty years, however, spectacular growth in the domestic economy and in 
union membership helped persuade leaders of the AFL quietly to abandon their 
opposition to the annexation of colonies, while major constituent unions incorporated 
many workers in Canada and Puerto Rico into their ranks and successfully opposed 
nationalist currents within the movements of both countries. Moreover, the Wilson 
administration provided at least some assistance to AFL efforts to construct its own 
countervailing power to that of business. From 1915 to 1919, militant struggles by 
workers both benefited from the converging efforts of government and union 
bureaucrats and often overran the boundaries prescribed by that collaboration. When 
the country went to war, top union leaders openly jettisoned their historic quest for 
peace through the common efforts of workers in many lands, and they provided 
wholehearted support not only to the government's mobilization for war, but also to 
proselytizing around the globe for its war aims. 
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      Revolutionary Mexico presented a challenge of decisive importance. Starting with 
the copper, textile, and railroad strikes of 1906, Mexican workers' struggles 
(including those north of the border) displayed closer kinship to the teachings of the 
Industrial Workers of the World than to those of Samuel Gompers. Moreover, 
commanders of revolutionary armies (with the major exception of the intensely 
provincial Zapatista agrarian movement) appealed to nationalism, rather than social 
reform. Between 1915 and 1917, however, forces under Carranza's command offered 
workers' organizations sporadic assistance and the glowing promises incorporated in 
the new constitution. 
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      AFL initiatives toward alliance with the new Mexican labor movement were 
guided by the Federation's adherence to President Wilson's foreign policy goals, 
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which also helped secure funding for AFL activities in Latin America. Together, two 
labor federations, each tied to its respective government, created the Pan-American 
Federation of Labor, which was to play but an occasional role in strike and organizing 
activity but which concentrated its efforts on defusing conflicts between the two 
countries (especially over U.S. companies' claims to oil and mineral rights), securing 
the ascendancy of a regime in Mexico friendly to its dominant labor organization, and 
excluding communist, socialist, and syndicalist internationals from the Western 
Hemisphere. In short, the AFL had changed from a foe of imperial power to a 
participant in its exercise. 
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